
2023-176 Veterinary and Animal Care Supplies
Total Price $0.00 Total Price $1,224.00 Total Price $8,985.28 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $32,740.10 Total Price $73,891.53

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section I - Medications: Pyrantel Pamoate 50 mg/ml Suspension, 32 Ounce Aurora Pharmaceutical Oral-Pro 21013 30 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 ALT1 Pyrantel Pamoate Oral Suspension, 50mg/mL 946.4mL Bottle Generic 09073 30 bottle $38.65 $1,159.50
2 Section I - Medications: Fenbendazole 100 mg/ml Suspension, 1,000 ml Merk Animal Health Panacur 069267 10 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.30 $1,573.00
3 Section I - Medications: Praziquantel 56.8 mg/ml Injectable Solution, 10 ml Bimeda 1PRA005 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.64 $438.56
4 Section I - Medications: Praziquantel 23 mg, 50 Tablets Bayer / Droncit 08713165-182999 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 ALT1 DRONCIT TABLETS FOR FELINES, 23MG Bayer 00724089111128 4 bottle $213.96 $855.84
5 Section I - Medications: Praziquantel 34 mg, 50 Tablets Bayer / Droncit 08713157-182899 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 ALT1 DRONCIT TABLETS FOR CANINES, 34MG Bayer 00724089111111 4 bottle $230.39 $921.56
6 Section I - Medications: Ivermectin 1% Injectable, 50 ml 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
Section I - Medications: Canine Chewable Tablet Dewormer, 50 Tablets Virbac Virbantel for Dogs 6-25 lbs 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 ALT1 Enrofloxacin Flavored Chewable Tablets, 22.7mg 100 Count Bottle Covetrus 011 2 bottle $56.18 $56.18

8
Section I - Medications: Canine Chewable Tablet Dewormer, 50 Tablets Virbac

Virbantel for Dogs 25.1-200 
lbs 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 ALT1 Enrofloxacin Flavored Chewable Tablets, 136mg 50 Count Bottle Covetrus 015 2 bottle $127.74 $255.48
9 Section I - Medications: Pentobarbital Sodium 390 mg/ml Solution, 250 ml Vortech Pharmaceutical Fatal-Plus 20 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Section I - Medications: Canine/Feline Xylazine 100 mg/ml Injection, 50 ml Bimeda 1XYL003 30 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.36 $1,120.80

11
Section I - Medications: Ketamine 100 mg/ml Injection, 10 ml

Dechra Veterinary 
Products 17033-101-10 60 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.94 $656.40

12 Section I - Medications: Acepromazine 10 mg/ml Injection, 50 ml Boehringer Ingelheim 136059 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 ALT1 ACEPROMAZINE INJECTABLE SOLUTION, 10MG/ML Covetrus 136145 4 bottle $30.07 $120.28

13 Section I - Medications: Acepromazine 10 mg Tablet, 500 Tablets Boehringer Ingelheim 136061 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.29 $280.58
14 Section I - Medications: Acepromazine 25 mg Tablet, 500 Tablets Boehringer Ingelheim 136063 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 ALT1 ACEPROMAZINE TABLETS, 25MG Covetrus 138665 2 bottle $266.35 $532.70
15 Section I - Medications: Uniprim Powder, 400 gm Neogen Vet UP400 10 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.88 $458.80
16 Section I - Medications: Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Solution, 1000 ml Bag 10 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 Section I - Medications: Lactated Ringers, 1000 ml Bag 10 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.97 $659.70
18 Section I - Medications: Cephalexin 250 mg Capsule, 500 Capsules 20 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.90 $838.00
19 Section I - Medications: Albon 5% Oral Suspension, 16 Ounce Zoetis 10000296 14 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.72 $1,466.08
20 Section I - Medications: Phenylbutazone (Bute) Paste, 60 ml 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 ALT1 Equi-Phar ButePaste, 20g, Apple Flavored 60mL Syringe Vedco VINV-BUTE-0001 10 each $51.19 $511.90
21 Section I - Medications: Clavamox 62.5 mg Tablet, 112 Tablets Zoetis 10024023 1 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.04 $68.04
22 Section I - Medications: Clavamox 250 mg Tablet, 112 Tablets Zoetis 10024027 1 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.91 $195.91
23 Section I - Medications: Clavamox 12.5 mg/ml Suspension, 15 ml Zoetis 10000485 168 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.45 $3,603.60

24
Section I - Medications: Sulfamethoxazole-Trimethoprim 480 MG Tablets, 500 
Tablets 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.49 $137.96

25
Section I - Medications: Sulfamethoxazole-Trimethoprim DS 960 MG Tablets, 500 
Tablets 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.63 $30.52

26 Section I - Medications: Livestock Penicillin Injectable, 100 ml 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.33 $26.66
27 Section I - Medications: Enrofloxacin Injectable Solution, 250 ml Norbrook Laboratories 606841067002 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 Section I - Medications: Nalbuphine Hydrochloride 20 mg/ml Injection, 1 ml 30 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.93 $2,127.90
29 Section I - Medications: Triple Antibiotic Ointment, 50 Gram 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.40 $34.00
30 Section I - Medications: Gentamicin Sulfate 100 mg/ml Solution, 100 ml 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.51 $158.04
31 Section I - Medications: Isoflurane, 250 ml Piramal 0010250P 16 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 ALT1 Isoflurane Solution 250mL Bottle Covetrus 11695067772 16 bottle $45.35 $725.60
32 Section I - Medications: Ketofen 100 mg/ml Injectable Solution, 100 ml Zoetis 10004029 1 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $202.90 $202.90
33 Section I - Medications: Yohimbine HCl 2 mg/ml Injectable Solution, 30 ml 10 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 Section I - Medications: Ear Cleanser, 8 Ounce Vetoquinol 411441 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.71 $42.84
35 Section I - Medications: Dexamethasone 2 mg/ml Injection, 100 ml Bimeda 1DEX022 30 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.40 $372.00
36 Section I - Medications: Cefovecin Sodium 80 mg/ml, 10 ml Zoetis 10001498 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $431.37 $862.74

37
Section I - Medications: Vitamin B-12 (Cyanocobalamin) 1,000 mcg/ml Injectable 
Solution, 100 ml 6 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.16 $48.96

38 Section I - Medications: Neo Poly Dex Ophthalmic Suspension, 5 ml 4 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $51.96

39
Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Ampicillin 25g Injectable Suspension, 25 
Gram Boehringer Ingelheim Polyflex 159883 2 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 ALT1 Ampicillin Trihydrate Suspension for Injection 25gm Vial USVET INC 86108-946-01 2 bottle $42.42 $84.84

40
Section I - Medications: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section I 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid

41
Section II - Vaccines: Feline Rhinotracheitis, Calicivirus, Panleukopenia, 
Chlamydophila Felis Vaccine, 25 Doses Merck Nobivac Feline1-HCPCh 60 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.75 $6,945.00 No Bid No Bid
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42
Section II - Vaccines: Canine Intranasal Parainfluenza, Bordetella Bronchiseptica, 
and Adenovirus Type 2 Vaccine, 25 Doses Merck Nobivac Canine1-DAPPv 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.50 $12,950.00 No Bid No Bid

43
Section II - Vaccines: Canine Intranasal Parainfluenza, Bordetella Bronchiseptica, 
and Adenovirus Type 2 Vaccine, 25 Doses Merck Nobivac Intra-Trac 3 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.25 $12,625.00 No Bid No Bid

44 Section II - Vaccines: Canine/Feline Rabies Vaccine, 50 Doses Boehringer Ingelheim Rabvac 1 YL101790A 40 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45
Section II - Vaccines: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items required 
by Collin County not specifically named in Section II 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.0% No Bid

46
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 4 Doses Elanco Advantix II for Dogs 4-10 lbs 12 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 ALT1 K9 ADVANTIX II DOG 4-10 LB SM BAYER 72408958455 12 pack $76.30 $915.60

47
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 4 Doses Elanco

Advantix II for Dogs 11-20 
lbs 12 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 ALT1 K9 ADVANTIX II DOG 11-20LB MED BAYER 72408958498 12 pack $76.30 $915.60

48
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 4 Doses Elanco

Advantix II for Dogs 21-55 
lbs 12 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 ALT1 K9 ADVANTIX II DOG 21-55 LB LG BAYER 72408961626 12 pack $76.30 $915.60

49
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 4 Doses Elanco Advantix II for Dogs 55+ lbs 12 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 ALT1 K9 ADVANTIX II DOG 55+ LB XL BAYER 72408961642 12 pack $76.30 $915.60

50
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew for Puppies, 
1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 1-Month Chew for 
Puppies 4.4-9.9 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.14 $382.80

51
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew for Puppies, 
1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 1-Month Chew for 
Puppies 9.9-22 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.57 $391.40

52
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew for Puppies, 
1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 1-Month Chew for 
Puppies 22-44 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.93 $398.60

53
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew for Puppies, 
1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 1-Month Chew for 
Puppies 44-88 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.14 $402.80

54
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew, 1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Chew for 
Dogs 4.4-9.9 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $1,200.00

55
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew, 1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Chew for 
Dogs 9.9-22 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.14 $1,222.80

56
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew, 1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Chew for 
Dogs 22-44 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.71 $1,254.20

57
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew, 1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Chew for 
Dogs 44-88 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.57 $1,271.40

58
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Chew, 1 Chew Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Chew for 
Dogs 88-123 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.14 $1,282.80

59
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Dogs 4.4-9.9 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.29 $1,085.80

60
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Dogs 9.9-22 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.29 $1,105.80

61
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Dogs 22-44 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.43 $1,128.60

62
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Dogs 44-88 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 $1,140.00

63
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Dogs 88-123 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.57 $1,151.40

64
Section III - Parasite Protection: Feline Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Cats 2.6-6.2 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.57 $1,111.40

65
Section III - Parasite Protection: Feline Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Cats 6.2-13.8 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.72 $1,134.40

66
Section III - Parasite Protection: Feline Flea and Tick Protection Topical, 1 Dose Merck

Bravecto 12 Week Topical 
for Cats 13.8-27.5 lbs 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.86 $1,157.20

67
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Nitenpyram Oral Flea Treatment, 6 Tablets PetIQ Capstar for Dogs 2-25 lbs 20 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $309.09 $6,181.80

68
Section III - Parasite Protection: Canine Nitenpyram Oral Flea Treatment, 6 Tablets PetIQ

Capstar for Dogs Over 25 
lbs 20 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $333.26 $6,665.20

69
Section III - Parasite Protection: Feline Nitenpyram Oral Flea Treatment, 6 Tablets PetIQ Capstar for Cats 2-25 lbs 20 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $309.09 $6,181.80

70
Section III - Parasite Protection: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar 
items required by Collin County not specifically named in Section III 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid

71 Section IV - Testing Supplies: Canine Heartworm Rapid Test Kit, 25 per Pack Zoetis Witness 10014361 40 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.68 $4,787.20
72 Section IV - Testing Supplies: SNAP Canine Parvo Test Kit, 5 Tests per Pack IDEXX 99-09214 20 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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73 Section IV - Testing Supplies: SNAP FIV/FeLV Combo Test Kit, 30 Tests per Pack IDEXX 99-08354 20 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
73 ALT1 VetScan FeLV/FIV Antibodies Rapid Test 25 Count Box Zoetis 10023176 20 pack $513.041 $12,312.98

74
Section IV - Testing Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section IV 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid

75 Section V - Surgical Supplies: Veterinary Tattoo Ink Paste in Tube, Green, 5 Ounce Ketchum 329AA 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 Section V - Surgical Supplies: Tissue Glue, 3 ml 3M Vetbond 20 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

76 ALT1 Vetbond Tissue Adhesive 3ml Tube 3M 1469SB 3M 1469SB 20 bottle $24.99 $499.80

77
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Veterinary Bandaging Tape, 4 inch wide x 5 yards long 3M Vetrap 48 roll No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

78
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Absorbable Polyglyconate Suture with Needle, Size 2-
0, 30 inch length, 36 per pack Medtronic Maxon 8886664151 50 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $421.00 $21,050.00 $230.07 $11,503.50

79
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Absorbable Polyglyconate Suture with Needle, Size 3-
0, 30 inch length, 36 per pack Medtronic Maxon 8886664141 50 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $468.00 $23,400.00 $230.59 $11,529.50

80
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Absorbable PGCL Suture with Needle, Size 3-0, 36 
inch length, 12 per pack Phoenix Monoswift PS0943 50 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 ALT1
PGCL+ Absorbable Suture: Violet / 3-0 / NFS-1 Reverse Cutting 24mm / 36 in 12 
Count Box 0 0 50 pack $81.00 $4,050.00

81
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Absorbable PGCL Suture with Needle, Size 2-0, 36 
inch length, 12 per pack Phoenix Monoswift PS0942 50 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

82
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Sterile Neoprene Glove, Powder Free, Latex Free, 50 
Gloves per Box Cardinal Health Protexis 2D73DP65 18 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

82 ALT1 Sterile Neoprene Glove, Powder Free, Latex Free UPC NPF 18 box $9.951

83 Section V - Surgical Supplies: Chlorhexidine 2% Solution, 1 Gallon Phoenix 6 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 ALT1 Chlorhexidine 2% Solution 1 Gallon Bottle Covetrus CH020CV 6 bottle $12.35 $74.10

84
Section V - Surgical Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section V 1 each 21.0% No Bid No Bid 13.0% 25.0%

85 Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Syringe 3cc Luer-Lock Tip, 100 per Box Terumo / Sur-Vet SS-03L 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.87 $2,574.00 No Bid
85 ALT1 Disposable Syringe, Luer Lock, without Needle, 3mL 100 Count Box Terumo 2036 100 box $17.94 $3,588.00

86 Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Syringe 20cc Luer-Lock Tip, 50 per Box Terumo / Sur-Vet SS-20L2 20 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.43 $288.60 No Bid
86 ALT1 Disposable Syringe, Luer Lock, without Needle, 20mL 50 Count Box Terumo 300200 50 box $48.16 $963.20

87
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 1cc Luer-Slip Tip, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881501400 120 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.60 $2,232.00 $21.03 $2,523.60

88
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 3cc Luer-Slip Tip, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881513918 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.76 $2,752.00 $17.14 $3,428.00

89
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 3cc Luer-Lock Tip, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881513934 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.76 $2,752.00 $20.40 $4,080.00

90
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 6cc Luer-Slip Tip, 50 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881516911 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.47 $2,294.00 $28.41 $5,682.00

91
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 6cc Luer-Lock Tip, 50 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881516937 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.47 $2,294.00 $28.41 $5,682.00

92
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 12cc Luer-Lock Tip, 80 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881512878 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.10 $2,810.00 $38.98 $3,898.00

93
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 20cc Luer-Lock Tip, 50 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881520657 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.90 $3,290.00 $51.31 $5,131.00

94
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe 60cc Luer-Lock Tip, 20 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881560125 50 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.53 $1,226.50 $30.55 $1,527.50

95
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 18G x 1-1/2" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250016 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.48 $1,148.00 $20.40 $2,040.00

96
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 19G x 1-1/2" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250065 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.48 $1,148.00 $203.76 $20,376.00

97
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 20G x 1" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250123 200 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.35 $4,070.00

98
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 22G x 1" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250222 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.45 $2,290.00 $20.35 $4,070.00

99
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 23G x 1" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250255 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.75 $2,150.00 $12.76 $2,552.00

100
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Needle 25G x 5/8" Luer-Lock, 100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881250313 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.42 $2,284.00 $20.35 $4,070.00

101
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Syringe with Luer-Lock Needle 3cc 22G x 1", 100 per 
Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 8881513231 200 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.34 $4,268.00

102
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Syringe with Luer-Lock Needle 3cc 22G x 3/4", 100 
per Box Terumo / Sur-Vet 100276 200 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



2023-176 Veterinary and Animal Care Supplies
Pharmaceutical Buyers, 

Inc.
Unipak Corp. Boxes 4 U, Inc.

Infinity Supply & 
Service, Inc

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Mercedes Medical, LLC 
dba Mercedes Scientific

103
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Syringe with Luer-Slip Needle 1cc 25G x 5/8", 100 
per Box Terumo / Sur-Vet 100281 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

104
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Tuberculin Syringe with Fixed Needle 1cc 28G x 1/2", 
100 per Box Cardinal Health / Monoject 1180128012 100 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.75 $875.00 $103.99 $10,399.00

105
Section VI - Syringes/Needles: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section VI 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% 25.0% No Bid

106
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Snake Tongs

ACES-Animal Care 
Equipment and Services MW-G48 8 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

107
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Nylon Muzzles - Set of Assorted Sizes, 
Set of 10 Jorgensen J0169T 2 set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

108
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Feral Cat Den with Slide-up Front Door 
and Side Porthole Door

ACES-Animal Care 
Equipment and Services M-FCD 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

109
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Replacement Slide-up Front Door for 
Feral Cat Den

ACES-Animal Care 
Equipment and Services M-DFD 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

110
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Remote Delivery Device Dart, Type P, 
1cc capacity, 1.5 inch needle Pneu-Dart 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

111
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Remote Delivery Device Dart, Type P, 
4cc capacity, 1.5 inch needle Pneu-Dart 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Remote Delivery Device Dart, Type P, 
6cc capacity, 1.5 inch needle Pneu-Dart 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

113 Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Pole Syringe 3 ml Pneu-Dart 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

114
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Pole Syringe 6 ml

ACES-Animal Care 
Equipment and Services ZPS-06 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

115
Section VII - Handling and Capture Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any 
similar items required by Collin County not specifically named in Section VII 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid 0.0%

116 Section VIII - Digital Animal Identification: Pet Microchip, 25 per Box Merck HomeAgain 70 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
117 Section VIII - Digital Animal Identification: Pet Microchip Reader 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

118
Section VIII - Digital Animal Identification: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any 
similar items required by Collin County not specifically named in Section VIII 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid No Bid

119
Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Hay, 2-String Bale, Coastal Bermuda, 
Minimum 40 lb 521 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

120
Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Hay, 3-String Bale, Alfalfa, Minimum 100 lb 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

121
Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Cattle Breeder Cubes, 20% Protein, 50 
Pounds 76 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

122 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: White Salt Block 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
123 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Trace Mineral Salt Block 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
124 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Scratch Poultry Grain, 40 Pounds Big V 0425 4 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
125 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Poultry Layer Feed Crumbles, 50 Pounds Purina Layena Sunfresh 4 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Swine Feed, 50 Pound Big V 0145 10 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

127
Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Equine Senior Gastric Support Supplement 
with Outlast, 40 Pounds Purina 3004500-205 4 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

128 Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: 14% All Stock Pellets, 50 Pounds Big V 0245 20 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

129
Section IX - Livestock/Poultry Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any 
similar items required by Collin County not specifically named in Section IX 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid No Bid

130
Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Canine Dry Food, Balanced Nutrition for All Ages, 40 
Pounds 140 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

131
Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Canine Dry Food, Formulated for High Physical 
Demands, Puppies, Pregnant or Lactating Females, 40 Pounds VICTOR Hi-Pro Plus 20 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

132 Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Canine Dry Food, Formulated for Puppies, 40 Pounds Nutrena True Puppy 38718-40 10 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

133
Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Feline Dry Food, Balanced Nutrition for All Ages, 50 
Pounds 20 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

134 Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Clay Cat Litter, Unscented, 40 Pounds Purina / Tidy Cats 070230107404 500 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

135
Section X - Pet Food/Litter: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section X 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid 0.0%

136 Section XI - Pet Supplies: Nylon Flat Dog Lead with Ring, 12 per Pack Dee Veterinary Products 3261 200 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
137 Section XI - Pet Supplies: Nylon Braided Dog Lead with Ring, 12 per Pack Dee Veterinary Products 3251 100 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 Section XI - Pet Supplies: Cardboard Pet Carrier,40 per Pack C Specialties 1002 480 pack No Bid $2.55 $1,224.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

138 ALT1

One-Piece corrugated pet carrier (12 per bundle)  17 1/2 x 8 1/2 x 12 1/4 200# 
White with printed instructions. Do not leave animals unattended.  Easy one-piece 
assembly Price includes shipping. Sample is available.Go to boxes4u.com and type 
in Custom 0011-12 to see photo. Boxes 4 U Custom 0011-12 480 each $2.55 $1,224.00

139 Section XI - Pet Supplies: Pet Waste Bags 8000 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



2023-176 Veterinary and Animal Care Supplies
Pharmaceutical Buyers, 

Inc.
Unipak Corp. Boxes 4 U, Inc.

Infinity Supply & 
Service, Inc

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Mercedes Medical, LLC 
dba Mercedes Scientific

140 Section XI - Pet Supplies: Clipper Lubricating Oil, 4 Ounce Oster 20 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

141
Section XI - Pet Supplies: Cadaver Bag, Min 3.0 mil thickness, Crematable/Non-
Chlorinated, Approx 30" x 50", 25 Bags per Roll VetOne 612028 30 roll No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

142
Section XI - Pet Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section XI 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% No Bid 0.0%

143
Section XII - Disinfectants: Concentrated Disinfectant, Cleaner, & Deodorizer, 5 
Gallon Virox Rescue 23309 10 bucket No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

144
Section XII - Disinfectants: Broad Spectrum Disinfectant, Virucide, & Fungicide, 10 
Pound Antec International Virkon S 70 bucket No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

145 Section XII - Disinfectants: Surface Disinfectant Spray, 32 Ounce Safetec SaniZide Pro1 35910 40 bottle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.30 $332.00 No Bid

146 Section XII - Disinfectants: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically named in Section XII 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.0% 25.0% 0.0%

147
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Disposable Aluminum Pan, Approximately 
9x13 inch 17600 each No Bid No Bid $0.4553 $8,013.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid

148 Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Coated Paper Food Tray, Approximately 8 oz 40000 each No Bid No Bid $0.0243 $972.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

149
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Plastic Snap Hook with Swivel End Split 
Keychain Attached 1300 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

150
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Reclosable Clear Pouch to Hold Paperwork, 
Approx 6 x 9 Inch 300 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

151
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Nylon Cable Tie, Medium Duty, 11 Inch 
Length Minimum, 50 lb Tensile Strength Minimum, 100 per Pack 30 pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

152 Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Insulated Shipping Container Polar Tech ON24C 100 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
153 Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Refrigerant Ice Packs Polar Tech IB 6 480 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

154
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Polyethylene Disposable Glove, 500 Gloves 
per Box MCR Safety 5040 24 box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

155
Section XIII - Miscellaneous Supplies: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar 
items required by Collin County not specifically named in Section XIII 1 each No Bid No Bid 20.0% 13.0% 25.0% No Bid

* Draft until award
1Alternate item quoted does not meet specifications
Line items not awarded: 6, 9, 16, 27, 33, 40-45, 70, 72-75, 77-82, 84, 102-103, 106-137, 139-144, 149-155


