IFB 2023-071 Addendum 3 (Video Surveillance System Upgrade, Adult Detention Facility, Courthouse and Central Plant)

				Allied Universal Tec	hnology Services	CML Security LLC	
				Total Price	\$2,962,735.98	Total Price	\$3,001,732.00
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Base Bid Grand Total	1	lump sum	\$2,946,571.61	\$2,946,571.61	\$2,908,031.00	\$2,908,031.00
1 ALT1	N/A	1	lump sum	\$0.00			
1.1	Total Materials Cost for Adult Detention Fa	ci 1	lump sum	\$1,159,391.49		\$1,414,160.00	
1.2	Total Labor Cost for Adult Detention Facility	//1	lump sum	\$970,490.00		<u>\$330,658.00</u>	
1.3	Total Materials Cost for Courthouse	1	lump sum	<u>\$340,303.23</u>		\$707,080.00	
1.4	Total Labor Cost for Courthouse	1	lump sum	\$394,272.26		<u>\$165,330.00</u>	
1.5	Total Materials Cost for Central Plant	1	lump sum	<u>\$43,489.05</u>		\$235,694.00	
1.6	Total Labor Cost for Central Plant	1	lump sum	\$38,625.58		\$55,109.00	
2	Alternate 1: Trade-in Value for Existing Adu	lt 1	lump sum	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	
3	Alternate 2: Trade-in Value for Existing Cou	r11	lump sum	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	
4	Alternate 3: Trade-in Value for Existing Cen	tr1	lump sum	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	
5	Alternate 4: Mobile Clients (monitoring cam	€1		\$16,164.37	\$16,164.37	\$93,701.00	\$93,701.00
5 ALT1	N/A	1	lump sum	\$0.00			
5.1	Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum	\$13,426.87		\$79,709.00	
5.2	Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum	\$2,737.50		\$3,742.00	
5.3	Total Software License Cost Incorporated in	20	each	No Bid		\$512.50	
6	Alternate 5: Mobile Client (Software License	e: 1	each	\$0.00		\$0.00	

Note: No award on alternates, lines 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6.

Network Cabling Solutions - non responsive.