2024-139 OEM Toner, Ink Cartridges, and Supplies for Printers

Sample Pricing Bid Tabulation

Rre=n Rang?fit:(;ssslggeam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category | - Lexmark Toner Cartridges Co-op Contract DIR-CPO-4438 TIPS 230105 OMNIA 19-12R DIR-CPO-4438
Line Term Ends 9/3/2024 5/31/2028 10/13/2027 9/3/2024
1 [Percent Discount Off All Lexmark Toner Cartridges 40% 5% 43% 25%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. Item No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
2 Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Black Return Program 7K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 74C1SKO0 205 159.99 32,797.95 $115.90 23,758.60) 168.92 34,628.60 131.82 27,023.10 $123.73 25,364.65
3 Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Black Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 71C10K0 200 111.99 22,398.00 $91.67 18,334.00 117.36 23,472.00 160.68 32,136.00 $99.86 19,972.00
4 Lexmark MS/MX310, 312, 315, 410, 415, 510, 511, 610, 611 Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 50F1H00 190 151.19 28,726.10 $106.89 20,309.75) 157.57 29,938.30 142.05 26,989.50 $129.16 24,540.40
5 Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Yellow Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 74C10Y0 140 111.99 15,678.60 $80.89 11,324.03 177.88 24,903.20 $57.35 $8,029.00 $87.25 12,215.00
6 Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Magenta Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 74C10M0 135 111.99 15,118.65 $80.89 10,919.60 177.88 24,013.80 $92.00 12,420.00 $87.25 11,778.75
7 Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Yellow Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 71C10Y0 135 179.19 24,190.65 $146.26 19,745.10 187.25 25,278.75 $256.36 34,608.60 $157.77 21,298.95
8 Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 811, 812 Return Program 25K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 52D1H00 135 387.82 52,355.70 $280.90 37,921.72] 441.62 59,618.70 $398.11 53,744.85 $362.03 48,874.05
9 Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Cyan Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 74C10C0 130 111.99 14,558.70 $80.89 10,515.17 177.88 23,124.40 $92.00 11,960.00 $87.25 11,342.50
10 Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Magenta Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 71C10M0 130 179.19 23,294.70 $146.26 19,013.80 187.25 24,342.50 $256.36 33,326.80 $157.77 20,510.10
1 Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Cyan Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 71C10C0 125 179.19 22,398.75 $146.26 18,282.50 187.25 23,406.25 $256.00 32,000.00 $157.77 19,721.25
12 Lexmark CS310, CS/CX410, 510 Black Return Program 4K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 70C1HKO 125 $98.14 12,267.50 $70.19 $8,774.31 107.40 13,425.00 $83.10 10,387.50 $75.72 $9,465.00
13 Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Black Return Program 8.5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 78C1XK0 100 146.39 14,639.00 105.75 10,575.01 154.13 15,413.00 120.28 12,028.00 114.08 11,408.00
14 Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Magenta Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 78C1XM0 80 179.19 14,335.20 129.91 10,393.11 189.33 15,146.40 147.75 11,820.00 140.14 11,211.20
15 Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Yellow Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 78C1XY0 80 179.19 14,335.20 129.91 10,393.11 189.33 15,146.40 147.75 11,820.00 140.14 11,211.20
16 Lexmark MS821, 823, 825, MS/MX725, 822, 826 Return Program 15K Toner Cartridge Lexmark 58D1H00 75 205.88 15,441.00 187.16 14,037.10 234.55 17,691.25 211.44 15,858.00 201.90 15,142.50
Subtotal [INNNN$322 535170| Subtotal $244,296.89 Subtotal $369,448.55 Subtotal $334,151.35 Subtotal $274,055.55|
CDW Government LLC lea Rang:ﬁt:(;:s:"[;;eam Ranch ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category Il - Other Lexmark Supplies Co-op Contract DIR-CPO-5093 DIR-CP0-4438 OMNIA 19-12R DIR-CPO-4438
Line Term Ends 11/21/2024 9/3/12024 10/13/2027 9/3/12024
17 Percent Discount Off All Other Lexmark Supplies (excludes toners) 15% 32% 43% 25%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
18 Lexmark C/X73x, 74x 1-Pack 20K Photoconductor Kit Lexmark C734X20G 110 $42.39 $4,662.90 $26.10 2,871.02 $41.45 $4,559.50 $48.99 $5,388.90 $31.00 $3,410.00
19 Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 812, MS811, 817, 818, MX717, 718 Return Program 100K Imaging Unit Lexmark 52D0Z00 40 $52.56 $2,102.40 $37.87 1,514.92 $50.96 $2,038.40 $44.93 $1,797.20 $45.00 $1,800.00
20 Lexmark Fuser 110-120V, Type 00 Lexmark 41X0252 30 $408.67 $12,260.10 $318.23 9,546.86) $457.34 $13,720.20 $474.99 $14,249.70 $468.00 $14,040.00
21 Lexmark C54x, X54x 18K Waste Container Lexmark C540X75G 25 $13.56 $339.00 $6.97 $174.33 $13.36 $334.00 $8.32 $208.00 $8.00 $200.00
22 Lexmark CS720, 728, CS/CX725, 727, C4150, XC4140, 4150 90K Waste Container Lexmark 74COW00 25 $29.67 $741.75 $16.89 $422.30 $26.76 $669.00 $30.99 $774.75 $19.00 $475.00
23 Lexmark MS81x, MX71x, MX81x Return Program Fuser Maintenance Kit Lexmark 40X8420 25 $245.88 $6,147.00 $216.39 $5,409.82 $276.71 $6,917.75 $329.99 $8,249.75 $354.00 $8,850.00
Subtotal $26,253.15] Subtotal $19,939.26] Subtotal Subtotal $30,668.30 Subtotal $28,775.00
CDW Government LLC Dream Rang?fittgss‘a)lggeam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC
Category Ill - HP Toner Cartridges Co-op Contract DIR-TSO-4159 DIR-TSO-4159 TIPS 230105 OMNIA 19-12R
Line Term Ends 9/28/2024 9/28/2024 5/31/2028 10/13/2027
24 Percent Discount Off All HP Toner Cartridges 35% 30% 5% 43%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
25 HP 508A Cyan Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge HP CF361A 5 155.99 779.95 146.11 730.53 207.30 1,036.50 167.74 838.70 157.71 788.55
26 HP 508A Magenta Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge HP CF363A 5 155.99 779.95 146.11 730.53 207.30 1,036.50 165.74 828.70 157.71 788.55
27 HP 508A Yellow Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge HP CF362A 5 155.99 779.95 146.11 730.53 207.30 1,036.50 165.74 828.70 157.71 788.55
28 HP 87X High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge HP CF287X 2 241.79 483.58 220.31 440.61 312.60 $625.20 236.47 472.94 236.31 472.62
29 HP 206X High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge HP W2110X 2 $71.49 142.98 $66.53 133.06 $94.17 $188.34 $91.65 183.30 $80.68 161.36
Subtotal $2,966.41 Subtotal $2,765.25] Subtotal $3,923.04 Subtotal $3,152.34 Subtotal
CDW Government LLC plea Rang:ﬁt:(;:g:"[;;eam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC
Category IV - HP Ink Cartridges Co-op Contract DIR-TS0-4159 DIR-TS0-4159 TIPS 230105 OMNIA 19-12R
Line Term Ends 9/28/2024 9/28/2024 5/31/2028 10/13/2027
30 Percent Discount Off All HP Ink Cartridges 25% 15% 5% 43%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
31 HP 62XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge HP C2P05AN#140 15 38.24 573.60 35.94 539.05 44.54 668.10 31.55 473.25 41.22 618.30
32 HP 62XL High Yield Tri-color Original Ink Cartridge HP C2P07AN#140 15 39.74 596.10 37.34 560.06 46.29 694.35 34.32 514.80 42.85 642.75
33 HP 952XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge HP F6U19AN#140 15 43.49 652.35 40.87 613.06 50.67 760.05 41.09 616.35 46.88 703.20
34 HP 730 300-ml Matte Black DesignJet Ink Cartridge HP P2V71A 10 $124.50 $1,245.00 $125.96 $1,259.59 $147.73 $1,477.30 $195.47 $1,954.70 $126.43 $1,264.30
35 HP 952 Yellow Original Ink Cartridge HP LOS55AN#140 10 $20.24 $202.40 $18.08 $180.77 $22.41 $224.10 $18.28 $182.80 $20.75 $207.50
36 HP 730 300-ml Gray DesignJet Ink Cartridge HP P2V72A 10 $124.50 $1,245.00 $125.96 $1,259.59 $147.73 $1,477.30 $195.47 $1,954.70 $126.43 $1,264.30
37 HP 902XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge HP T6M14AN#140 5 $38.24 $191.20 $35.94 $179.68 $44.54 $222.70 $34.77 $173.85 $41.22 $206.10
Subtotal $4,705.65 Subtotal $4,591.79 Subtotal $5,523.90 Subtotal $5,870.45 Subtotal
Rre=n Rang?ﬁt:céssslg;eam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category V - Other HP Supplies Co-op Contract DIR-TSO-4159 TIPS 230105 OMNIA 19-12R DIR-TSO-4159
Line Term Ends 9/28/2024 5/31/2028 10/13/2027 9/28/2024
38 [Percent Discount Off All Other HP Supplies (excludes toner & ink) 30% 5% 43% 25%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. Item No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
39 HP 731 DesignJet Printhead HP P2V27A 5 $92.80 $464.00 $87.19 $435.95 $102.26 $511.30 $137.99 $689.95 $87.51 $437.55
40 HP LaserJet 110V Maintenance Kit HP F2G76A 2 $299.24 $598.48 $284.75 $569.51 $331.87 $663.74 $329.99 $659.98 $285.12 $570.24
M HP 72 Matte Black and Yellow DesignJet Printhead HP C9384A 1 $82.40 $82.40 $73.03 $73.03 $85.84 $85.84, $69.13 $69.13 $78.44 $78.44
42 HP 72 Gray and Photo Black DesignJet Printhead HP C9380A 1 $82.40 $82.40 $73.03 $73.03 $85.84 $85.84, $69.13 $69.13 $78.44 $78.44
Subtotal [INNNNST22728| Subtotal $1,151.51 Subtotal $1,346.72 Subtotal $1,488.19 Subtotal $1,164.67
CDW Government LLC plean Rang:ﬁt:(;:s:"[:;eam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category VI - OKI DATA Toner Cartridges Co-op Contract No Bid BuyBoard 707-23 No Bid No Bid BuyBoard 656-21
Line Term Ends 5/31/2026 11/30/2024
43 [Percent Discount Off All OKI DATA Toner Cartridges No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid 10%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
44 OKI DATA C931E Black Toner OKI DATA 45536516 3 No Bid No Bid 165.76 497.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.00 $117.00
45 OKI DATA C931E Cyan Toner OKI DATA 45536515 3 No Bid No Bid 192.61 577.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 383.70 1,151.10
46 OKI DATA C931E Magenta Toner OKI DATA 45536514 3 No Bid No Bid 192.61 577.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 513.04 1,539.12
47 OKI DATA C931E Yellow Toner OKI DATA 45536513 3 No Bid No Bid 192.61 577.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 514.13 1,542.39
Subtotal $0.00| Subtotal $2,230.76] Subtotal $0.00| Subtotal $0.00| Subtotal $4,349.61
CDW Government LLC Drean Rang::‘lﬁl‘.::(;:::"z;eam Ranch Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category VIl - Other OKI DATA Supplies Co-op Contract No Bid BuyBoard 707-23 No Bid No Bid BuyBoard 656-21
Line Term Ends 5/31/2026 11/30/2024
48 [Percent Discount Off All Other OKI DATA Supplies (excludes toner) No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid 10%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. Item No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
49 OKI DATA C931E Waste Toner Container OKI DATA 45531502 1 No Bid No Bid $25.74 $25.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.00 $39.00
50 OKI DATA C931E Black Image Drum OKI DATA 45103728 1 No Bid No Bid $361.52 361.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $383.70 383.70
51 OKI DATA C931E Cyan Image Drum OKI DATA 45103727 1 No Bid No Bid $603.57 603.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $513.04 513.04
52 OKI DATA C931E Fuser - 120V OKI DATA 45531112 1 No Bid No Bid $520.14 520.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $514.13 514.13
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $1,510.97| Subtotal Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $1,449.87,
Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream Ranch . . .
) CDW Government LLC Office Supplies ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category VIl - Brother Toner Cartridges Co-op Contract DIR-CPO-5093 DIR-CPO-4410 OMNIA 19-12R BuyBoard 656-21
Line Term Ends 11/21/2024 8/22/2024 10/13/2027 11/30/2024
53 [Percent Discount Off All Brother Toner Cartridges 15% 15% 43% 10%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
54 Brother TN431BK Standard Yield Toner, Black, Yields Approx 3,000 Pages Brother TN431BK 5 $68.84 344.20, $70.33 351.64 $73.76 368.80 $80.99 404.95 $80.99 404.95
55 Brother TN433C High Yield Toner, Cyan, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages Brother TN433C 5 116.44 582.20 118.69 593.43 124.49 622.45 136.99 684.95 135.99 679.95
56 Brother TN433M High Yield Toner, Magenta, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages Brother TN433M 5 116.44 582.20 118.69 593.43 124.49 622.45 136.99 684.95 135.99 679.95
57 Brother TN433Y High Yield Toner, Yellow, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages Brother TN433Y 5 116.44 582.20 118.69 593.43 124.49 622.45 136.99 684.95 135.99 679.95
Subtotal $2,090.80 Subtotal $2,131.95 Subtotal Subtotal $2,459.80 Subtotal $2,444.80
CDW Government LLC Netsync Network Solutions, Inc. ODP Business Solutions, LLC Perry Office Products, Inc.
Category IX - Other Brother Supplies Co-op Contract DIR-CPO-5093 TIPS 230105 OMNIA 19-12R BuyBoard 656-21
Line Term Ends 11/21/2024 5/31/2028 10/13/2027 11/30/2024
58 [Percent Discount Off All Other Brother Supplies (excludes toner) 15% 5% 43% 10%
Estimated Annual
Manufacturer Manf. ltem No. Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
59 [Brother DR431CL Drum Unit Brother DR431CL 2 $129.19 $258.38 $131.88 $263.76 $138.32 $276.64 $92.33 $184.66 $151.00 $302.00
60 [Brother WT320CL Waste Toner Box, Yields Approx 50,000 Pages Brother WT320CL 1 $22.09 $22.09 $20.31 $20.31 $22.73 $22.73 $27.99 $27.99 $45.00 $45.00
Subtotal $280.47 Subtotal Subtotal $299.37 Subtotal $212.65] Subtotal $347.00
*Draft until award Total $360,059.46 Total $278,902.45 Total $411,016.58 Total $378,003.08 Total $320,492.58
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Primary Award
Secondary Award



