
COOP 2024-123: Grounds Maintenance Equipment

LINE DESCRIPTION UOM ESTIMATED QUANTITY COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE COOPERATIVE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 STIHL HT131 POLE PRUNER EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $646.79 $1,293.58 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $654.49 $1,308.98 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID

1 ALT 1 STIHL HT135-14" EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $614.00 $1,228.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
1 ALT 2 ECHO PPT-2620 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$504.00 *$1008.00 - NO BID NO BID
1 ALT 3 ECHO PPF-225 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$541.00 *$1,082.00

2 STIHL MS462 CM CHAINSAW WITH 18" BAR AND CASE  EACH 3 BUYBOARD 706-23 $1,167.59 $3,502.77 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,240.90 $3,722.70 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,110.00 $3,330.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
2 ALT 1 ECHO CS-7310P EACH 3 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$864.99 *$2,594.97 - NO BID NO BID
2 ALT 2 ECHO CS-400-18 EACH 3 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$369.37 *$1,108.11

3 STIHL MS362 C-M CHAINSAW WITH 18" BAR AND CASE EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $755.99 $1,511.98 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $824.49 $1,648.98 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $718.00 $1,436.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
3 ALT 1 ECHO CS-620 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$520.99 *$1,041.98 - NO BID NO BID
3 ALT 2 ECHO CS-400-18 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$369.37 *$738.74

4 STIHL BG-86 HAND HELD BLOWER EACH 6 BUYBOARD 706-23 $243.59 $1,461.54 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $246.49 $1,478.94 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $230.00 $1,380.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
4 ALT 1 ECHO PB-2620 EACH 6 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$200.00 *$1,200.00 - NO BID NO BID
4 ALT 2 ECHO PB-255LN EACH 6 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$276.34 *$1,658.04

5 STIHL BR430 BACKPACK BLOWER EACH 3 BUYBOARD 706-23 $377.99 $1,133.97 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $382.49 $1,147.47 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $358.00 $1,074.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
5 ALT 1 ECHO PB-755 EACH 3 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$384.00 *$1,152.00 - NO BID NO BID
5 ALT 2 ECHO PB-770T EACH 3 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$608.66 *$1,825.98

6 TORO MODEL 22295 HEAVY DUTY 21" SELF-PROPELLED HAND MOWER EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $1,649.00 $3,298.00 - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 2017025 $1,459.27 $2,918.54 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
6 ALT 1 SCAG 21 7HP EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG *$1800.00 *$3600.00 - NO BID NO BID
6 ALT 2 EGO LM2100SP EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$540.36 *$1,080.72

7 STIHL HS82T HEDGER 30" WITH  GUARD EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $537.59 $1,075.18 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $509.99 $1,019.98 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
7 ALT 1 STIHL HS82T-24 30" MODEL NLA, 24" REPLACEMENT EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $478.00 $956.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
7 ALT 2 ECHO HCA-2810 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$480.99 *$961.98 - NO BID NO BID
7 ALT 3 MAKITA XHU08T EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$576.81 *$1,153.62

8 STIHL RB-800 4200 PSI POWER WASHER WITH ACCESSORIES EACH 1 BUYBOARD 706-23 $1,690.99 $1,690.99 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,857.24 $1,857.24 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,806.00 $1,806.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
8 ALT 1 ECHO PW-4200 EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$1,200.00 *$1,200.00 - NO BID NO BID
8 ALT 2 SIMPSON 95002 EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$6,876.00 *$6,876.00

9 STIHL FS361C-EM  BRUSH CUTTER, BIKE HANDLE EACH 1 BUYBOARD 706-23 $965.99 $965.99 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $977.49 $977.49 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $918.00 $918.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
9 ALT 1 ECHO SRM-410U EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$504.99 *$504.99 - NO BID NO BID
9 ALT 2 ECHO SRM-225 EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$284.20 *$284.20

10 BILLY GOAT BC2601HM BRUSH CUTTER, HONDA ENGINE EACH 1 BUYBOARD 706-23 $3,260.00 $3,260.00 - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $3,140.25 $3,140.25 - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 $2,860.00 $2,860.00 - NO BID NO BID
10 ALT 1 BILLY GOAT BC2600ICM EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 3533.22 $3,533.22

11 HONDA HRC216HXA  21" HYDROSTATIC SELF-PROPELLED MOWER EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,449.00 $1,449.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
11 ALT 1 SCAG 21 5 HP EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $1,600.00 $1,600.00 - NO BID NO BID
11 ALT 2 EGO LM2100SP EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 540.36 $540.36

12 HONDA HRC216K3PDA 21" PUSH MOWER EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
12 ALT 1 PDA MODEL NLA, REPLACEMENT HXA HRC216HXA EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $1,449.00 $1,449.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
12 ALT 2 SCAG 21 5HP EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $1,600.00 $1,600.00 - NO BID NO BID
12 ALT 3 EGO LM2130 EACH 1 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$472.14 *$472.14

13 SCAG 52" STTII-52V-31BV ZTR RIDING MOWER EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $13,199.00 $26,398.00 - NO BID NO BID
13 ALT 1 STTII-52V-26CV-EFI EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $13,199.00 $26,398.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
13 ALT 2 31BV NLA REPLACMENT MODEL 26CV-EFI EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $12,870.00 $25,740.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
13 ALT 3 GRASSHOPPER MODEL 329B/52 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 2017025 *$11,905.65 *$23,811.30 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
13 ALT 4 EGO ZT4204L EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$7,990.00 *$15,980.00

14 SCAG 72" STTI-72V-38CV-EFI ZTR RIDING MOWER EACH 2 BUYBOARD 706-23 $14,772.00 $29,544.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $14,772.00 $29,544.00 - NO BID NO BID
14 ALT 1 38CV-EFI NLA, REPLACEMENT MODEL 38CH-EFI EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG $14,402.70 $28,805.40 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
14 ALT 2 GRASSHOPPER MODEL 337G5/72 EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 2017025 *$12,707.20 *$25,414.40 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
14 ALT 3 HUSQVARNA Z248F EACH 2 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$5,000.00 *$10,000.00

15 STHIL 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR MS362CM EACH 12 BUYBOARD 706-23 $29.00 $348.00 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $31.45 $377.40 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $29.60 $355.20 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
15 ALT 1 ECHO 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO CS-620 EACH 12 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$520.99 *$6,251.88 - NO BID NO BID
15 ALT 2 ECHO 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO 91PX62CQ EACH 12 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$19.50 *$234.00

16 STHIL 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR MS462 CM EACH 8 BUYBOARD 706-23 $29.00 $232.00 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $31.45 $251.60 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $29.60 $236.80 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
16 ALT 1 ECHO 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO CS-7310P EACH 8 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$864.99 *$6,919.92 - NO BID NO BID
16 ALT 2 ECHO 18" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO 91PX62CQ EACH 8 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$19.50 *$156.00

17 STHIL 12" SAW CHAIN FOR HT131 POLE PRUNER EACH 8 BUYBOARD 706-23 $25.00 $200.00 RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $18.70 $149.60 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
17 ALT 1 STIHL REPLACMENT CHAIN 14" FOR HT135 EACH 8 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 $20.00 $160.00 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID
17 ALT 2 ECHO 12" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO PPT-2620 EACH 8 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 706-23 *$504.00 *$4,032.00 - NO BID NO BID
17 ALT 3 ECHO 12" CHAIN SAW CHAIN FOR ECHO 91PX45CQ EACH 8 - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID - NO BID NO BID OMNIA 192163 *$15.00 *$120.00

*DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS TOTAL: $75,916.00 TOTAL: $13,940.38 TOTAL: $76,222.19 TOTAL: $49,225.70 TOTAL: $88,437.72 TOTAL: $46,843.13
DRAFT UNTIL AWARD

Each item will be awarded on an individual basis and may or may not be purchased.  Quantity shown is an approximate.

 OMNIA 192163 EXPIRES DECEMBER 31, 2024 WITH NO RENEWALS. *BUYBOARD 706-23 EXPIRES 5/31/2026. *RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 EXPIRES 5/31/2026  *RICHARDSON ISD RFP 22-174 EXPIRES 5/31/2026. OMNIA 2017025 EXPIRES MARCH 31, 2024 
WITH NO RENEWALS. SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG EXPIRES 4/30/2025. 

 *BUYBOARD 706-23 EXPIRES 5/31/2026. SOURCEWELL 031121-SCG EXPIRES 
4/30/2025. 

 OMNIA 2017025 EXPIRES MARCH 31, 2024 WITH NO RENEWALS. 

W.W. Grainger, Inc.Four Brothers Ford Tractor, Inc. Landmark Equipment, Inc. Richardson Saw and Lawn Mower Company Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. dba The Grasshopper Company Sam's Lawn Riders, Inc.

DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD


