IFB 2024-235: Uniform Jeans Cavender Stores LP Galls LLC Stacy Smoot LLC
Line Quantity Description Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 1 Percentage off Retail Price for Work Jeans 0.00% 0.00% 15.00% 15.00% 20.00% 20.00%
1ALT1 1 Percentage off Retail Price for Wrangler Jeans 10.00% 10.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 55 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Cowboy Cut Rigid Slim Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 936DEN, Waist 27-42, Length 30-40 $19.99 $1,099.45 $33.96 $1,867.80 $35.00 $1,925.00
3 45 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Original Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 133MW?Z, Waist 28-48, Length 30-38 $19.99 $899.55 $34.75 $1,563.75 $45.00 $2,025.00
4 15 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Original Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 13MW?Z, Waist 44-54, Length 32-34 $22.99 $344.85 $34.75 $521.25 $47.00 $705.00
5 45 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Cowboy Cut Original Fit Pre-Washed Jean, Wrangler Part No. 13MWZPW, Waist 28-48, Length 30-38 $31.99 $1,439.55 $46.50 $2,092.50 $45.00 $2,025.00
6 10 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Cowboy Cut Original Fit Pre-Washed Jean, Wrangler Part No. 13MWZPW, Waist 44-54, Length 32-34 $33.99 $339.90 $46.50 $465.00 $47.00 $470.00
7 45 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 31MWZDN, Waist 28-48, Length 30-38 $19.99 $899.55 $34.75 $1,563.75 $35.00 $1,575.00
8 10 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 31MWZDN, Waist 44-54, Length 30-34 $22.99 $229.90 $34.75 $347.50 $37.00 $370.00
9 45 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 31MWZPW, Waist 28-48, Length 30-38 $31.99 $1,439.55 $42.49 $1,912.05 $35.00 $1,575.00
10 10 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 31MWZPW, Waist 44-54, Length 30-34 $33.99 $339.90 $42.49 $424.90 $37.00 $370.00
11 15 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Blues Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. WB101AD, Antique Indigo, Size 4-20 $31.99 $479.85 $35.70 $535.50 $34.00 $510.00
12 5 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Blues Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. WB101AD, Antique Indigo, Size 22-30 $33.99 $169.95 $39.10 $195.50 $35.00 $175.00
13 120  For Evaluation Purposes Only: Wrangler Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Wrangler Part No. 31IMWZGK, Stonewash, Waist 29-48, Length 30-38 $36.99 $4,438.80 $42.49 $5,098.80 $45.00 $5,400.00
14 100  For Evaluation Purposes Only: Ariat Rebar M4 Relaxed DuraStretch Basic Boot Cut Jean, Ariat Rebar Part No. 10016221, Waist 28-42, Length 30-38 $49.99 $4,999.00 $44.95 $4,495.00 $51.00 $5,100.00
15 35 For Evaluation Purposes Only: Ariat Rebar M4 Relaxed DuraStretch Basic Boot Cut Jean, Ariat Rebar Part No. 10016221, Waist 44-50, Length 30-38 $55.99 $1,959.65 $49.95 $1,748.25 $54.00 $1,890.00
*No Bids from Cape Equipment & Services LLC and Wedge Supply LLC Total $19,079.45 Total $22,831.55 Total $24,115.00

*Draft until award




