Contract 2024-377: SO Vehicles

Silsbee Ford Inc.

Silsbee Ford Inc.

Silsbee Ford Inc.

Silsbee Ford Inc.

Cooperative TIPS 210907 Cooperative GoodBuy 23-8F000 Cooperative TX Smartbuy 070-A1 Cooperative Buyboard 724-23
Line Quantity Description Each Total Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 1 Vehicle, Ford F150 Responder $51,761.25 $51,761.25 $51,923.75 $51,923.75 No Bid No Bid $52,326.75 $52,326.75
2 1 Vehicle, Ford F150 XL $56,529.65 $56,529.65 No Bid No Bid $56,756.65 $56,756.65 $57,123.65 $57,123.65
Total Awarded $108,290.90 Total Awarded $51,923.75 Total Awarded $56,756.65 Total Awarded $109,450.40

*Draft until award




	Sheet1

