2024-444 Cisco One Advantage Software Maintenance

	Netsy	Netsync Network Solutions, Inc.			GTS Technology Solutions, Inc.		
Соор		DIR			TIPS		
Contract Number		DIR-CPO-4866			230105		
Contract Expiration		11/16/2027			5/31/2028		
Quote Date		10/9/2024			9/23/2024		
Quote Expiration		11/9/2024			10/23/2024		
Quote No.		AAAQ441734-06			Q-07648, Q-07649, Q-07650		
	Qty	Price	Extended	Qty	Price	Extended	
Cisco ONE Advantage 1CA1TN9300XF-1Y, Term 1 year Subscription Number 1772588, 15-Mar-2025 to 14-Mar-2026 Maintenance on switch and router operating systems Subscription date coincides with switch/router purchase date	4	\$6,096.81	\$24,387.24	4	\$7,830.11	\$31,320.44	
Cisco ONE Advantage 1CA1TN9300XF-1Y, Term 1 year Subscription Number 697532, 16-Feb-2025 to 15-Feb-2026 Maintenance on switch and router operating systems Subscription date coincides with switch/router purchase date	6	\$6,096.81	\$36,580.86	6	\$7,830.11	\$46,980.66	
Cisco ONE Advantage 1CA1TN9300XF-1Y, Term 1 year Subscription Number 697533, 16-Feb-2025 to 15-Feb-2026 Maintenance on switch and router operating systems Subscription date coincides with switch/router purchase date	10	\$6,096.81	\$60,968.10	10	\$7,830.11	\$78,301.10	
* Draft until award	TOTAL	+0,000.01				\$156,602.20	
			,,,.			, 0,002.20	

WayPoint - NO BID

CDW Government - NO BID

Converge Technology Solutions - NO BID

SHI - NO BID

Red River - Non Responsive