Contract 2024-352: Purchase of Uniform and Clothing Items

Primary Award
Secondary Award
Tertiary Award
No Award Groovy Designs LLC dba Fully Promoted Galls, LLC Minority Authority Uniform LLC
Cooperative MISD RFP2024-06-627 Cooperative Buyboard 698-23 Cooperative Buyboard 670-22
Category Line No. | Estimated Quantity |UOM Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 1 227 Each Sizes XS-XL, Port Authority KS00P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must $25.00 $5,675.00 $28.98 $6,578.46 $15.75 $3,575.25
1 2 47 Each Size 2XL, Port Authority K500P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $28.00 $1,316.00 $30.68 $1,441.96 $17.25 $810.75
1 3 6 Each Size 3XL, Port Authority K500P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $30.00 $180.00 $34.08 $204.48 $20.25 $121.50
1 4 1 Each Size 4XL, Port Authority K500P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $32.00 $32.00 $35.78 $35.78 $21.75 $21.75
1 5 1 Each Size 5XL, Port Authority K500P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $34.00 $34.00 $39.18 $39.18 $24.75 $24.75
1 6 1 Each Size 6XL, Port Authority K500P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $36.00 $36.00 $40.88 $40.88 $25.40 $25.40
1 7 42 Each Size LT-XLT, Port Authority TLK500P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) $27.00 $1,134.00 $30.68 $1,288.56 $21.00 $882.00
1 8 36 Each Size 2XLT, Port Authority TLK500P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - $29.00 $1,044.00 $34.08 $1,226.88 $23.25 $837.00
1 9 12 Each Size 3XLT, Port Authority TLKS00P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - $31.00 $372.00 $35.78 $429.36 $24.75 $297.00
1 10 1 Each Size 4XLT, Port Authority TLK500P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - $33.00 $33.00 $37.48 $37.48 $25.40 $25.40
1 11 94 Each Sizes XS-XL, Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Em| $25.00 $2,350.00 $28.13 $2,644.22 $15.30 $1,438.20
1 12 15 Each Size 2XL, Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embro $28.00 $420.00 $29.83 $447.45 $16.80 $252.00
1 13 4 Each Size 3XL, Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embro| $30.00 $120.00 $33.23 $132.92 $19.80 $79.20
1 14 1 Each Size 4XL, Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embro $32.00 $32.00 $34.93 $34.93 $21.30 $21.30
1 15 56 Each Sizes XS-XL, District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroiderf $16.00 $896.00 $20.48 $1,146.88 $8.25 $462.00
1 16 6 Each Size 2XL, District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroidered $18.00 $108.00 $21.33 $127.98 $9.00 $54.00
1 17 1 Each Size 3XL, District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroidered $20.00 $20.00 $21.76 $21.76 $9.75 $9.75
1 18 1 Each Size 4XL, District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroidered $22.00 $22.00 $23.03 $23.03 $10.50 $10.50
1 19 20 Each Sizes XS-XL, Men’s Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211 (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must | $36.00 $720.00 $40.30 $806.00 $25.70 $514.00
1 20 2 Each Size 2XL, Men’s Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211 (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl $39.00 $78.00 $43.70 $87.40 $28.80 $57.60
1 21 1 Each Size 3XL, Men’s Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211 (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Inclt $41.00 $41.00 $45.40 $45.40 $30.40 $30.40
1 22 1 Each Size 4XL, Men’s Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211 (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl $43.00 $43.00 $47.10 $47.10 $31.95 $31.95
1 23 1 Each Size 5XL, Men’s Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211 (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Inclt $45.00 $45.00 $48.80 $48.80 $33.50 $33.50
1 24 14 Each Sizes XS-XL, Men'’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211L (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must I $40.00 $560.00 No Bid No Bid $28.80 $403.20
1 25 2 Each Size 2XL, Men’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211L (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl| $43.00 $86.00 No Bid No Bid $31.95 $63.90
1 26 1 Each Size 3XL, Men’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211L (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl| $45.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid $33.50 $33.50
1 27 1 Each Size 4XL, Men’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211L (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl| $47.00 $47.00 No Bid No Bid $35.10 $35.10
1 28 1 Each Size 5XL, Men’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211L (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must Incl| $49.00 $49.00 No Bid No Bid $36.60 $36.60
1 29 20 Each Sizes XS-XL, Women's Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211W (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - $36.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid $25.70 $514.00
1 30 2 Each Size 2X, Women's Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211W (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must| $39.00 $78.00 No Bid No Bid $28.80 $57.60
1 31 2 Each Size 3X, Women's Harriton Short Sleeve Polo M211W (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Must| $41.00 $82.00 No Bid No Bid $30.40 $60.80
1 32 20 Each Sizes XS-XL, Women’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211LW (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - $40.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid $28.80 $576.00
1 33 2 Each Size 2XL, Women’s Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211LW (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Mu $43.00 $86.00 No Bid No Bid $31.95 $63.90
1 34 2 Each Size 3XL, Women's Harriton Long Sleeve Polo M211LW (or Collin County approved equivalent) in Black - Mu $45.00 $90.00 No Bid No Bid $33.50 $67.00
1 35 Percentage |Percentage off Suggested Retail Price of Uniform Shirts not Listed 0.1 10% No Bid No Bid 0.25 25.00%
Category 1 Total $1,168.00 $17,394.00 $825.70 $11,526.80
Shared Item Total $700.00 $14,751.00 $480.60 $9,615.20
Line Items Quoted 34 34 34 34
2 36 8 Each Sizes S-XL, Port & Company PC90H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved $33.00 $264.00 $35.78 $286.24 $22.60 $180.80
2 37 7 Each Size 2XL, Port & Company PCI0H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved eq $36.00 $252.00 $40.03 $280.21 $26.10 $182.70
2 38 1 Each Size 3XL, Port & Company PC90H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved ed $39.00 $39.00 $43.43 $43.43 $29.20 $29.20
2 39 1 Each Size 4XL, Port & Company PCI0H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved eq $42.00 $42.00 $43.43 $43.43 $29.20 $29.20
2 40 2 Each Sizes LT-XLT, Port & Company PC90HT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County ap $35.00 $70.00 $37.48 $74.96 $23.50 $47.00
2 41 3 Each Size 2XLT, Port & Company PCOOHT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County appro $38.00 $114.00 $41.73 $125.19 $26.80 $80.40
2 42 1 Each Size 3XLT, Port & Company PC9OHT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County appro| $41.00 $41.00 $45.13 $45.13 $29.85 $29.85
2 43 1 Each Size 4XLT, Port & Company PCOOHT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County appro $44.00 $44.00 $45.13 $45.13 $29.85 $29.85
2 44 32 Each Sizes S-XL, Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved $37.00 $1,184.00 $38.33 $1,226.56 $24.70 $790.40
2 45 11 Each Size 2XL, Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved e $40.00 $440.00 $40.03 $440.33 $26.60 $292.60
2 46 2 Each Size 3XL, Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved e $43.00 $86.00 $46.83 $93.66 $32.30 $64.60
2 47 1 Each Size 4XL, Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved e $46.00 $46.00 $46.83 $46.83 $32.30 $32.30
2 48 2 Each Sizes LT-XLT, Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County ap, $38.00 $76.00 $39.18 $78.36 $24.75 $49.50
2 49 8 Each Size 2XLT, Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County apprd $41.00 $328.00 $41.73 $333.84 $26.90 $215.20
2 50 1 Each Size 3XLT, Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County apprd $44.00 $44.00 $46.83 $46.83 $32.50 $32.50
2 51 1 Each Size 4XLT, Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Collin County apprd $47.00 $47.00 $46.83 $46.83 $32.50 $32.50
2 52 6 Each Sizes XS-XL, Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embr $38.00 $228.00 $40.03 $240.18 $25.50 $153.00
2 53 2 Each Size 2XL, Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroid: $40.00 $80.00 $41.73 $83.46 $27.00 $54.00
2 54 2 Each Size 3XL, Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroid $42.00 $84.00 $45.13 $90.26 $30.00 $60.00
2 55 1 Each Size 4XL, Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroid: $44.00 $44.00 $46.83 $46.83 $31.50 $31.50
2 56 20 Each Sizes S-XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed no bid no bid $37.48 $749.60 no bid no bid
2 57 1 Each Size 2XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed ol no bid no bid $39.18 $39.18 no bid no bid
2 58 1 Each Size 3XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed ol no bid no bid $39.18 $39.18 no bid no bid
2 59 1 Each Size 4XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed ol no bid no bid $40.88 $40.88 no bid no bid
2 60 1 Each Size 5XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed o no bid no bid $40.88 $40.88 no bid no bid
2 61 1 Each Size 6XL, LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved equivalent) - "ELECTIONS" Printed ol no bid no bid $40.88 $40.88 no bid no bid
2 62 1 Each Sizes S-XL, Carhartt CT104277 Sherpa-Lined Mock Neck Vest (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must | $104.00 $104.00 $78.28 $78.28 $78.00 $78.00
2 63 2 Each Size 2XL, Carhartt CT104277 Sherpa-Lined Mock Neck Vest (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $108.00 $216.00 $78.28 $156.56 $78.00 $156.00
2 64 1 Each Size 3XL, Carhartt CT104277 Sherpa-Lined Mock Neck Vest (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $112.00 $112.00 $86.78 $86.78 $87.75 $87.75
2 65 1 Each Size 4XL, Carhartt CT104277 Sherpa-Lined Mock Neck Vest (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must In $116.00 $116.00 $86.78 $86.78 $87.75 $87.75




2 66 1 Each Size 5XL, Carhartt CT104277 Sherpa-Lined Mock Neck Vest (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Ini $120.00 $120.00 $86.78 $86.78 $87.75 $87.75
2 67 4 Each Sizes XS-XL, Sport-Tek ST259 Full-Zip Sweatshort (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embi $47.00 $188.00 $45.13 $180.52 $33.00 $132.00
2 68 1 Each Size 2XL, Sport-Tek ST259 Full-Zip Sweatshort (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroi $49.00 $49.00 $46.83 $46.83 $34.50 $34.50
2 69 1 Each Size 3XL, Sport-Tek ST259 Full-Zip Sweatshort (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroi $51.00 $51.00 $50.23 $50.23 $37.50 $37.50
2 70 1 Each Size 4XL, Sport-Tek ST259 Full-Zip Sweatshort (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Must Include Embroi $53.00 $53.00 $51.93 $51.93 $39.00 $39.00
2 71 1 Each Sizes XS-XL, Men’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket J705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Col $65.00 $65.00 $65.79 $65.79 $45.90 $45.90
2 72 1 Each Size 2XL, Men’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket J705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin $68.00 $68.00 $67.49 $67.49 $47.40 $47.40
2 73 1 Each Size 3XL, Men’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket J705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin $71.00 $71.00 $70.89 $70.89 $50.40 $50.40
2 74 1 Each Size 4XL, Men’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket J705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin $74.00 $74.00 $72.59 $72.59 $53.40 $53.40
2 75 1 Each Sizes LT-XLT, Men’s Tall Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket TLI705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diam $70.00 $70.00 $69.19 $69.19 $50.95 $50.95
2 76 1 Each Size 2XLT, Men’s Tall Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket TLJ705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diametd $73.00 $73.00 $75.99 $75.99 $54.95 $54.95
2 77 1 Each Size 3XLT, Men'’s Tall Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket TLJ705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diametg $76.00 $76.00 $79.39 $79.39 $57.95 $57.95
2 78 1 Each Size 4XLT, Men'’s Tall Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket TLI705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diametd $79.00 $79.00 $82.79 $82.79 $60.95 $60.95
2 79 1 Each Sizes XS-XL, Women’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket L705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter, $65.00 $65.00 $65.79 $65.79 $45.90 $45.90
2 80 1 Each Size 2XL, Women'’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket L705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Cq $68.00 $68.00 $67.49 $67.49 $47.40 $47.40
2 81 1 Each Size 3XL, Women'’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket L705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Cq $71.00 $71.00 $70.89 $70.89 $50.40 $50.40
2 82 1 Each Size 4XL, Women’s Port Authority Soft Shell Jacket L705 in Black - Must Include Embroidered 2" Diameter Cq $74.00 $74.00 $72.59 $72.59 $53.40 $53.40
2 83 - Percentage |Percentage off Suggested Retail Price of Hoodies, Sweatshirts and Light Jackets not Listed 0.1 10% No Bid No Bid 0.25 25.00%
Category 2 Total $2,562.83 $6,353.86 $1,745.90 $3,776.35
Shared Item Total $2,324.35 $5,403.26 $1,745.90 $3,776.35
Line Items Quoted 47 47 42 42
3 84 6 Each Sizes S-XL, Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved g $140.00 $840.00 $109.99 $659.94 $115.50 $693.00
3 85 3 Each Size 2XL, Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved ed| $148.00 $444.00 $109.99 $329.97 $115.50 $346.50
3 86 1 Each Size 3XL, Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved eq $156.00 $156.00 $119.99 $119.99 $126.00 $126.00
3 87 1 Each Size 4XL, Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved eq no bid no bid $119.99 $119.99 no bid no bid
3 88 1 Each Size 5XL, Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved eq no bid no bid $119.99 $119.99 no bid no bid
3 89 6 Each Sizes M-XL, Carhartt CTT104393 Tall Firm Duck Insulated Bid Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County appr| $160.00 $960.00 $119.99 $719.94 $126.00 $756.00
3 90 3 Each Size 2XL, Carhartt CTT104393 Tall Firm Duck Insulated Bid Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approv| $160.00 $480.00 $119.99 $359.97 $126.00 $378.00
3 91 1 Each Size 3XL, Carhartt CTT104393 Tall Firm Duck Insulated Bid Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approv| $160.00 $160.00 $119.99 $119.99 $126.00 $126.00
3 92 1 Each Size 4XL, Carhartt CTT104393 Tall Firm Duck Insulated Bid Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approv no bid no bid $119.99 $119.99 no bid no bid
3 93 10 Each Sizes S-2XL, Carhartt CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County ap $150.00 $1,500.00 $101.99 $1,019.90 $117.00 $1,170.00
3 94 1 Each Sizes 3XL-5XL, Carhartt CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County $160.00 $160.00 $110.49 $110.49 $126.75 $126.75
3 95 1 Each Sizes (Tall) M-4XL, Carhartt Tall CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt Brown (or Collin| $160.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid $126.75 $126.75
3 96 10 Each Carhartt CT101070 A18 Beanie, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County approved equivalent) $30.00 $300.00 $16.99 $169.90 $21.00 $210.00
3 97 1 Each Size 6, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid No Bid No Bid $29.50 $29.50
3 98 1 Each Size 7, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 99 1 Each Size 8, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 100 1 Each Size 9, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 101 1 Each Size 10, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 102 1 Each Size 11, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 103 1 Each Size 12, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 104 1 Each Size 13, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 105 1 Each Size 14, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 106 1 Each Size 15, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 107 1 Each Size 16, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid $18.49 $18.49 $29.50 $29.50
3 108 1 Each Size 17, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid No Bid No Bid $29.50 $29.50
3 109 1 Each Size 18, Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved equivalent) no bid no bid No Bid No Bid $29.50 $29.50
3 110 - Percentage |Percentage off Suggested Retail Price of Winterwear not Listed 0.1 10% No Bid No Bid 0.25 25%
Category 3 Total $1,474.28 $4,154.96 $1,510.00 $4,442.50
Shared Item Total $929.41 $3,610.09 $999.75 $3,932.25
Line Items Quoted 22 22 24 24
4 111 45 Each Sizes S-XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin $33.00 $1,485.00 $33.99 $1,529.55 $14.25 $641.25
4 112 5 Each Size 2XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Cof $35.00 $175.00 $34.84 $174.20 $15.75 $78.75
4 113 1 Each Size 3XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Co| $37.00 $37.00 $34.84 $34.84 $18.75 $18.75
4 114 1 Each Size 4XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Cof $39.00 $39.00 $34.84 $34.84 $20.25 $20.25
4 115 1 Each Size 5XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Co| $41.00 $41.00 $34.84 $34.84 $23.25 $23.25
4 116 1 Each Size 6XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Cof $43.00 $43.00 $34.84 $34.84 no bid no bid
4 117 1 Each Size 7XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) - Collin Cof $45.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
4 118 45 Each Sizes S-2XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivale $42.00 $1,890.00 No Bid No Bid $18.00 $810.00
4 119 1 Each Size 3XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) $44.00 $44.00 No Bid No Bid $21.75 $21.75
4 120 1 Each Size 4XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) $46.00 $46.00 No Bid No Bid $23.25 $23.25
4 121 1 Each Size 5XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) $48.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid $26.25 $26.25
4 122 1 Each Size 6XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) $50.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
4 123 1 Each Size 7XL, Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) $52.00 $52.00 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
4 124 40 Each Sizes S-2XL, Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Toned Zippered Surveyor Vest (or Collin County appr] $20.00 $800.00 $34.94 $1,397.60 $17.10 $684.00
4 125 40 Each Sizes 3XL-5XL, Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Toned Zippered Surveyor Vest (or Collin County ag $22.00 $880.00 $34.94 $1,397.60 $19.60 $784.00
4 126 40 Each Sizes S-2XL, Cornerstone CSV405 ANSI 107 Class 2 Mesh Back Zippered Safety Vest (or Collin County approvg $20.00 $800.00 $73.87 $2,954.80 $16.90 $676.00
4 127 40 Each Sizes 3XL-4XL, Cornerstone CSV405 ANSI 107 Class 2 Mesh Back Zippered Safety Vest (or Collin County appr $22.00 $880.00 $73.87 $2,954.80 $21.10 $844.00
4 128 26 Each Sizes S-XL, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County ap no bid no bid $61.65 $1,602.90 no bid no bid
4 129 13 Each Size 2XL, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County appi no bid no bid $63.39 $824.07 no bid no bid
a4 130 7 Each Size 3XL, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County app no bid no bid $63.39 $443.73 no bid no bid
4 131 3 Each Size 4XL, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County appi no bid no bid $63.39 $190.17 no bid no bid
4 132 1 Each Size 5XL, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County app no bid no bid $63.39 $63.39 no bid no bid
4 133 1 Each Size LT, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County approf no bid no bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
4 134 1 Each Size 2XLT, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County apg no bid no bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
4 135 1 Each Size 3XLT, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County apyg no bid no bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid




4 136 1 Each Size 4XLT, Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece Liner (or Collin County apg no bid no bid No Bid No Bid | no bid no bid
4 137 - Percentage |Percentage off Suggested Retail Price of Safety Apparel not Listed 0 0% 0.25 25.00%
Category 4 Total $639.00 $7,355.00 $256.20 $4,651.50
Shared Item Total $269.00 $5,137.00 $166.95 $3,770.25
Line Items Quoted 18 18 14 14
5 138 4 Each Sizes XXS-5XL and XLS-2XLT, Cherokee Men’s 38” Lab Coat CK412 - Two (2) Lines of Black Lettering for Nam $78.00 $312.00 no bid no bid
5 139 4 Each Sizes XXS-3XL, Barco Grey’s Anatomy 35” Lab Coat 2402 - Two (2) Lines of Black Lettering for Names and Cr $90.00 $360.00 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
5 140 4 Each Sizes XXS-5XL, Meta Labwear Princess-back 37” Lab Coat - Two (2) Lines of Black Lettering for Names and C| $86.00 $344.00 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
5 141 Percentage |Percentage off Suggested Retail Price of Healthcare Lab Coats not Listed 0.1 10% 0.25 25.00%
Category 5 Total $254.00 $1,016.00 0 0
Line Items Quoted 4 4 1 1
6 142 1 Price/lnch2 New Decal Design and Digitization - Price per Inch® N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 142 ALT1 1 Each Price per Garment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 142 ALT 2 1 Each New Logo of 10,000 Stitches or Less $60.00 $60.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 142 ALT 3 1 Each Digitization Fee for Artwork Change N/A N/A N/A N/A $35.00 $35.00
6 142 ALT 4 1 Each Flat Fee for New Decal Design and Digitization N/A N/A $25.00 $25.00 N/A N/A
6 143 1 Price/Inch2 [New Decal Embroidery - Price per Inch2 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 143 ALT 1 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 6-11 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $8.00 $8.00
6 143 ALT 2 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 12-47 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.00 $5.00
6 143 ALT 3 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 48-71 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $4.50 $4.50
6 143 ALT4 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 71-143 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $4.00 $4.00
6 143 ALT 5 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 144-499 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $3.50 $3.50
6 143 ALT6 1 Each Embroidery per Item for 500 or More pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $3.00 $3.00
6 143 ALT7 1 Each Price per Screen per Logo and Color for Screen Printing N/A N/A N/A N/A $20.00 $20.00
6 143 ALT 8 1 Each Screen Printing Price per Shirt for 24-47 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.60 $5.60
6 143 ALT9 1 Each Screen Printing Price per Shirt for 48-96 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.00 $5.00
6 143 ALT 10 1 Each Screen Printing Price per Shirt for 97-144 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $4.40 $4.40
6 143 ALT 11 1 Each Screen Printing Price per Shirt for 145-288 pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $3.95 $3.95
6 143 ALT 12 1 Each Screen Printing Price per Shirt for 289 or more pieces N/A N/A N/A N/A $3.50 $3.50
Category 6 Total $60.00 $60.00 No Bid No Bid $105.45 $105.45
Line Items Quoted 1 1 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
*Please note that category 6 is for informational purposes only. M um order requirements in category 6 will only apply to the items that are ordered in Categories 1-5 Primary Award Total $1,016.00 Primary Award Total $4,154.96 Primary Award Total $19,954.65
with Minority Authority. Galls and Groovy Designs' embroidery prices are included in their line items, and only new designs and digitizations would result in a separate Secondary Award Total $24,749.00 Secondary Award Total $6,353.86 Secondary Award Total $4,442.50
embroidery fee (Lines 142 ALT 2 and 142 ALT 4). Tertiary Award Total $10,576.00 Tertiary Award Total $30,609.06 Tertiary Award Total $0.00

*Draft Until Award

Category

Description

1

Shirts

Hoodies, Sweatshirts and Light Jackets

Winterwear

Safety Apparel

Healthcare Lab Coats

aoluls|w|~

New Decals




