2024-440 Computers, Peripherals, and

Accessories GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Converge Technology Solutions Summus Industries
Line Description Qty [ltem Price Extended Quote No. | Co-op Contract | Co-op Expiration | Qty|ltem Price Extended Quote No. Co-op Contract | Co-op Expiration | Qty|ltem Price Extended Quote No. Co-op Contract | Co-op Expiration
Dell Optiplex Micro Form Factor
1|Desktop PC 127|Standard - ITEM 210-BKXD $1,457.78| $185,138.06 45546| DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 127 |Dell Optiplex Micro Form Factor 72020 | $1,872.31| $237,783.37 [1041733-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 127 |Dell Optiplex Micro Form Factor 72020 | $1,475.40 | $187,375.80 | 3000181390334.10( DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
5| General Laptop 95 |Dell Latitude 7450 XCTO ITEM 210-BLPR | $2,153.85| $204,615.75 45546| DIR-TS0-3763R |  12/5/2024 95 |Dell Latitude 7450 XCTO $2,699.71 | $256,472.45 |1041734-001 | DIR-TS0-3763-R | 12/5/2024 95 |Dell Latitude 7450 XCTO $2,649.28 | $251,681.60| 3000181328075.10| DIR-TS0-3763 12/5/2024
Dell Latitude 5440 Rugged, CTO ITEM
MDC 210-BCFW LATITUDE 5430 RUGGED Dell Latitude 5440 Rugged, CTO Dell Latitude 5430 with NVIDIA T500
3 66 [WITHOUT GOBI $3,063.74| $202,206.84 45546| DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 66 $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE -- 66 $3,962.98 | $261,556.68 | 3000181390207.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
Dell Latitude 5440 Rugged, CTO ITEM
MDC with GOBI 210-BCFW LATITUDE 5430 RUGGED w/ Dell Latitude 5440 Rugged, CTO Dell Latitude 5430 with NVIDIA T500
4 1 |GOBI $3,086.22| $3,086.22 45546| DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 1 $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 1 $3,962.98 | $3,962.98 3000181326821.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
5 |Flection Laptop 1 [Dell Latitude 3550 CTO ITEM 210-BLRF | $1,389.50 $1,389.50 45546| DIRTSO-3763R |  12/5/2024 1 [Dell Latitude 3550 XCTO $1,598.62 | $1,598.62 [1041735-001 | pIR-Ts0-3763R | 12/5/2024 1 [Dell Latitude 3550 XCTO $1,578.37| $1,578.37 | 3000181331069.10| DIR-Ts0-3763 |  12/5/2024
. Dell Precision 3680 Tower ITEM 210-
g|Dispatch PCs 8 |sLLp $1,779.99| $14,239.92 45546 DIRTS03763R | 12/5/2024 8 |Dell Precision 3680 Tower $1,975.34 | $15,802.72 |1041738-001 | DIR-TS0-3763-R | 12/5/2024 8 |Dell Precision 3680 Tower $2,160.51 | $17,284.08 | 3000181326834.10| DIR-TSO-3763 |  12/5/2024
Dell Mobile Precision Workstation 7680 Dell Mobile Precision Workstation Dell Mobile Precision Workstation
7| IS Laptops 6 |CTO-ITEM 210-BGNT $3,146.13| $18,876.78 45546 DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 6 |7680cCTO $3,558.28 | $21,349.68 |1041739-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 6 |7680cCTO $3,462.60 | $20,775.60 | 3000181326850.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
8|24" Monitors 532|Dell 24" Monitors $117.64| $62,584.48 45546 DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 532|Dell 24" Monitors $131.50 | $69,958.00 |1041743-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 532|24" Monitors $125.12| $66,563.84 | 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
. . . . DIR-TSO-3763-R . . . .
9[Optiplex Micro AIO Stand - MFS22 127 | Dell Optiplex Micro AlO Stand - MFS22 $84.77| $10,765.79 45546 12/5/2024 127 [Dell Optiplex Micro AIO Stand - MFS22 | $94.32 $11,978.64 (1042031-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 127 |Optiplex Micro AIO Stand - MFS22 $94.24| $11,968.48 | 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media
10|Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard English Black 95 [Keyboard English Black $14.60| $1,387.00 45546 DIRTSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 |Keyboard English Black $18.00 $1,710.00 |1042036-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 |Keyboard English Black $18.12| $1,721.40 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
11|Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black 95 |Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black $14.60| $1,387.00 45546 DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 |Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black $18.00 $1,710.00 |1042038-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 |Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black $18.12| $1,721.40 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
. . DIR-TSO-3763-R . . .
12|Dock - WD19S with 130W Adapter 96 [Dell Dock - WD19S with 130W Adapter $158.76| $15,240.96 45546 12/5/2024 96|Dell Dock - WD19S with 130W Adapter $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 96|Dell Dock - WD19S with 130W Adapter $176.24| $16,919.04 | 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
13|Dock - WD19DC 6|Dell Dock - WD19DC $371.34| $2,228.04 45546 DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 6|Dell Dock - WD19DC $143.95 $863.70 |1042039-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 6|Dell Dock - WD19DC $317.24| $1,903.44 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
Dell Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell Dell Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell Havis Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell
14|Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell Latitude 5430 66 [Latitude 5430 $662.31| $43,712.46 45546| DIR-CPO-4751 3/14/2026 66 [Latitude 5430 $879.12 | $58,021.92 |1042040-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 66 [Latitude 5430 $859.14| $56,703.24 | 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Individual Power Switches and Sabrent 4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Sabrent 4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Sabrent 4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with
15|LEDs 140(Individual Power Switches and LEDs $9.99| $1,398.60 45546| TIPS 230105 5/31/2028 140|Individual Power Switches and LEDs $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 140(Individual Power Switches and LEDs $30.95| $4,333.00 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
16|Ecoloop Pro Backpack 95 [Dell EcoLoop Pro Backpack $40.75| $3,871.25 45546| DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 [Dell EcoLoop Pro Backpack $54.26 $5,154.70 |1042041-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 95 [EcoLoop Pro Backpack $54.37| $5,165.15 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
Targus Rolling Laptop Case or Collin Targus Rolling Laptop Case or Collin Targus Rolling Laptop Case or Collin
17|Targus Rolling Laptop Case or Collin County approved equal 1|County approved equal $80.74 $80.74 45546| DIR-CPO-5097 11/21/2027 1|County approved equal $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 1|County approved equal $0.00 $0.00 3000181326874.10|NO QUOTE -
Havis Notebook docking station handle Havis Notebook docking station handle Havis Notebook docking station handle
18|Notebook docking station handle mounting kit for Dell 1|mounting kit for Dell $56.09 $56.09 45546| DIR-CPO-4751 3/14/2026 1|mounting kit for Dell $73.03 $73.03  [1042043-001 | DIR-TSO-3763-R 12/5/2024 1|mounting kit for Dell $71.37 $71.37 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
J5 or Approved Replacement - USB 3.0 J5 or Approved Replacement - USB 3.0
19|USB 3.0 SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub 1|SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub $49.27 $49.27 45546| DIR-CPO-5097 11/21/2027 1|SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 1|USB 3.0 SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub $84.37 $84.37 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
Tripp Lite 6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB B Tripp Lite 6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB Tripp Lite 6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB
20|6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB B Cable Coiled - USB A-B M/M 6 1|Cable Coiled - USB A-B M/M 6 $2.48 $2.48 45546| DIR-CPO-5097 11/21/2027 1B Cable Coiled - USB A-B M/M 6 $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 1B Cable Coiled - USB A-B M/M 6 $9.45 $9.45 3000181326874.10| DIR-TSO-3763 12/5/2024
21|QL-800 Label Printer 1|Brother QL-800 Label Printer $109.17| $109.17 45546| DIR-CPO-4410 11/20/2024 1|Brother QL-800 Label Printer $0.00 $0.00 no bid NO QUOTE - 1|Brother QL-800 Label Printer $0.00 $0.00 3000181326874.10(NO QUOTE -
***Draft until award TOTAL| $772,426.40 TOTAL $682,476.83 TOTAL $911,379.29

CDW-G submitted response of No Bid
ReDesign Group submitted response of No Bid

SCW was deemed non responsive

$550,252.12 Total without NO BID items from vendor 2




