
 2025-072 OEM Toner, Ink Cartridges, and Supplies for Printers

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

1

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
2 Lexmark 74C1SK0 205 $112.52 $23,066.60 $173.99 $35,667.95 $168.50 $34,542.50 $139.95 $28,689.75 $131.82 $27,023.10
3 Lexmark 71C10K0 200 $89.00 $17,800.00 $121.79 $24,358.00 $117.07 $23,414.00 $109.95 $21,990.00 $146.21 $29,242.00
4 Lexmark 50F1H00 190 $116.25 $22,087.50 $164.03 $31,165.70 $157.18 $29,864.20 $89.95 $17,090.50 $142.05 $26,989.50
5 Lexmark 74C10Y0 140 $78.53 $10,994.20 $121.79 $17,050.60 $117.59 $16,462.60 $109.95 $15,393.00 $92.00 $12,880.00
6 Lexmark 74C10M0 135 $78.53 $10,601.55 $121.79 $16,441.65 $117.59 $15,874.65 $109.95 $14,843.25 $92.00 $12,420.00
7 Lexmark 71C10Y0 135 $135.00 $18,225.00 $194.87 $26,307.45 $117.59 $15,874.65 $169.95 $22,943.25 $236.95 $31,988.25
8 Lexmark 52D1H00 135 $326.00 $44,010.00 $459.22 $61,994.70 $440.51 $59,468.85 $199.95 $26,993.25 $398.11 $53,744.85
9 Lexmark 74C10C0 130 $78.53 $10,208.90 $122.72 $15,953.60 $117.59 $15,286.70 $109.95 $14,293.50 $92.00 $11,960.00

10 Lexmark 71C10M0 130 $135.00 $17,550.00 $194.92 $25,339.60 $186.78 $24,281.40 $169.95 $22,093.50 $236.91 $30,798.30
11 Lexmark 71C10C0 125 $135.00 $16,875.00 $194.71 $24,338.75 $186.78 $23,347.50 $169.95 $21,243.75 $233.99 $29,248.75
12 Lexmark 70C1HK0 125 $68.15 $8,518.75 $111.80 $13,975.00 $107.13 $13,391.25 $99.95 $12,493.75 $83.81 $10,476.25
13 Lexmark 78C1XK0 100 $102.67 $10,267.00 $159.20 $15,920.00 $153.74 $15,374.00 $134.95 $13,495.00 $120.28 $12,028.00
14 Lexmark 78C1XM0 80 $126.13 $10,090.40 $194.87 $15,589.60 $188.85 $15,108.00 $159.95 $12,796.00 $147.75 $11,820.00
15 Lexmark 78C1XY0 80 $126.13 $10,090.40 $194.87 $15,589.60 $188.85 $15,108.00 $159.95 $12,796.00 $147.75 $11,820.00
16 Lexmark 58D1H00 75 $181.71 $13,628.25 $243.89 $18,291.75 $233.96 $17,547.00 $189.95 $14,246.25 $211.44 $15,858.00

Subtotal $244,013.55 Subtotal $357,983.95 Subtotal $334,945.30 Subtotal $271,400.75 Subtotal $328,297.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

17

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
18 Lexmark C734X20G 110 $25.34 $2,787.40 $41.52 $4,567.20 $39.83 $4,381.30 $39.95 $4,394.50 $45.32 $4,985.20
19 Lexmark 52D0Z00 40 $36.77 $1,470.80 $51.82 $2,072.80 $49.72 $1,988.80 $59.95 $2,398.00 $44.93 $1,797.20
20 Lexmark 41X0252 30 $308.96 $9,268.80 $456.64 $13,699.20 $440.34 $13,210.20 $469.95 $14,098.50 $473.99 $14,219.70
21 Lexmark C540X75G 25 $6.77 $169.25 $11.56 $289.00 $10.63 $265.75 $17.95 $448.75 $8.32 $208.00
22 Lexmark 74C0W00 25 $16.40 $410.00 $25.60 $640.00 $24.55 $613.75 $34.95 $873.75 $29.87 $746.75
23 Lexmark 40X8420 25 $210.09 $5,252.25 $274.95 $6,873.75 $266.62 $6,665.50 $299.95 $7,498.75 $327.96 $8,199.00

Subtotal $19,358.50 Subtotal $28,141.95 Subtotal $27,125.30 Subtotal $29,712.25 Subtotal $30,155.85

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

24

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
25 HP CF361A 5 $145.36 $726.80 $218.20 $1,091.00 $209.56 $1,047.80 $199.95 $999.75 $181.45 $907.25
26 HP CF363A 5 $145.36 $726.80 $218.20 $1,091.00 $209.56 $1,047.80 $199.95 $999.75 $181.45 $907.25
27 HP CF362A 5 $145.36 $726.80 $218.20 $1,091.00 $209.56 $1,047.80 $199.95 $999.75 $181.45 $907.25
28 HP CF287X 2 $154.70 $309.40 $329.02 $658.04 $315.98 $631.96 $279.95 $559.90 $260.12 $520.24
29 HP W2110X 2 $66.52 $133.04 $96.23 $192.46 $95.18 $190.36 $89.95 $179.90 $99.32 $198.64

Subtotal $2,622.84 Subtotal $4,123.50 Subtotal $3,965.72 Subtotal $3,739.05 Subtotal $3,440.63

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

30

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
31 HP C2P05AN#140 15 $35.02 $525.30 $46.91 $703.65 $45.05 $675.75 $54.95 $824.25 $35.35 $530.25
32 HP C2P07AN#140 15 $36.37 $545.55 $48.73 $730.95 $45.05 $675.75 $54.95 $824.25 $38.44 $576.60
33 HP F6U19AN#140 15 $39.85 $597.75 $53.34 $800.10 $51.22 $768.30 $59.95 $899.25 $45.99 $689.85
34 HP P2V71A 10 $129.50 $1,295.00 $155.80 $1,558.00 $149.62 $1,496.20 $159.95 $1,599.50 $199.79 $1,997.90
35 HP L0S55AN#140 10 $17.64 $176.40 $22.90 $229.00 $22.65 $226.50 $29.95 $299.50 $18.28 $182.80
36 HP P2V72A 10 $129.42 $1,294.20 $155.80 $1,558.00 $149.62 $1,496.20 $159.95 $1,599.50 $197.49 $1,974.90
37 HP T6M14AN#140 5 $35.02 $175.10 $46.91 $234.55 $45.05 $225.25 $54.95 $274.75 $38.93 $194.65

Subtotal $4,609.30 Subtotal $5,814.25 Subtotal $5,563.95 Subtotal $6,321.00 Subtotal $6,146.95

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

38

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
39 HP P2V27A 5 $90.28 $451.40 $107.04 $535.20 $103.57 $517.85 $114.95 $574.75 $140.49 $702.45
40 HP F2G76A 2 $289.21 $578.42 $351.55 $703.10 $340.19 $680.38 $364.95 $729.90 $395.69 $791.38
41 HP C9384A 1 $75.61 $75.61 $91.99 $91.99 $87.38 $87.38 $99.95 $99.95 $69.13 $69.13
42 HP C9380A 1 $75.61 $75.61 $91.99 $91.99 $87.38 $87.38 $99.95 $99.95 $69.13 $69.13

Subtotal $1,181.04 Subtotal $1,422.28 Subtotal $1,372.99 Subtotal $1,504.55 Subtotal $1,632.09

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

43

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
44 OKI DATA 45536516 3 $168.00 $504.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 OKI DATA 45536515 3 $318.00 $954.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 OKI DATA 45536514 3 $318.00 $954.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 OKI DATA 45536513 3 $318.00 $954.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Subtotal $3,366.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Sample Pricing Bid Tabulation

Percent Discount Off All Lexmark Toner Cartridges
Line 

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. Dba 
World Wide Imaging Supplies

BuyBoard 707-23
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Zapopan Busines Group LLC. Dba 
World Wide Imaging Supplies

BuyBoard 707-23

Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Yellow Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark MS821, 823, 825, MS/MX725, 822, 826 Return Program 15K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 811, 812 Return Program 25K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Cyan Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge

  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Magenta Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Cyan Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark CS310, CS/CX410, 510 Black Return Program 4K Toner Cartridge 
Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Black Return Program 8.5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Black Return Program 7K Toner Cartridge
  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Black Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark MS/MX310, 312, 315, 410, 415, 510, 511, 610, 611 Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Yellow Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Magenta Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge
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13%

Percent Discount Off All HP Ink Cartridges

TIPS 230105

GovConnection, Inc.

HP 952 Yellow Original Ink Cartridge
HP 730 300-ml Gray DesignJet Ink Cartridge
HP 902XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge

HP 62XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge
HP 62XL High Yield Tri-color Original Ink Cartridge
HP 952XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge 
HP 730 300-ml Matte Black DesignJet Ink Cartridge

NO BID

GovConnection, Inc.
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Lexmark C/X73x, 74x 1-Pack 20K Photoconductor Kit
Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 812, MS811, 817, 818, MX717, 718 Return Program 100K Imaging Unit
Lexmark Fuser 110-120V, Type 00 
Lexmark C54x, X54x 18K Waste Container
Lexmark CS720, 728, CS/CX725, 727, C4150, XC4140, 4150 90K Waste Container

Percent Discount Off All Other Lexmark Supplies (excludes toners)

Lexmark MS81x, MX71x, MX81x Return Program Fuser Maintenance Kit 

Percent Discount Off All HP Toner Cartridges

HP 206X High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge 

TIPS 230105

HP 508A Cyan Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
HP 508A Magenta Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
HP 508A Yellow Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
HP 87X High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
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Co-op Contract
Term Ends

48

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
49 OKI DATA 45531502 1 $33.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 OKI DATA 45103728 1 $275.00 $275.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 OKI DATA 45103727 1 $425.00 $425.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 OKI DATA 45531112 1 $475.00 $475.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Subtotal $1,208.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

53

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
54 Brother TN431BK 5 $68.28 $341.40 $76.46 $382.30 $74.28 $371.40 $89.95 $449.75 $81.10 $405.50
55 Brother TN433C 5 $115.23 $576.15 $129.05 $645.25 $125.37 $626.85 $139.95 $699.75 $132.85 $664.25
56 Brother TN433M 5 $115.23 $576.15 $129.05 $645.25 $125.37 $626.85 $139.95 $699.75 $132.53 $662.65
57 Brother TN433Y 5 $115.23 $576.15 $129.05 $645.25 $125.37 $626.85 $139.95 $699.75 $133.27 $666.35

Subtotal $2,069.85 Subtotal $2,318.05 Subtotal $2,251.95 Subtotal $2,549.00 Subtotal $2,398.75

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

58

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated Annual 

Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
59 Brother DR431CL 2 $128.04 $256.08 $143.38 $286.76 $139.28 $278.56 $139.95 $279.90 $97.18 $194.36
60 Brother WT320CL 1 $20.91 $20.91 $22.15 $22.15 $21.45 $21.45 $29.95 $29.95 $28.92 $28.92

Subtotal $276.99 Subtotal $308.91 Subtotal $300.01 Subtotal $309.85 Subtotal $223.28

*Draft until award Total $278,706.07 Total $400,112.89 Total $375,525.22 Total $315,536.45 Total $372,294.55
CDW-G email of No-Bid
Perry email of No-Bid  
 
 
Primary Award
Secondary Award
Tertiary Award

Brother DR431CL Drum Unit
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Line

Category VIII - Brother Toner Cartridges

Line

Category IX - Other Brother Supplies
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Brother TN433C High Yield Toner, Cyan, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages

OKI DATA C931E Waste Toner Container
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Brother TN433M High Yield Toner, Magenta, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages
Brother TN433Y High Yield Toner, Yellow, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages
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Brother TN431BK Standard Yield Toner, Black, Yields Approx 3,000 Pages
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