Prindle, Inc. Richardson Saw and Lawnmower Company

IFB 2025-024: Grounds Maintenance Equipment JHouston Holdings LLC dba LSM Outdoor Power
Line Item Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Echo Cultivator/Till Part No. TC210 or Collin County
1 approved Equivalent. 1 Each $359.00 $359.00 $319.99 $319.99 $319.99 $319.99
Still FC111 Edger or Collin County approved
2 Equivalent. 3 Each $521.99 $1,565.97 $463.99 $1,391.97 $463.99 $1,391.97
Scag Turf Tiger 61" with Kawasaki Engine or Collin
3 County approved Equivalent. 1 Each $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $15,989.00 $15,989.00 $16,399.00 $16,399.00
Stihl BR430 Backpack Blower or Collin County
4 approved Equivalent. 3 Each $409.99 $1,229.97 $359.99 $1,079.97 $359.99 $1,079.97
Kifco B140 with 5.5Hp Reel Mounted Booster Pump
and
Sime Hidra Sprinkler or Collin County approved
5 Equivalent. 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dakota Turftender 410, mounted option or Collin
6 County approved Equivalent. 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
John Deere Model 1600 128" Riding Mower or Collin
7 County approved Equivalent. 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stihl BG-86 Blower or Collin County approved
8 Equivalent. 1 Each $269.99 $269.99 $239.99 $239.99 $239.99 $239.99
Stihl String Trimmer FS-131R or Collin County
9 approved Equivalent. 10 Each $576.99 $5,769.90 $423.99 $4,239.90 $423.99 $4,239.90
Stihl HT135 Pole Pruner or Collin County approved
10 Equivalent. 2 Each $719.99 $1,439.98 $639.99 $1,279.98 $639.99 $1,279.98
Billy Goat BC2601HHC Outback Brush Cutter with
11 Honda Engine or Collin County approved Equivalent. 3 Each $4,989.60 $14,968.80 $4,158.00 $12,474.00 $4,300.00 $12,900.00
Scag 61" SWZT-61H-22FSE Hydro-Walk Behind or
12 Collin County approved Equivalent. 2 Each $6,399.00 $12,798.00 $6,239.00 $12,478.00 $6,239.00 $12,478.00
Scag 72" STTII-72V-38CH-EFI with Kohler engine or
13 Collin County approved Equivalent. 2 Each $14,799.00 $29,598.00 $14,819.00 $29,638.00 $14,819.00 $29,638.00
Stanley CS28811 Hydraulic Pole Chain Saw or Collin
14 County approved Equivalent. 1 Each $1,999.00 $1,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*Draft Until Award
Total $83,998.61 Total $79,130.80 Total $79,966.80

Award
Tie to be Determined by Commissioners Court



