IFB 2025-093 Road Striping and Pavement Marking Materials

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

SECTION I. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (HAND | Alderink Enterprises, | Tommy G. Rose dba
WORK) Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Quantity | Unit of Measure |Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1.1 |4" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.00 $1.00
1.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.00 $1.00
1.3 6" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.35 $1.35
1.4 |6" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.35 $1.35
1.5 8" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.50 $1.50
1.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.70 $1.70
1.7 12" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.00 $5.00
1.8 18" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00
1.9 |24" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00 $7.00
1.1 Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00 $165.00
1.11 |Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $245.00 $245.00
1.12 |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00 $40.00
1.13  |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA NO BID NOBID |NOBID NO BID $50.00  $50.00
1.14 |Word (White) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 $195.00
1.15 |Symbol (White) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $275.00 $275.00
1.16 |4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.00 $1.00
1.17 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.00 $1.00
1.18 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.70 $1.70
1.19 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.00 $5.00
1.2 |24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00 $7.00
1.21 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.00 $2.00
1.22 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $3.00

Preformed In-Lane (TRANS) Rumble
1.23 |Strip 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 $25.00

Total SECTION | $1,041.60

SECTION IIl. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG-| Alderink Enterprises,
LINE) (CITY) Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Unit Cost |Total Unit Cost

2.1 4" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
2.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
2.3 |6" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.80 $.80
2.4 6" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.80 $.80
2.5 8" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.90 $.90
2.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.90 $.90
2.7 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S.65 S.65
2.8 |4"Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
2.9 |8"Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.90 $.90
2.1 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.25 $1.25
2.11 |6" Shadow, Black 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.75 $1.75

Total SECTION II $9.90

SECTION IIl. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG Alderink Enterprises,
LINE) (RURAL) Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.




Quantiy Junit o Wezsurelunit Cox Un-tCost Uthost

4" Broken, White NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
3.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S.65 S.65
3.3 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
3.4 |4"Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $.65 $.65
Total SECTION Il $2.60

Alderink Enterprises,
SECTION IV. PAINT (TYPE Il) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND WORK) Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Unit Cost Unit Cost

4" Broken, White $.50 S$.50 $.39 $.39 $.70 $.70
4.2 4" Solid, White l LF $.50 $.50 $.49 $.49 $.70 $.70
4.3 6" Broken, White 1 LF S$.60 S$.60 S.61 S.61 $.80 $.80
4.4 6" Solid, White 1 LF $.60 $.60 $.66 $.66 $.80 $.80
4.5 8" Broken, White 1 LF $.70 $.70 $.82 $.82 $.90 $.90
4.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF S.70 $.70 $.72 $.72 $.90 $.90
4.7 12" Solid, White 1 LF $.80 $.80 $2.20 $2.20 $3.00 $3.00
4.8 18" Solid, White 1 LF $.90 $.90 $3.30 $3.30 $3.50 $3.50
4.9 24" Solid, White 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $4.40 $4.40 $4.00 $4.00
4.1 Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA $110.000 $110.00 $61.00 $61.00 $85.00 $85.00
4.11 |Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA $120.00/ $120.00 $110.00/ $110.00 $110.00 $110.00
4.12 |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA $25.000  $25.00 $33.000 $33.00 $20.00,  $20.00
4.13 |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA $30.00,  $30.00 $44.00 $44.00 $30.00  $30.00
4.14 |Word (White) 1 EA $64.00 $64.00 $137.00/ $137.00 $100.00 $100.00
4.15 |Symbol (White) 1 EA $64.00 $64.00 $330.00/ $330.00 $150.00 $150.00
4,16 |Stenciled Lettering (Parking Space) 1 EA $13.00 $13.00 $27.50 $27.50 $35.00 $35.00
4.17 |4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF $.50 S$.50 $.39 $.39 $.70 $.70
4.18 |4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $.50 $.50 $.49 $.49 $.70 $.70
4.19 |8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $.70 $.70 $.83 $.83 $.80 $.80
4.2 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $.80 $.80 $2.20 $2.20 $3.00 $3.00
421 |24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $4.40 $4.40 $4.00 $4.00
4.22 |4" Shadow, Black 1 LF $.80 $.80 $3.30 $3.30 $1.00 $1.00
4.23 |6" Shadow, Black 1 LF $.90 S.90 $3.30 $3.30 $1.50 $1.50
4.24 6" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane) 1 EA S.64 S.64 $1.10 $1.10 $1.25 $1.25
12" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane
4.25 |Curb) 1 EA S.84 $.84 $2.20 $2.20 $2.50 $2.50
Handicap Pad (6'x6’ Max. Blue w/
4.26 |White Symbol) 1 EA $32.00 $32.00 $137.00/ $137.00 $125.00 $125.00
Total SECTION IV $470.98 $911.30 $685.75

Alderink Enterprises,
SECTION V. PAINT (TYPE Il) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (CITY) Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

5.1 |4" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.39 $.39 $.50 $.50
5.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.50 $.50 $.50 $.50
5.3 |6" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.62 $.62 $.60 $.60
5.4 6" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.67 $.67 $.60 $.60
5.5 8" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.83 $.83 $.70 $.70
5.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.72 $.72 $.70 $.70
5.7 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.39 $.39 $.50 $.50
5.8 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.50 $.50 $.50 $.50
5.9 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.75 S.75 $.70 $.70
5.1 |4" Shadow, Black 1 LF NO BID NO BID $3.30 $3.30 $1.00 $1.00



5.11

SECTION VI. PAINT (TYPE Il) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (RURAL)

6" Shadow, Black
Total SECTION V

LF

NO BID

NO BID

Alderink Enterprises,

Inc - Cl Pavement

Quantity | Unit of Measure |Unit Cost

$3.30

$3.30
$11.97

Rose Contracting

Unit Cost

$1.00

$1.00
$7.30

Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

6.1 |4" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID $.40 $.40 $.50 $.50
6.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID S$.50 $.50 $.50 $.50
6.3 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID S$.40 S$.40 $.50 $.50
6.4 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID S$.50 $.50 $.50 $.50

Total SECTION VI $1.80 $2.00

SECTION VII. METHYL METHACRYLATE (MMA) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND | Alderink Enterprises,

WORK) Inc. - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Line Item|Description Quantity | Unit of Measure |Unit Cost

7.1  |4" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.2 4" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.3 6" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.4 6" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.5 |8" Broken, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.6 8" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.7 12" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.8 18" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.9 |24" Solid, White 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.1  |Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.11  |Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.12 |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.13 |Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.14  |Word (White) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.15 |Symbol (White) 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.16 |4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.17 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.18 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.19 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
7.2 24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID

NO AWARD SECTION VII

Alderink Enterprises,
SECTION VIIl. REMOVAL OF PAVEMENT MARKINGS MARKERS Inc - Cl Pavement

Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Quantity | Unit of Measure |Unit Cost Unit Cost

Unit Cost

8.1 4" Line, Broken 1 LF $1.00 $1.00/NO BID NO BID $.80 $.80
8.2 4" Line, Solid 1 LF $1.00 $1.00/NO BID NO BID $.80 $.80
8.3 6" Line 1 LF $1.00 $1.00/NO BID NO BID $.80 $.80
8.4 8" Line 1 LF $1.25 $1.25|NO BID NO BID $.90 $.90
8.5 10" Line 1 LF $1.50 $1.50/NO BID NO BID $2.00 $2.00
8.6 12" Line 1 LF $2.00 $2.00/NO BID NO BID $2.00 $2.00
8.7 18" Line 1 LF $2.25 $2.25|NO BID NO BID $2.75 $2.75
8.8 24" Line 1 LF $3.00 $3.00/NO BID NO BID $3.50 $3.50
8.9 Arrow 1 EA $50.00 $50.00/NO BID NO BID $80.00 $80.00
8.1 Word 1 EA $75.00 $75.00/NO BID NO BID $90.00 $90.00
8.11 Symbol 1 EA $75.00 $75.00/NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00
8.12 |Miscellaneous Markings 1 EA $75.00 $75.00/NO BID NO BID $3.00 $3.00



8.13 |[Traffic Button / RPM 1 EA $4.00 $4.00/NO BID NO BID $2.50 $2.50
Total SECTION VIII $292.00 $289.05

Alderink Enterprises,
SECTION IX. REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS Inc - Cl Pavement Rose Contracting Stripe-A-Zone, LLC.

Line Item|Description
Type I-A, 1-Way Amber Refl Pvmt

9.1 |Marker 1 EA NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50

9.2 |Type I-C, 1-Way Clear Refl Pvmt 1 EA NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50
Type II-A-A, 2-Way Amber Refl Pvmt

9.3 |Marker 1 EA NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50

9.4 |Pvmt Marker 1 EA NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50
Type 1I-C-R, 2-Way Clear / Red Refl

9.5 Pvmt Marker 1 EA NO BID NO BID $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50
Type |I-B-B, 2-Way Blue Refl Pvmt

9.6 |Marker 1 EA NO BID NO BID $12.00 $12.00 $13.00 $13.00
Traffic Button, Non-reflective, Round

9.7 (Type W) 1 EA NO BID NO BID $5.00 $5.00 $4.50 $4.50
Traffic Button, Non-Reflective, Round

9.8 (Type Y) 1 EA NO BID NO BID $5.00 $5.00 $4.50 $4.50

Total SECTION IX $52.00 $49.50



