

2025-169 Dell EMC Maintenance - BD5300

		GovConnection, Inc.			Unique Digital Technology, LLC		
	Coop	Open Market			DIR		
	Contract Number	--			DIR-CPO-5792		
	Contract Expiration	--			4/4/2027		
	Quote Date	4/8/2025			4/29/2025		
	Quote Expiration	5/8/2025			5/21/2025		
	Quote No.	25748293			Multiple		
		Qty	Price	Extended	Qty	Price	Extended
Dell EMC - ElasticSearch RackMount Servers		1	\$31,695.23	\$31,695.23	1	\$18,740.26	\$18,740.26
Dell EMC - Isilon and VXRail		1	\$60,510.03	\$60,510.03	1	\$48,750.95	\$48,750.95
Dell EMC - EMC Only NoVMW		1	\$311,176.59	\$311,176.59	1	\$331,207.93	\$331,207.93
* Draft until award		TOTAL		\$403,381.85	TOTAL		\$398,699.14

Waypoint Business Solutions, LLC- No Bid

Summus - No Bid

UDT - No Bid

1- ELASTICSEARCH RACKMOUNT SERVERS

Customer Information	
Company Name:	COLLIN COUNTY
Dell Customer # :	35922708
Contract Code # :	C00000006841

VENDOR	GovConnection, Inc	Unique Digital Technology, LLC
Coop	Open Market	DIR
Contract Number	--	DIR-CPO-5792
Contract Expiration	--	4/4/2027
Quote Date	4/8/2025	4/29/2025
Quote Expiration	5/8/2025	5/21/2025
Quote No.		QUO-UD032952

Dell Extended Services Details														
Current Equipment Information								Extended Service Information						
Asset	Service Tag #	Serial Number / Asset ID	SKU #	Model	Service Contract Type	Ship Date	Service Contract Expiration	Service Contract Type	Service Contract Description	New Contract End Date	Quantity			
Service Tag	3L37343	CN0JFH7FCT0005M00AA	862-BBHQ	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	7/10/2020	6/3/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		PRICE	EXTENDED
Service Tag	3L35343	CN0JFH7FCT0005M00FV	862-BBHQ	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	7/10/2020	6/3/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,518.08	\$1,518.08
Service Tag	3L36343	CN0JFH7FCT0005M00AB	862-BBHQ	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	7/10/2020	6/3/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,518.08	\$1,518.08
Service Tag	3GZ7343	CN0K6YWCLOG0003Q01TG	862-BBHQ	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	7/15/2020	6/3/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$2,052.97	\$2,052.97
Service Tag	3GZ8343	CN0K6YWCLOG0003Q01N8	862-BBHQ	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	7/15/2020	6/3/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$2,052.97	\$2,052.97
Service Tag	FQLDBZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PQ	813-6130	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$820.95	\$820.95
Service Tag	FQLDBZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PQ	926-0476	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,232.04	\$1,232.04
Service Tag	FQM5BZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PM	813-6130	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$820.95	\$820.95
Service Tag	FQM5BZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PM	926-0476	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,232.04	\$1,232.04
Service Tag	FQM4BZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PK	813-6130	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$820.95	\$820.95
Service Tag	FQM4BZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PK	926-0476	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,232.04	\$1,232.04
Service Tag	FQLCBZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PE	813-6130	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$820.95	\$820.95
Service Tag	FQLCBZ2	CN0K6YWCLOG0097D01PE	926-0476	PowerEdge R740xd Upgrades and Extensions	8H + PSPMC	10/2/2019	11/7/2024	8H + PSPMC	8HR 7x24 + ProSupport Mission Critical	6/4/2026	1		\$1,232.04	\$1,232.04
	CMXWKQ3			PowerEdge R740			7/3/2025			6/4/2026	1		\$2,029.02	\$2,029.02
	7VGZTH3			PowerEdge R440			10/9/2025			6/4/2026	1		\$786.27	\$786.27
	71NXYS3			PowerEdge T350			11/2/2025			6/4/2026	1		\$330.26	\$330.26
	61NXYS3			PowerEdge T350			11/2/2025			6/4/2026	1		\$330.26	\$330.26
	9YDW2L3			PowerEdge R740XD			12/16/2025			6/4/2026	1		\$3,079.74	\$3,079.74
	4G2NBW3			PowerEdge R640			3/9/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,518.08	\$1,518.08
	51TSDX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
	41TSDX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
	5TQ5DX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
	61TSDX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
	6TQ5DX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
	7TQ5DX3			PowerEdge R650			5/31/2026			6/4/2026	1		\$1,124.91	\$1,124.91
**Draft Until Award													TOTAL	TOTAL
Waypoint Business Solutions, LLC - No Bid													\$31,695.23	\$ 18,740.26
Summary - No Bid													TOTAL	\$
UOT - No Bid														
Netsync - No Response														

2- ISILON AND VXRAIL DELL

Company Name:	COLLIN COUNTY
Dell Customer # :	530019547880
Contract Code # :	C00000006679

DELL EXTENDED SERVICES DETAILS											--		4/4/2027			
Current Equipment Information											Extended Service Information				4/8/2025	4/29/2025
															5/8/2025	5/21/2025
															25748293.01	QUO-UDIO32888
Asset	Service Tag #	Serial Number / Asset ID	SKU #	Model	Service Contract Type	Ship Date	Service Contract Expiration	Service Contract Type	Service Contract Description	Quantity	PRICE	EXTENDED	PRICE	EXTENDED		
Service Tag	HJ00643	JACNN195120122	886-9849	Isilon Chassis Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 423.33	\$ 423.33	\$ 253.05	\$ 253.05		
Service Tag	HJ00643	JACNN195120122	886-9851	Isilon Chassis Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 282.22	\$ 282.22	\$ 380.66	\$ 380.66		
Service Tag	BD7KPK2	TW0086KKGNDG0008A0491	886-9917	Dell Networking Switches Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/5/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 636.68	\$ 636.68	\$ 370.01	\$ 370.01		
Service Tag	BD7KPK2	TW0086KKGNDG0008A0491	886-9919	Dell Networking Switches Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/5/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 424.45	\$ 424.45	\$ 555.01	\$ 555.01		
Service Tag	5D7KPK2	TW0086KKGNDG0008A0491	886-9917	Dell Networking Switches Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/5/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 636.68	\$ 636.68	\$ 370.01	\$ 370.01		
Service Tag	5D7KPK2	TW0086KKGNDG0008A0491	886-9919	Dell Networking Switches Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/5/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 424.45	\$ 424.45	\$ 555.02	\$ 555.02		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5079	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	2	ProSupport OneFS Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 965.95	\$ 965.95		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-4772	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport OneFS Capacity Software Support-Maintenance 1 Year	60	\$ 724.37	\$ 724.37	\$ 10.82	\$ 649.20		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5115	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	70	ProSupport SmartQuotas Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 91.39	\$ 91.39	\$ 86.05	\$ 86.05		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5135	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	01	ProSupport HDFS for OneFS Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 224.63	\$ 224.63	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5107	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	56	ProSupport SmartConnect Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ 211.49	\$ 211.49		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5119	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	80	ProSupport SmartDedupe Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 327.34	\$ 327.34	\$ 308.18	\$ 308.18		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9845	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 786.56	\$ 786.56		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9847	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 1,530.02	\$ 1,530.02	\$ 1,179.83	\$ 1,179.83		
Service Tag	3K00643	JACNN195120122	891-4023	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport 4-Hour 7X24 Onsite Capacity Add On Per Terabyte	60	\$ 1,031.15	\$ 1,031.15	\$ 13.24	\$ 794.40		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5079	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	2	ProSupport OneFS Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 965.95	\$ 965.95		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-4772	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport OneFS Capacity Software Support-Maintenance 1 Year	60	\$ 724.37	\$ 724.37	\$ 10.82	\$ 649.20		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5115	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	70	ProSupport SmartQuotas Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 91.39	\$ 91.39	\$ 86.05	\$ 86.05		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5135	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	01	ProSupport HDFS for OneFS Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 224.63	\$ 224.63	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5107	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	56	ProSupport SmartConnect Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ 211.49	\$ 211.49		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5119	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	80	ProSupport SmartDedupe Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 327.34	\$ 327.34	\$ 308.18	\$ 308.18		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9845	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 786.56	\$ 786.56		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9847	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 877.22	\$ 877.22	\$ 1,181.70	\$ 1,181.70		
Service Tag	1K00643	JACNN195120122	891-4023	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport 4-Hour 7X24 Onsite Capacity Add On Per Terabyte	60	\$ 886.52	\$ 886.52	\$ 13.24	\$ 794.40		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-5079	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	2	ProSupport OneFS Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 965.95	\$ 965.95		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-4772	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport OneFS Capacity Software Support-Maintenance 1 Year	60	\$ 724.37	\$ 724.37	\$ 10.82	\$ 649.20		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-5115	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	70	ProSupport SmartQuotas Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 91.39	\$ 91.39	\$ 86.05	\$ 86.05		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-5135	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	01	ProSupport HDFS for OneFS Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 224.63	\$ 224.63	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-5107	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	56	ProSupport SmartConnect Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ 211.49	\$ 211.49		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	829-5119	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	80	ProSupport SmartDedupe Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 327.34	\$ 327.34	\$ 308.18	\$ 308.18		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	886-9845	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 786.56	\$ 786.56		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	886-9847	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 877.22	\$ 877.22	\$ 1,179.83	\$ 1,179.83		
Service Tag	JJ00643	JACNN195120122	891-4023	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport 4-Hour 7X24 Onsite Capacity Add On Per Terabyte	60	\$ 886.52	\$ 886.52	\$ 13.24	\$ 794.40		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5079	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	2	ProSupport OneFS Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 1,077.30	\$ 965.95	\$ 965.95		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-4772	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport OneFS Capacity Software Support-Maintenance 1 Year	60	\$ 724.37	\$ 724.37	\$ 10.82	\$ 649.20		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5115	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	70	ProSupport SmartQuotas Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 91.39	\$ 91.39	\$ 86.05	\$ 86.05		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5135	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	01	ProSupport HDFS for OneFS Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 224.63	\$ 224.63	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5107	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	56	ProSupport SmartConnect Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ 211.49	\$ 211.49		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	829-5119	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	80	ProSupport SmartDedupe Base Software Support-Maintenance	1	\$ 327.34	\$ 327.34	\$ 308.18	\$ 308.18		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9845	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Onsite Service	1	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 1,316.13	\$ 786.56	\$ 786.56		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	886-9847	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	JC	ProSupport 4-Hour 7x24 Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 877.22	\$ 877.22	\$ 1,179.83	\$ 1,179.83		
Service Tag	2K00643	JACNN195120122	891-4023	Isilon A200 Upgrades and Extensions	ND	10/6/2020	6/4/2025	DL	ProSupport 4-Hour 7X24 Onsite Capacity Add On Per Terabyte	60	\$ 886.52	\$ 886.52	\$ 13.24	\$ 794.40		
Service Tag	HBM0803	CN0DMF5WO1P0098E0038	813-9324	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	NU	11/2/2019	6/4/2025	ND	ProSupport: Next Business Day On-Site Service After Problem Diagnosis	1	\$ 335.73	\$ 335.73	\$ 292.50	\$ 292.50		
Service Tag	HBM0803	CN0DMF5WO1P0098E0038	813-9342	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	NU	11/2/2019	6/4/2025	SV	ProSupport: 7x24 HW/SW Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 499.37	\$ 499.37	\$ 435.07	\$ 435.07		
Service Tag	HBM0803	CN0DMF5WO1P0098E0038	926-0476	PowerEdge R640 Upgrades and Extensions	NU	11/2/2019	6/4/2025	DL	Custom Other Services, Reinstatement Fee, Technician, Quantity 1, Ent Low End	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -		
Service Tag	32YBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240190	815-1564	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 4-Hour 7x24 On-Site Service with Emergency Dispatch	1	\$ 3,013.78	\$ 3,013.78	\$ 2,251.55	\$ 2,251.55		
Service Tag	32YBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240190	815-1608	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	P+	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 7x24 HW/SW Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 4,518.15	\$ 4,518.15	\$ 3,379.23	\$ 3,379.23		
Service Tag	32YBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240190	826-0476	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	DL	Custom Other Services, Reinstatement Fee, Technician, Quantity 1, Ent Low End	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -		
Service Tag	DYXBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240016	815-1564	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 4-Hour 7x24 On-Site Service with Emergency Dispatch	1	\$ 3,013.78	\$ 3,013.78	\$ 2,251.55	\$ 2,251.55		
Service Tag	DYXBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240016	815-1608	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	P+	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 7x24 HW/SW Technical Support and Assistance	1	\$ 4,518.15	\$ 4,518.15	\$ 3,379.22	\$ 3,379.22		
Service Tag	DYXBPK2	TW0F220WDNG000240016	826-0476	Dell Networking S4128, S4148/U Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/11/2020	6/4/2025	DL	Custom Other Services, Reinstatement Fee, Technician, Quantity 1, Ent Low End	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -		
Service Tag	84ND922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	803-9486	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 4-Hour 7x24 On-Site Service with Emergency Dispatch	1	\$ 6,456.48	\$ 6,456.48	\$ 4,905.58	\$ 4,905.58		
Service Tag	84ND922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	803-9514	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	P+	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 7x24 Technical Support	1	\$ 2,986.59	\$ 2,986.59	\$ 2,269.18	\$ 2,269.18		
Service Tag	84ND922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	926-0476	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	DL	Custom Other Services, Reinstatement Fee, Technician, Quantity 1, Ent Low End	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -		
Service Tag	848C922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	803-9486	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	S9	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 4-Hour 7x24 On-Site Service with Emergency Dispatch	1	\$ 6,456.48	\$ 6,456.48	\$ 4,905.58	\$ 4,905.58		
Service Tag	848C922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	803-9514	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	P+	ProSupport Plus: Mission Critical 7x24 Technical Support	1	\$ 2,986.59	\$ 2,986.59	\$ 2,269.18	\$ 2,269.18		
Service Tag	848C922	CN07MFSPEC0001K0012	926-0476	Dell Networking Z9100 Upgrades and Extensions	4U	3/12/2020	6/4/2025	DL	Custom Other Services, Reinstatement Fee, Technician, Quantity 1, Ent Low End	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -		

**Draft Until Award

Waypoint Business Solutions, LLC - No Bid

Summus - No Bid

UDT - No Bid

Netsync - No Response

\$ 60,510.03 \$ 48,750.95

EMC Confidential

Serial Number	Service Tag	HW Identifier	Model Number	Model Description	Support Option	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED	PRICE	EXTENDED	Family	Agreement ID	Renewal Coverage Start Date	Renewal Coverage End Date	Days	Install at Customer	Install at Party Number	City	State	Country	Contract Number	Contract Modifier	Line #	Current Contract Status	Ship Date	Current Coverage Start Date	Current Coverage Expiry Date	Sales Order Number	Host ID	AEM ID	Product Type	EOBL Date	Comments		
	DE300194307552	HBAS3C0TLR25F	VBAL-500 PERCHBA330-RADCRT12GB ZSLP F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 14.74	\$ 14.74	\$ 17.46	\$ 17.46	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.4	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	INSTGR13USAR740	VBAL-500 USA SHPMOD GR1300	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 7.97	\$ 7.97	\$ 9.42	\$ 9.42	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.3	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	INSTKTSFPAF	HGIA INSTALK KIT 10GBE SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 4.68	\$ 4.68	\$ 5.55	\$ 5.55	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.8	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	MEM3G2G933MTF	VBAL-500 MEMORY 32GB 2933MT R0MIM F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	12	\$ 944.69	\$ 944.69	\$ 93.20	\$ 1,118.40	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.16	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	NCKX710Q10GBSFP AF	VBAL-500 NCK 10GBE SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 69.59	\$ 69.59	\$ 82.40	\$ 82.40	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.19	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	PROGDG24B15F	VWR INTEL CPU G0 6248 2.5G, 20C40T 15 F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 375.99	\$ 375.99	\$ 445.13	\$ 445.13	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.11	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	PROGDG24B25F	VWR INTEL CPU G0 6248 2.5G, 20C40T 25 F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 375.99	\$ 375.99	\$ 445.13	\$ 445.13	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.15	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	PS160W-250VACF	VBAL-500 DUALHPTPLG 1600W PS-250VAC F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 69.68	\$ 69.68	\$ 82.49	\$ 82.49	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.12	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	PWR200V/RACK	C13-C14 PDU RACK PWR CRD 2M N.M. AM	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	2	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.14	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	R0IMM2G33NF0	VBAL-500 FACTORYORD RQ 2933MHZ R0IMM	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.6	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	RISER740CNFG/GEUAL	VBAL-500 RISER 740CNFG/66 AND BOSS CTR	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 19.82	\$ 19.82	\$ 23.46	\$ 23.46	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.10	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	RRAALKIT2U1HNCMAF	VBAL-500 86 READYRAILS 1 WICMA 2U1NMF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 15.52	\$ 15.52	\$ 18.38	\$ 18.38	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.2	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	9	\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VBAL	14895551		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	29.9	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(F-H) F-H	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	2	\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VBAL	14895550		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.2	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	9	\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.1	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(F-H) F-H	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	2	\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.2	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	9	\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.1	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(F-H) F-H	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	2	\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.2	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	9	\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.1	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307552	VWRH03 MS/ASF	VWR H03 SYSTEM SOFTWARE(F-H) F-H	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	2	\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VBAL	14895549		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	14.2	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307554	HBAS3C0TLR25F	VBAL-500 PERCHBA330-RADCRT12GB ZSLP F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 14.74	\$ 14.74	\$ 17.46	\$ 17.46	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	12.7	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307554	INSTGR13USAR740	VBAL-500 USA SHPMOD GR1300	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 7.97	\$ 7.97	\$ 9.42	\$ 9.42	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	12.3	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307554	INSTKTSFPAF	HGIA INSTALK KIT 10GBE SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 4.68	\$ 4.68	\$ 5.55	\$ 5.55	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	12.13	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307554	MEM3G2G933MTF	VBAL-500 MEMORY 32GB 2933MT R0MIM F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	12	\$ 944.69	\$ 944.69	\$ 93.20	\$ 1,118.40	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	12.16	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307554	NCKX710Q10GBSFP AF	VBAL-500 NCK 10GBE SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HRMC HW SUPPORT-1 YEAR	1	\$ 69.59	\$ 69.59	\$ 82.40	\$ 82.40	VBAL			5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	100390807	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	12.26	ACTIVE	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228							HARDWARE	
	DE300194307554	PROGDG24B15F	VWR INTEL CPU G0 6248 2.5G, 20C40T 15 F	PRO																															

	Service Tag	HW Identifier	Model Number	Model Description	Support Option	QTY		PRICE	EXTENDED	PRICE	EXTENDED	Family	Agreement ID	Renewal Coverage Start Date	Renewal Coverage End Date	Days	Install at Customer	Install at Party Number	City	State	Country	Contract Number	Contract Modifier	Line #	Current Contract Status	Ship Date	Current Coverage Start Date	Current Coverage Expiry Date	Sales Order Number	Host ID	AEM ID	Product Type	EOBL Date	Comments
DE300194307599	DE300194307598	RDIMM2M33NF0		VXRAIL-FACTORYFORD RQ 2933MHZ RDIMM	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	16.9	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307598	RISER740CNFG6DUAL		VXRAIL-500 RISER 740CNFG6 AND BOSS CTR	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 19.82	\$ 19.82	\$ 23.46	\$ 23.46	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	16.3	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307598	RAALKIT2U1NCMAF		VXRAIL-500 86 READYSRLS 1 WICMA 2U1NAF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 15.52	\$ 15.52	\$ 18.38	\$ 18.38	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	16.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307598	TPM1.2MODULEAF		VXRAIL-500 TPM 1.2 MODULE AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 4.85	\$ 4.85	\$ 5.73	\$ 5.73	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	19.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307598	VXROS33MSASF		VXR HCl SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	PreSupport Plus MC Software Support	9		\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VXRAIL	14895591	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	9.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307598	VXROSQ2PROCSCF		VXRAIL-HCl SYSTEM SOFTWARE(C F-H)g	PreSupport Plus MC Software Support	2		\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VXRAIL	14895558	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	9.1	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307599	SYSP7050N125GR		VXRAIL-14G P570 2U1N 25 N1ME ENT AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 1,395.63	\$ 1,395.63	\$ 1,651.93	\$ 1,651.93	VXRAIL	14895583	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.1	ACTIVE	31-OCT-19	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	SP5P7050M125GR		VXRAIL-500 25P750 125GR CHASSIS.FANJSK	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 201.81	\$ 201.81	\$ 238.91	\$ 238.91	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.11	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	CACHENMEDVR1.6TBF		VXR 1.6TB N1ME CACHE 2.5N F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	2		\$ 314.44	\$ 314.44	\$ 186.12	\$ 372.24	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.10	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	CAPSSDSAS3.84TBF		VXR 3.84TB CAPACITY SAS 2.5N SSD F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	9		\$ 2,600.56	\$ 2,600.56	\$ 342.08	\$ 3,078.72	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.6	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	HBA33C3TRL25P		VXRAIL-500 PERCHBA330-RA0C1R125GB 25LP F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 14.74	\$ 14.74	\$ 17.46	\$ 17.46	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.7	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
DE300194307600	DE300194307599	INSTGR13USAR40		VXRAIL-500 USA SHPMOD GR1300	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 7.97	\$ 7.97	\$ 9.42	\$ 9.42	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.3	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	INSTKTSPFAF		HClA INSTALK KIT 10GBE SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 4.98	\$ 4.98	\$ 5.55	\$ 5.55	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.8	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	MEM3G2G933MTF		VXRAIL-MEMORY 32GB 2933MT RDIMM F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	12		\$ 944.69	\$ 944.69	\$ 93.20	\$ 1,118.40	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.14	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307599	NDCX710Q10GBSFPAF		VXRAIL-500 NDC INTELX710 QP 10GB SFP+ AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 69.99	\$ 69.99	\$ 82.40	\$ 82.40	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	38.12	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	PRODG20425F		VXR INTEL CPU G0 6248 2.5G, 20C40T 15 F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 375.99	\$ 375.99	\$ 445.13	\$ 445.13	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.16	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	PS1600W_250VACF		VXRAIL-500 DUALHPTLPG 1600W PS-250VAC F	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 69.68	\$ 69.68	\$ 82.49	\$ 82.49	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.8	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	PWR2020V/RACK		C13-C14 PDU RACK PWR CRD 2M N. AM	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	2		\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.4	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	RDIMM2M33NF0		VXRAIL-FACTORYFORD RQ 2933MHZ RDIMM	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.1	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	RISER740CNFG6DUAL		VXRAIL-500 RISER 740CNFG6 AND BOSS CTR	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 19.82	\$ 19.82	\$ 23.46	\$ 23.46	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.6	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	RAALKIT2U1NCMAF		VXRAIL-500 86 READYSRLS 1 WICMA 2U1NAF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 15.52	\$ 15.52	\$ 18.38	\$ 18.38	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.5	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307600	TPM1.2MODULEAF		VXRAIL-500 TPM 1.2 MODULE AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 4.85	\$ 4.85	\$ 5.73	\$ 5.73	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	23.5	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
DE300194307601	DE300194307599	VXROS33MSASF		VXR HCl SYSTEM SOFTWARE(CAP 3.84 SAS)-CF	PreSupport Plus MC Software Support	9		\$ 995.58	\$ 995.58	\$ 130.96	\$ 1,176.54	VXRAIL	14895573	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	20.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307599	VXROSQ2PROCSCF		VXRAIL-HCl SYSTEM SOFTWARE(C F-H)g	PreSupport Plus MC Software Support	2		\$ 623.69	\$ 623.69	\$ 369.18	\$ 738.36	VXRAIL	14895572	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	19.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				SOFTWARE	
	DE300194307601	SYSP7050N125GR		VXRAIL-14G P570 2U1N 25 N1ME ENT AF	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 1,395.63	\$ 1,395.63	\$ 1,651.93	\$ 1,651.93	VXRAIL	14895569	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	19.1	ACTIVE	31-OCT-19	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310853228				HARDWARE	
	DE300194307601	SP5P7050M125GR		VXRAIL-500 25P750 125GR CHASSIS.FANJSK	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4R4RC HW SUPP-ORT-1 YEAR	1		\$ 201.81	\$ 201.81	\$ 238.91	\$ 238.91	VXRAIL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	1003908007	MCKINNEY	TX														

Serial Number	Service Tag	HW Identifier	Model Number	Model Description	Support Option	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED	PRICE	EXTENDED	Family	Agreement ID	Renewal Coverage Start Date	Renewal Coverage End Date	Days	Install at Customer	Install at Party Number	City	State	Country	Contract Number	Contract Modifier	Line #	Current Contract Status	Ship Date	Current Coverage Start Date	Current Coverage End Date	Sales Order Number	Host ID	AEM ID	Product Type	EOBL Date	Comments			
20250998 DE300181601718	DIDGMN2	DE300181601713	RISER640CNFG4SGLN	VRAL-500 RISER R640 CNF G4 LP	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 2.39	\$ 2.39	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	3.4	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601713	SSD800GB10WPD2SF	VRAL-500 CACHEDSS 800GB10WPD 2.5INCH F	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 369.46	\$ 369.46	\$ 386.54	\$ 386.54	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	3.5	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601713	TPM1.2MODULEAF	VRAL-500 TPM 1.2 MODULE AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 6.68	\$ 6.68	\$ 6.99	\$ 6.99	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	3.6	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601713	KVRSFPRSG10GAF	VRAL-500 TRANSCIVER LC SR 10G AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	4	\$ 126.20	\$ 126.20	\$ 33.02	\$ 126.20	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	3.7	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	SYSTEM10UN10DAF	VRAL-500 TUN 10X2.5 NON-NVME AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 900.14	\$ 900.14	\$ 941.73	\$ 941.73	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.2	EXPIRED	21-APR-18	31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	SS50DFANES0160SL	VRAL-500 1S 5 STD FAN LESS THAN 165W	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 11.19	\$ 11.19	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.69	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.12	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	SE560GSKM160SL	VRAL-500 1S E560 16WLK KIT DIMM BLNK	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 3.02	\$ 3.02	\$ 3.16	\$ 3.16	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.14	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	CAPS5SD34TB1WPDVXS	VRAL-500 CAPACITY SAS SSD 3.4TB1WPD	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	4	\$ 3,187.48	\$ 3,187.48	\$ 3,334.80	\$ 3,334.80	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.1	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	INSTKIT9SFAF	HCA INSTAL KIT 10GBE SFP+ AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.76	\$ 6.76	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.3	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	INSTLCTRYUSAFR640F	VRAL-500 USA SHPMOD F	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 8.72	\$ 8.72	\$ 9.13	\$ 9.13	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.7	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	MEMLDM2G2GBAF	VRAL-500 MEMORY 32GB RDRAM AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	6	\$ 684.23	\$ 684.23	\$ 119.31	\$ 715.86	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.13	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	NDCX710Q10GBSFFAF	VRAL-500 NDC INTELX10 GP 10GB SFP+ AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 96.05	\$ 96.05	\$ 100.49	\$ 100.49	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.17	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	PRMO2ND-PROCVRXS	VRAL-500 NO SECOND PROCESSOR	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.18	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	PR138G02C20QAF	VRAL-500 INTEL CPU I38 20C 2.0 GHZ AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 1,475.29	\$ 1,475.29	\$ 1,543.46	\$ 1,543.46	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.4	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	PS1100WPSF	VRAL-500 DUAL HOTPLG 1100W PS F	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 88.84	\$ 88.84	\$ 92.94	\$ 92.94	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.4	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	PWRIC31NEMAS15P	C13 CORD NEMA 5-15 125V 10A - NON DPE	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	2	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.10	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	RAIKUT1UN1NAF	VRAL-500 48 RRALS 2.4POSTRACKS1UN AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 5.60	\$ 5.60	\$ 5.85	\$ 5.85	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.1	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		DE300181601718	RODM2609N0F	VRAL-500 FACTORYORD RQ 2609M2 R0MMS	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.11	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
		20250997 DE300181601721	DIDPMN2	DE300181601718	RISER640CNFG4SGLN	VRAL-500 RISER R640 CNF G4 LP	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 2.39	\$ 2.39	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.8	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24							
DE300181601718	SSD800GB10WPD2SF			VRAL-500 CACHEDSS 800GB10WPD 2.5INCH F	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 369.46	\$ 369.46	\$ 386.54	\$ 386.54	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.8	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601718	TPM1.2MODULEAF			VRAL-500 TPM 1.2 MODULE AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 6.68	\$ 6.68	\$ 6.99	\$ 6.99	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.8	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601718	KVRSFPRSG10GAF			VRAL-500 TRANSCIVER LC SR 10G AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	4	\$ 126.20	\$ 126.20	\$ 33.02	\$ 126.20	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.16	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	PRMO2ND-PROCVRXS			VRAL-500 NO SECOND PROCESSOR	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	VRAL	1128077	5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	5.17	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	SYSTEM10UN10DAF			VRAL-500 TUN 10X2.5 NON-NVME AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 900.14	\$ 900.14	\$ 941.73	\$ 941.73	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.4	EXPIRED	21-MAR-18	31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	SS50DFANES0160SL			VRAL-500 1S 5 STD FAN LESS THAN 165W	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 11.19	\$ 11.19	\$ 11.69	\$ 11.69	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.18	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	SE560GSKM160SL			VRAL-500 1S E560 16WLK KIT DIMM BLNK	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 3.02	\$ 3.02	\$ 3.16	\$ 3.16	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.15	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	CAPS5SD34TB1WPDVXS			VRAL-500 CAPACITY SAS SSD 3.4TB1WPD	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	4	\$ 3,187.48	\$ 3,187.48	\$ 3,334.80	\$ 3,334.80	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.2	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	INSTKIT9SFAF			HCA INSTAL KIT 10GBE SFP+ AF	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.46	\$ 6.76	\$ 6.76	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.5	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									
DE300181601721	INSTLCTRYUSAFR640F			VRAL-500 USA SHPMOD F	PreSupport Plus 4HRMC HW Supp VXR	1	\$ 8.72	\$ 8.72	\$ 9.13	\$ 9.13	VRAL		5-Jun-25	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	11396428	MCKINNEY	TX	US	32026766	R22-AUG-2023	4.10	EXPIRED		31-MAR-23	30-MAR-24									

Serial Number	Service Tag	HW Identifier	Model Number	Model Description	Support Option	QTY						PRICE	EXTENDED	PRICE	EXTENDED	Family	Agreement ID	Renewal Coverage		Days	Install at Customer	Install at Party Number	City	State	Country	Contract Number	Contract Modifier	Line #	Current Contract Status	Ship Date	Current Coverage Start Date	Current Coverage Expiry Date	Sales Order Number	Host ID	AEM ID	Product Type	EOBL Date	Comments
													Start Date	Coverage End Date	Date			Date																				
24819004		JACNT194740243	456-112-050	SMARTLOCK CAPACITY LICENSE TIER 3 *CB	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	120						\$ 279.98	\$ 279.98	\$ 2.44	\$ 292.80	SILON	15330419	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	1.13	ACTIVE	10-APR-20	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077	JACNT194840766	24819004	SOFTWARE		
JACNT194740183	NA	JACNT194740243	4560-8T-1.6T	H500-2.2GHZ/10C/128G+15X8TB SAT/1.6TB	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	1						\$ 5,771.31	\$ 5,771.31	\$ 6,037.99	\$ 6,037.99	SILON	15330400	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	1.26				310934077			SOFTWARE			
JACNT194740190	NA	JACNT194740243	4560-8T-1.6T	H500-2.2GHZ/10C/128G+15X8TB SAT/1.6TB	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	1						\$ 5,771.31	\$ 5,771.31	\$ 6,037.99	\$ 6,037.99	SILON	15332258	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	1.3	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			SOFTWARE		
JACNT194740243	NA	JACNT194740243	4560-8T-1.6T	H500-2.2GHZ/10C/128G+15X8TB SAT/1.6TB	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	1						\$ 5,771.31	\$ 5,771.31	\$ 6,037.99	\$ 6,037.99	SILON	15330412	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	1.2	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			SOFTWARE		
JACNT194840766	NA	JACNT194740243	4560-8T-1.6T	H500-2.2GHZ/10C/128G+15X8TB SAT/1.6TB	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	1						\$ 5,771.31	\$ 5,771.31	\$ 6,037.99	\$ 6,037.99	SILON	15330414	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	1.4	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			SOFTWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	456-001-863	ONEFS PRODUCT	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	1						\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	SILON	15332183	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.5	ACTIVE	10-APR-20	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	456-001-866	ENTERPRISE BUNDLE TIER 3=ID	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	4						\$ 2,150.83	\$ 2,150.83	\$ 562.55	\$ 2,250.20	SILON	15332183	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.4	ACTIVE	10-APR-20	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	456-001-867	ENTERPRISE BUNDLE CAPACITY T3 PER TB=CB	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	480						\$ 4,135.11	\$ 4,135.11	\$ 9.01	\$ 4,324.80	SILON	15332183	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.2	ACTIVE	10-APR-20	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	456-001-969	HDFS FOR ONEFS 0.00	ProSupport Plus MC Software Support	4						\$ 0.01	\$ 0.01	\$ -	\$ -	SILON	15332183	05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.7	ACTIVE	10-APR-20	05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	BEIO-40GBE	2X40GBE QSFP+ BACK END W/O OPTICS	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	4						\$ 540.22	\$ 540.22	\$ 141.30	\$ 565.20	SILON		05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.8	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
JACNT194740243		JACNT194740243	FEIO-10GBE	2X10GBE SFP+ W/O OPTICS	PROSUPPORT PLUS 4HR/MC HARDWARE SUPPORT	4						\$ 558.32	\$ 558.32	\$ 140.03	\$ 584.12	SILON		05-JUN-24	4-Jun-26	365	COLLIN COUNTY	12994848	MCKINNEY	TX	US	310853228	R22-AUG-2023	40.9	ACTIVE		05-JUN-23	04-JUN-24	310934077			HARDWARE		
TOTAL												\$ 311,176.59		\$ 331,207.94																								

TOTAL \$ 311,176.59 \$ 331,207.94

**Draft Until Award

Waypoint Business Solutions, LLC - No Bid

Summus - No Bid

UDT - No Bid

NetSync - No Response