Collin County, TX
Purchasing

' Michelle Charnoski, Purchasing Agent

2300 Bloomdale Rd, McKinney, TX 75071

EVALUATION TABULATION
IFB No. 2025-140
Vehicle Rental for Various Collin County Departments
RESPONSE DEADLINE: April 24, 2025 at 2:00 pm

Ean Holdings, LLC dba Enterprise Holdings Herc Rentals Inc. Timsina Transport Corpor:

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure
1 Economy Sedan 1 Month $812.24 $812.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Compact Sedan 1 Month $812.24 $812.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Intermediate Sedan 1 Month $855.14 $855.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Standard Sedan 1 Month $855.14 $855.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Full Size Sedan 1 Month $923.12 $923.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Premium Sedan 1 Month $2,018.72 $2,018.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Minivan 1 Month $1,600.06 $1,600.06 No Bid No Bid $8,300.00 $8,300.00
8 Midsize SUV 1 Month $1,526.36 $1,526.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Standard SUV 1 Month $1,526.36 $1,526.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 Full Size SUV 1 Month $2,117.28 $2,117.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 Premium SUV 1 Month $2,117.28 $2,117.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Small Pick-Up Truck 1 Month $1,723.26 $1,723.26 $1,917.00 $1,917.00 No Bid No Bid
13 Large Pick-Up Truck 1 Month $1,846.46 $1,846.46 $2,159.00 $2,159.00 No Bid No Bid
14 Mini Cargo Van/HD Mini Cargo Van 1 Each $2,286.02 $2,286.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 Cargo Van/HD Cargo Van 1 Month $2,286.02 $2,286.02 $2,495.00 $2,495.00 No Bid No Bid
16 XL Cargo Van/HD XL Cargo Van 1 Month $2,461.80 $2,461.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 Intermediate Hybrid Sedan 1 Month $1,206.26 $1,206.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 Full Size Hybrid Sedan 1 Month $1,329.46 $1,329.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 Jeep/Crossover 1 Month $2,117.28 $2,117.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Convertible 1 Month $2,018.72 $2,018.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 12 Seat Passenger Van 1 Month $3,799.98 $3,799.98 $2,553.00 $2,553.00 No Bid No Bid
22 15 Seat Passenger Van 1 Month $3,799.98 $3,799.98 $2,553.00 $2,553.00 No Bid No Bid
23 Electrical Vehicle 1 Month $5,500.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Price per Mile Over 3,500 Miles 1 Mile $.25 $.25 $.25 $.25 $2.25 $2.25

Additional Monthly Cost for Vehicle with Unlimited
25 Miles 1 Month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 State Price for Lockable Truck Toolbox 1 Month No Bid No Bid $150.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
27 State Price for Truck Bed Mat 1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 State Price for Additional Set of Keys for Vehicle 1 Each $400.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $300.00 $300.00
*Draft Until Award Total $45,939.43 Total $11,827.25 Total $8,602.25

**Lines 24-28 are add-on costs that correspond to lines 1-23.
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Secondary Award



