
2025-136 Fujitsu Document Scanners, Lexmark Printers and Accessories
*Draft Until Award

Line Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Quantity Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price Unit Cost

Extended 
Price

1 Fujitsu FI-7700 Flatbed Scanner 1 1 EACH $5,136.00 $5,136.00 $6,495.00 $6,495.00 $5,924.47 $5,924.47 $5,662.28 $5,662.28 $6,650.14 $6,650.14 $6,053.00 $6,053.00 $5,336.00 $5,336.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $5,506.61 $5,506.61 $5,550.00 $5,550.00 $6,453.00 $6,453.00 No Bid No Bid $5,834.98 $5,834.98
2 Fujitsu ScanSnap iX1600 SHTFDSCAN 40 PPM WL T WTH 2 1 EACH $389.00 $778.00 $4,995.00 $9,990.00 $449.62 $899.24 $408.49 $816.98 $539.94 $1,079.88 $428.99 $857.98 $469.00 $938.00 $430.00 $860.00 $397.09 $794.18 $420.00 $840.00 $645.00 $1,290.00 No Bid No Bid $421.35 $842.70

* 3 Fujitsu FI-8170 COL SHTFEDSCAN 70PPM USB DUPLX 34 1 EACH $856.00 $29,104.00 $1,095.00 $37,230.00 $449.62 $15,287.08 $963.58 $32,761.72 $539.94 $18,357.96 $428.99 $14,585.66 $959.00 $32,606.00 $140.00 $4,760.00 $397.09 $13,501.06 $420.00 $14,280.00 $1,320.00 $44,880.00 $0.00 $0.00 $992.98 $33,761.32
4 Fujitsu FI-8270 COL SHTFEDSCAN 70PPM USB DUPLX 1 1 EACH $1,219.00 $1,219.00 $1,595.00 $1,595.00 $1,513.38 $1,513.38 $1,405.56 $1,405.56 $1,680.07 $1,680.07 $1,502.47 $1,502.47 $1,429.00 $1,429.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 $1,366.92 $1,366.92 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $1,745.00 $1,745.00 No Bid No Bid $1,448.43 $1,448.43
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5 Lexmark MS431DN 5 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $1,295.00 $230.10 $1,150.50 $205.01 $1,025.05 $395.49 $1,977.45 $349.58 $1,747.90 $279.00 $1,395.00 $340.00 $1,700.00 $307.61 $1,538.05 $346.00 $1,730.00 $615.00 $3,075.00 $228.00 $1,140.00 $341.27 $1,706.35
5.1 MS431DN - 3 Year Extended Warranty 5 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $79.00 $395.00 $67.94 $339.70 $69.16 $345.80 $39.53 $197.65 $131.25 $656.25 $69.00 $345.00 $130.00 $650.00 $0.00 $0.00 $123.00 $615.00 $0.00 $0.00 $103.59 $517.95 $0.00 $0.00
5.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS431DN - 550 Sheet Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $129.00 $129.00 $118.12 $118.12 $103.23 $103.23 $172.54 $172.54 $150.46 $150.46 $95.00 $95.00 $144.00 $144.00 $132.39 $132.39 $154.00 $154.00 $198.00 $198.00 $115.50 $115.50 $147.97 $147.97

LINE 5 TOTAL  No Bid  $1,819.00  $1,608.32  $1,474.08  $2,347.64  $2,554.61 $1,835.00 $2,494.00 ** $1,670.44 $2,499.00 ** $3,273.00 $1,773.45 ** $1,854.32
6 Lexmark MS631DW 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $659.00 $659.00 $551.28 $551.28 $526.60 $526.60 $988.49 $988.49 $897.90 $897.90 $539.00 $539.00 $826.00 $826.00 $747.66 $747.66 $873.00 $873.00 $1,342.00 $1,342.00 $587.40 $587.40 $876.57 $876.57

6.1 MS631DW - 3 Year Extended Warranty 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $369.00 $369.00 $268.04 $268.04 $252.21 $252.21 $39.53 $39.53 $338.44 $338.44 $199.00 $199.00 $316.00 $316.00 $0.00 $0.00 $297.00 $297.00 $120.00 $120.00 $243.68 $243.68 $0.00 $0.00
6.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS611DW - 550 Sheet Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $209.00 $209.00 $185.61 $185.61 $166.68 $166.68 $278.61 $278.61 $242.92 $242.92 $189.00 $189.00 $248.00 $248.00 $225.24 $225.24 $249.00 $249.00 $447.00 $447.00 $206.80 $206.80 $238.92 $238.92

LINE 6 TOTAL  No Bid  $1,237.00  $1,004.93  $945.49  $1,306.63  $1,479.26 $927.00 $1,390.00 ** $972.90 $1,419.00 $1,909.00 $1,037.88 ** $1,115.49
7 Lexmark MS821DN 4 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $759.00 $3,036.00 $634.60 $2,538.40 $606.19 $2,424.76 $1,137.91 $4,551.64 $1,033.63 $4,134.52 $699.00 $2,796.00 $950.00 $3,800.00 $860.68 $3,442.72 $995.00 $3,980.00 $1,405.00 $5,620.00 $674.30 $2,697.20 $1,009.07 $4,036.28

7.1 MS821DN - 3 Year Extended Warranty 4 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $289.00 $1,156.00 $147.75 $591.00 $139.02 $556.08 $102.73 $410.92 $146.92 $587.68 $169.00 $676.00 $253.00 $1,012.00 $0.00 $0.00 $238.00 $952.00 $90.00 $360.00 $200.93 $803.72 $234.12 $936.48
7.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS821DN - 550 Sheet Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $239.00 $239.00 $206.51 $206.51 $186.32 $186.32 $311.44 $311.44 $271.56 $271.56 $219.00 $219.00 $262.00 $262.00 $238.96 $238.96 $277.00 $277.00 $417.00 $417.00 $189.20 $189.20 $267.08 $267.08

LINE 7 TOTAL  No Bid  $4,431.00  $3,335.91  $3,167.16  $5,274.00  $4,993.76 $3,691.00 $5,074.00 ** $3,681.68 $5,209.00 $6,397.00 $3,690.12 $5,239.84
8 Lexmark CS431DW 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $359.00 $359.00 $321.64 $321.64 $287.48 $287.48 $411.52 $411.52 $490.19 $490.19 $299.00 $299.00 $448.00 $448.00 $408.17 $408.17 $481.00 $481.00 $823.00 $823.00 $321.20 $321.20 $483.65 $483.65

8.1 CS431DW - 3 Year Extended Warranty 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $189.00 $89.95 $89.95 $83.13 $83.13 $39.53 $39.53 $87.86 $87.86 $99.00 $99.00 $146.00 $146.00 $0.00 $0.00 $138.00 $138.00 $76.00 $76.00 $117.50 $117.50 $136.91 $136.91
8.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS431DW - 250 Sheet Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $119.00 $119.00 $102.08 $102.08 $96.51 $96.51 $161.33 $161.33 $140.67 $140.67 $100.00 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 $123.78 $123.78 $145.00 $145.00 $224.00 $224.00 $107.80 $107.80 $138.35 $138.35

LINE 8 TOTAL  No Bid  $667.00  $513.67  $467.12  $612.38  $718.72 $498.00 $734.00 ** $531.95 $764.00 $1,123.00 $546.50 $758.91
9 Lexmark CS531DW 12 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $499.00 $5,988.00 $420.00 $5,040.00 $397.73 $4,772.76 $755.78 $9,069.36 $678.17 $8,138.04 $390.00 $4,680.00 $720.00 $8,640.00 $564.70 $6,776.40 $662.00 $7,944.00 $906.00 $10,872.00 $470.80 $5,649.60 $669.12 $8,029.44

9.1 CS531DW - 3 Year Extended Warranty 12 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $3,348.00 $207.09 $2,485.08 $195.62 $2,347.44 $75.60 $907.20 $262.50 $3,150.00 $169.00 $2,028.00 $245.00 $2,940.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00 $2,400.00 $99.00 $1,188.00 $189.00 $2,268.00 $0.00 $0.00
9.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS531DW - 550 Sheet Tray 5 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $209.00 $1,045.00 $182.14 $910.70 $163.40 $817.00 $273.14 $1,365.70 $238.16 $1,190.80 $189.00 $945.00 $243.00 $1,215.00 $220.82 $1,104.10 $243.00 $1,215.00 $316.00 $1,580.00 $202.40 $1,012.00 $234.23 $1,171.15

LINE 9 TOTAL  No Bid  $10,381.00  $8,435.78  $7,937.20  $11,342.26  $12,478.84 $7,653.00 $12,795.00 ** $7,880.50 $11,559.00 $13,640.00 $8,929.60 ** $9,200.59
10 Lexmark CS730DE 6 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $769.00 $4,614.00 $645.00 $3,870.00 $614.46 $3,686.76 $1,153.42 $6,920.52 $1,047.72 $6,286.32 $999.00 $5,994.00 $1,020.00 $6,120.00 $921.93 $5,531.58 $1,017.00 $6,102.00 $1,360.00 $8,160.00 $684.20 $4,105.20 $1,033.73 $6,202.38

10.1 CS730DE - 3 Year Extended Warranty 6 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $329.00 $1,974.00 $318.53 $1,911.18 $299.72 $1,798.32 $102.73 $616.38 $308.44 $1,850.64 $329.00 $1,974.00 $288.00 $1,728.00 $0.00 $0.00 $269.00 $1,614.00 $89.00 $534.00 $228.74 $1,372.44 $0.00 $0.00
10.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS730DE - 550 Sheet Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $299.00 $1,233.51 $1,233.51 $228.28 $228.28 $381.59 $381.59 $1,447.24 $1,447.24 $219.00 $219.00 $318.00 $318.00 $1,273.47 $1,273.47 $1,395.00 $1,395.00 $1,945.00 $1,945.00 $209.00 $209.00 $0.00 $0.00

LINE 10 TOTAL  No Bid  $6,887.00  $7,014.69  $5,713.36  $7,918.49  $9,584.20 $8,187.00 $8,166.00 ** $6,805.05 $9,111.00 $10,639.00 $5,686.64 ** $6,202.38
11 Lexmark CX735ADSE 5 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $2,359.00 $11,795.00 $1,961.67 $9,808.35 $1,897.51 $9,487.55 $3,560.65 $17,803.25 $3,195.09 $15,975.45 $2,890.00 $14,450.00 $3,070.00 $15,350.00 $2,811.46 $14,057.30 $3,070.00 $15,350.00 $4,679.00 $23,395.00 $2,084.50 $10,422.50 $1,427.91 $7,139.55

11.1 CX735ADSE - 3 Year Extended Warranty 5 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $1,929.00 $9,645.00 $1,761.56 $8,807.80 $1,703.94 $8,519.70 $111.37 $556.85 $1,789.69 $8,948.45 $1,249.00 $6,245.00 $1,675.00 $8,375.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,550.00 $7,750.00 $499.00 $2,495.00 $1,327.23 $6,636.15 $0.00 $0.00
11.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for CX735ADSE - 550 Sheet Paper 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $299.00 $251.43 $251.43 $228.28 $228.28 $381.59 $381.59 $332.71 $332.71 $219.00 $219.00 $318.00 $318.00 $292.76 $292.76 $343.00 $343.00 $610.00 $610.00 $209.00 $209.00 $327.23 $327.23

LINE 11 TOTAL  No Bid  $21,739.00  $18,867.58  $18,235.53  $18,741.69  $25,256.61 $20,914.00 $24,043.00 ** $14,350.06 $23,443.00 $26,500.00 $17,267.65 ** $7,466.78
12 Lexmark CX730DE 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $1,839.00 $1,839.00 $1,532.42 $1,532.42 $1,482.30 $1,482.30 $2,781.51 $2,781.51 $2,495.94 $2,495.94 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,435.00 $2,435.00 $2,196.26 $2,196.26 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,978.00 $2,978.00 $1,629.10 $1,629.10 $2,483.80 $2,483.80

12.1 CX730DE - 3 Year Extended Warranty 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $1,259.00 $1,259.00 $1,154.87 $1,154.87 $1,117.10 $1,117.10 $160.09 $160.09 $1,170.94 $1,170.94 $999.00 $999.00 $1,088.00 $1,088.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,019.00 $1,019.00 $249.00 $249.00 $868.37 $868.37 $0.00 $0.00
12.2 Lexmark Paper Tray for CX730DE - 550 Sheet Paper Tray 1 1 Each $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $299.00 $251.43 $251.43 $228.28 $228.28 $381.59 $381.59 $332.71 $332.71 $219.00 $219.00 $318.00 $318.00 $292.76 $292.76 $343.00 $343.00 $615.00 $615.00 $209.00 $209.00 $327.23 $327.23

LINE 12 TOTAL  No Bid  $3,397.00  $2,938.72  $2,827.68  $3,323.19  $3,999.59 $3,018.00 $3,841.00 ** $2,489.02 $3,762.00 $3,842.00 $2,706.47 ** $2,811.03

**Non-responsive due to not including warranty pricing. 
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