

Contract Modification Document

Office of the Purchasing Agent Collin County Administration Building 2300 Bloomdale Rd, Ste 3160 McKinney, TX 75071 972-548-4165

Vendor: Nobles Materials, LLC	Contract No.	2022-333				
5401 S. 1st St.	Contract:	Road Materials, Aggregate for				
Abilene, TX 79605		Surface	Treatment and Rip Rap			
YOU ARE DIRECTED TO MAKE THE F	OLLOWING MOD	IFICATIO	N TO THIS CONTRACT			
1 Renew contract for a 1-year period of C	October 1, 2025 thr	ough and	including September 30, 2026	3 ,		
In accordance with Section 4.6 Price R pricing per the attached documentation		use, chan	ge pricing to proposed unit			
Except as provided herein, all terms and conditions of the	o contract remain	in full force	a and affact and may only ha	modific		
in writing signed by both parties.	ie contract remain	in fail forc	e and enect and may only be i	Houme		

Change Order No. 1 has been accepted and authorized Court by Court Order No. 2025-663-07-14 , to				ners		
Court by Court Order No. 2023-003-07-14 , to	be effective off Ot	tober 1, 2	.025			
ACCEPTED BY:						
A		Signed by:				
(m		Michelle Charnoski				
SIGNATURE		SIGNATURE				
Argana Mucas		Michelle Charnoski, NIGP-CPP, CPPB (Print Name)				
(Print Name)						
TITLE: Vian Praide 1		TITLE	PURCHASING AGENT			
DATE: 6/1//25		DATE:	7/23/2025			
and the finished the first the first of the second			desirable della completa programmenta destrucción della desirable della della completa della com			

HISTORICAL INFORMATION Awarded by Court Order No. 2022-1125-10-17 Renewal No. Court Order No. 1 2023-730-08-21 Renewal No. 2 Court Order No. 2024-829-08-26 Renewal No. 3 Court Order No. 2025-663-07-14 Change Order No. 1 Court Order No. 2025-663-07-14 Summary Renewal w/Price redetermination

IFB 2022-333 Road Materials, Aggregate for Surface Treatment and Rip Rap

				Nobles Materials LLC				
Line#	Description	QTY	UOM	CURRE	NT PRICE	PROPO	SED PRICE	% INCREASE
1	State cost of Type B, Grade 3, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney							/ o intercease
*	Stockpile	16000	ton	1	\$68.50		\$69.55	1.54%
1	Delivered to Farmersville	1	ton	\$	74.15	s	75.29	1.54%
1	Delivered to Anna	1	ton	\$	71.25	s	72.35	1.54%
1	Delivered to Copeville	1	ton	Ś	74.15	s	75.29	1.54%
.2	State cost of Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney			I				
40.	Stockpile	13000	ton		\$72.50		\$73.62	1.54%
2	Delivered to Farmersville	1	ton	s	76.15	Ś	77.32	1.54%
2	Delivered to Anna	1	ton	s	73.25	Ś	74.38	1.54%
2	Delivered to Copeville	1	ton	\$	76.15	5	77.32	1.54%
3	State cost of Type B, Grade 5, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney						///	1.5429
\$	Stockpile	1000	ton	I	\$72.50		\$73.62	1.54%
3	Delivered to Farmersville	1	ton	5	78.15	Ś	79.35	1.54%
3	Delivered to Anna	1	ton	5	75.25	Š	76.41	1.54%
3	Delivered to Copeville	1	ton	Ś	78.15	S	79.35	1.54%
4	Type B. Grade 3 Aggregate State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at			Secretario esperante de la companya del la companya de la companya				
	your plant site by Collin County trucks.	1	ton		\$28.00		\$28.43	1.54%
5	vour plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks.	1	ton		\$28.00 \$30.00		\$28.43 \$30.4 6	1.54% 1.54%
5	your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at				\$30.00		\$30.46	1.54%
•	your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks.		ton					
6	your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks.		ton ton	No Bid	\$30.00 \$32.00	No Bid	\$30.46	1.54%
6 O AWA	vour plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B. Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. ARD State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" to	1	ton ton	No Bid	\$30.00 \$32.00	No Bid	\$30.46	1.54%
6 O AWA 7	your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B. Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks ARD State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 8" x 12" to	1 600	ton ton ton ton	No Bid	\$30.00 \$32.00	No Bid	\$30.46	1.54%
6 O AW 7 8	your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. ARD State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 8" x 12" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 12" x 18" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 12" x 24" to McKinney Stockpile State cost Per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 18" x 24" to	1 1 600 400	ton ton		\$30.00 \$32.00		\$30.46	1.54%
6 O AW A 7 8	vour plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate — State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks. ARD State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 8" x 12" to McKinney Stockpile State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 12" x 18" to McKinney Stockpile	1 600	ton ton ton ton	No Bid	\$30.00 \$32.00	No Bid	\$30.46	1.54%