Request: IT Conference Room NetSync

Southern Computer Warehouse NeoBits, Inc. (Avami Systems, Inc. Zoom B&H Photo Creation Networks Amazon
Coop DIR Coop TIPS Coop OPEN MARKET Coop OPEN MARKET Coop OMNIA Coop OPEN MARKET Coop OMNIA
Contract Contract Contract Contract Contract Contract Contract
Number DIR-CPO-5347 Number 230105 Number N/A Number N/A Number R201202 Number N/A Number RTC-17006
Cooperative Cooperative Cooperative Cooperative Cooperative Cooperative Cooperative
Contract 1/7/2030 Contract 5/31/2028 Contract N/A Contract N/A Contract 3/31/2026 Contract N/A Contract 1/18/2026
Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration
Quote Date 7/11/2025 Quote Date 7/15/2025 Quote Date 7/2/2025 Quote Date 7/3/2025 Quote Date N/A Quote Date N/A Quote Date N/A
Quote 8/11/2025 Quote 8/15/2025 Quote 8/3/2025 Quote 8/2/2025 Quote N/A Quote N/A Quote N/A
Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration Expiration
Quote No. AAAQ465405 Quote No. 1875340 Quote No. NQ103871 Quote No. ( Quote No. N/A Quote No. N/A Quote No. N/A
Line Qty Description Each Total Each Total Each Total Each Total Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 6 CISCO CS-BAR-T-C-K9 (ROOMBAR) $2,283.68 $13,702.08 $2,374.44 $14,246.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,562.61 $15,375.66 $3,091.75 $18,550.50 $2,973.42 $17,840.52
2 6 CISCO CON-SNT-CSBARAT3 (SMART NET LICENSING CO-TERM) $469.10 $2,814.60 $474.51 $2,847.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $407.88 $2,447.28 No Bid No Bid
3 1 CS-BARPRO-K9 (ROOMBAR PRO) $6,564.01 $6,564.01 $6,845.96 $6,845.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,376.06 $7,376.06 $8,427.88 $8,427.88 No Bid No Bid
4 1 CON-SNT-CSBARPK9 (SMART NET LICENSING CO-TERM) $1,443.80 $1,443.80 $1,460.41 $1,460.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,257.94 $1,257.94 No Bid No Bid
5 9  A-FLEX-CVI-ROOMS (MICROSOFT LICENSING) 4 MONTHS CO-TERM $103.95 $935.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 3 CS-MIC-CLGPRO (CEILING MIC) $2,967.71 $8,903.13 $3,222.94 $9,668.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,344.19 $10,032.57 $3,391.72 $10,175.16 No Bid No Bid
7 2 CS-MIC-ARRAY-T (TABLE MIC) $1,022.60 $2,045.20 $1,067.99 $2,135.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,152.33 $2,304.66 $1,168.69 $2,337.38 No Bid No Bid
8 4 SAMSUNG QE65T (TV) $748.10 $2,992.40 $807.10 $3,228.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $771.91 $3,087.64 $861.77 $3,447.08 $842.24 $3,368.96
9 4 CHIEF LTM1U (TV MOUNTING BRACKET) $232.40 $929.60 $234.93 $939.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $199.99 $799.96 $266.98 $1,067.92 $287.95 $1,151.80
10 4 (C2GC2G 21001 (6FT HDMI CABLES — 2 PACK) $12.00 $48.00 $11.84 $47.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $60.00 $14.55 $58.20 No Bid No Bid
11 1 PRYSMIAN 7131806 (ETHERNET CABLE SPOOLS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $465.81 $465.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 9 (C2G 50611 (12 FT HDMI CABLE) $8.90 $80.10 $8.77 $78.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.81 $97.29 $10.67 $96.03
13 3 CS-MIC-CLGP-DMK DROP (CEILING GRID MOUNTING KIT MIC PRO) $214.90 $644.70 $223.77 $671.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $307.03 $921.09 No Bid No Bid
14 g ZOOMOPTION 2- PAR1-CRC-1-PT1Y ROOM CONNECTOR FOR APPROX 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.42 $1,323.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MONTHS TO CO-TERM TO CURRENT LICENSES
15 1 SHIPPING No Bid No Bid $250.00 $250.00 $24.12 $24.12 No Bid No Bid $275.50 $275.50 $275.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid
*No Bids include Adorama, COW-G, Ford A/V, World Wide Technology, ADI Global, and Insight Total Awarded  $41,103.17 $42,420.59  Total Awarded $489.93 Total Awarded $1,323.38 $39,312.05 $49,062.72 $22,457.31

*Draft until award

Total for 3 Vendors = $42,916.48



	Sheet1

