
IFB 2025-094 Tire Rubber Modified Asphalt and Application Services

PRIMARY AWARD
SECONDARY AWARD
MULTIPLE VENDOR AWARD

Line 
Item Description Quantity

Unit of 
Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1
TRMSS - Vendor performs work with County 
provided material 1 SQUARE YARD $1.20 $1.20 $1.78 $1.78

2
TRMSS-FDR Application - Vendor performs work 
with County provided material 1 SQUARE YARD $27.00 $27.00 No Bid No Bid

3
CRS-2TR - Vendor performs work with County 
provided material 1 SQUARE YARD $4.00 $4.00 $1.78 $1.78

4
Temporary tabs - Vendor performs work with 
County provided material 1 EACH $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

5 TRMSS - Vendor performs turnkey application 2800000 SQUARE YARD $2.32 $6,496,000.00 $2.58 $7,224,000.00

6
TRMSS-FDR Application - Vendor performs turnkey 
application 1 SQUARE YARD $30.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid

7 CRS-2TR - Vendor performs turnkey application 50000 SQUARE YARD $6.00 $300,000.00 $2.58 $129,000.00

8
Temporary tabs - Vendor performs turnkey 
application 15000 EACH $1.10 $16,500.00 $1.55 $23,250.00

TOTAL: $72.62 $6,812,563.20 $11.27 $7,376,254.56

2025-094

Rose Contracting Wopac Construction, Inc.
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