
IFB 2025-178 Culverts, Bands, Drop Structures

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
MULTIPLE AWARD

Line Description QTY UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1 Circular Culverts 12" -- 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 9000 LINEAR FOOT $17.50 $157,500.00 $10.00 $90,000.00 $15.12 $136,080.00

2
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culvert 12" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $112.50 $112.50 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $50.00

TOTAL: $130.00 $157,612.50 $10.00 $90,000.00 $65.12 $136,130.00

3 Circular Culverts 15" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 10000 LINEAR FOOT $21.00 $210,000.00 $12.25 $122,500.00 $18.75 $187,500.00

4
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culvert 15" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $135.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $56.25 $56.25

TOTAL: $156.00 $210,135.00 $12.25 $122,500.00 $75.00 $187,556.25

5 Circular Culverts 18" -- 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 6000 LINEAR FOOT $26.25 $157,500.00 $15.50 $93,000.00 $22.36 $134,160.00

6
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 18" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $168.75 $168.75 No Bid No Bid $62.50 $62.50

TOTAL: $195.00 $157,668.75 $15.50 $93,000.00 $84.86 $134,222.50

7 Circular Culverts 24" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 3600 LINEAR FOOT $33.25 $119,700.00 $20.50 $73,800.00 $29.79 $107,244.00

8
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 24" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $213.75 $213.75 No Bid No Bid $75.00 $75.00

TOTAL: $247.00 $119,913.75 $20.50 $73,800.00 $104.79 $107,319.00

9 Circular Culverts 30" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 1000 LINEAR FOOT $42.00 $42,000.00 $25.00 $25,000.00 $37.06 $37,060.00

10
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culvert 30" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $270.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid $86.25 $86.25

TOTAL: $312.00 $42,270.00 $25.00 $25,000.00 $123.31 $37,146.25

11 Circular Culverts 36" - 2 2/13" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 1600 LINEAR FOOT $50.75 $81,200.00 $30.00 $48,000.00 $44.01 $70,416.00

12
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 36" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $326.25 $326.25 No Bid No Bid $100.00 $100.00

TOTAL: $377.00 $81,526.25 $30.00 $48,000.00 $144.01 $70,516.00
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13 Circular Culverts 42" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge 500 LINEAR FOOT $59.50 $29,750.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $51.25 $25,625.00

14
One piece annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 42" - 2 2/3" x 1/2" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $381.00 $381.00 No Bid No Bid $118.75 $118.75

TOTAL: $440.50 $30,131.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $170.00 $25,743.75

15 Circular Culverts 48" - 3" x 1" - 16 gauge 600 LINEAR FOOT $77.00 $46,200.00 $40.00 $24,000.00 $63.21 $37,926.00

16
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 48" - 3" x 1" - 16 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $495.00 $495.00 No Bid No Bid $148.75 $148.75

TOTAL: $572.00 $46,695.00 $40.00 $24,000.00 $211.96 $38,074.75

17 Circular Culverts 54" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge 600 LINEAR FOOT $122.00 $73,200.00 $45.00 $27,000.00 $110.57 $66,342.00

18
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 54" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $915.00 $915.00 No Bid No Bid $257.33 $257.33

TOTAL: $1,037.00 $74,115.00 $45.00 $27,000.00 $367.90 $66,599.33

19 Circular Culverts 60" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge 1000 LINEAR FOOT $134.00 $134,000.00 $57.00 $57,000.00 $122.63 $122,630.00

20
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 60" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $1,005.00 $1,005.00 No Bid No Bid $278.67 $278.67

TOTAL: $1,139.00 $135,005.00 $57.00 $57,000.00 $401.30 $122,908.67

21 Circular Culverts 72" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge 2000 LINEAR FOOT $162.00 $324,000.00 $70.00 $140,000.00 $160.72 $321,440.00

22
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 72" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $1,215.00 $1,215.00 No Bid No Bid $324.00 $324.00

TOTAL: $1,377.00 $325,215.00 $70.00 $140,000.00 $484.72 $321,764.00

23 Circular Culverts 84" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge 600 LINEAR FOOT $188.00 $112,800.00 $90.00 $54,000.00 $187.12 $112,272.00

24
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 84" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $1,410.00 $1,410.00 No Bid No Bid $380.00 $380.00

TOTAL: $1,598.00 $114,210.00 $90.00 $54,000.00 $567.12 $112,652.00

25 Circular Culverts 96" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge 800 LINEAR FOOT $214.00 $171,200.00 $96.00 $76,800.00 $213.49 $170,792.00

26
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 96" - 3" x 1" - 14 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $1,605.00 $1,605.00 No Bid No Bid $420.00 $420.00

TOTAL: $1,819.00 $172,805.00 $96.00 $76,800.00 $633.49 $171,212.00

27 Circular Culverts 108" - 3" x 1" - 12 gauge 50 LINEAR FOOT $330.00 $16,500.00 $110.00 $5,500.00 $353.67 $17,683.50

28
Two piece riveted annular band(s) for Circular Culverts 108" - 3" x 1" - 12 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $2,473.00 $2,473.00 No Bid No Bid $626.67 $626.67

TOTAL: $2,803.00 $18,973.00 $110.00 $5,500.00 $980.34 $18,310.17
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29 Circular Culverts 120" - 3" x 1" - 12 gauge 300 LINEAR FOOT $365.00 $109,500.00 $126.00 $37,800.00 $392.57 $117,771.00

30
Two piece riveted annular bands for Circular Culverts 120" - 3" x 1" - 12 gauge -- All 
bands shall be 24" 1 EACH $2,745.00 $2,745.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL: $3,110.00 $112,245.00 $126.00 $37,800.00 $392.57 $117,771.00

31 Circular Culverts 120" diameter riveted band 24" wide, 2 pc 1 LINEAR FOOT $3,600.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid $673.33 $673.33

32

Drop Structure 48" diameter inlet 7' long welded to 90 degree elbow with a 36" 
diameter outlet 26' long from elbow outlet made with 16 gauge galvanized 
corrugated metal pipe with 2" wide band. 1 EACH $4,030.00 $4,030.00 No Bid No Bid $4,225.00 $4,225.00

33 Drop Structure 72" x 20' 14 gauge drop structure with stub weld and 72" wide band 1 LINEAR FOOT $8,316.57 $8,316.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 Drop Structure 60" x 48" 14 gauge drop inlet structure with one 2' wide 48" band 1 EACH $6,723.00 $6,723.00 No Bid No Bid $4,120.00 $4,120.00

35 Additional fee if delivery requested sooner than 7 business days 1 LUMP SUM $700.00 $700.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

36
Percentage off any item required by the County which does not appear as an item on 
this bid and is PICKED UP by the County. EACH 0.% 0.% 5.% 5.% 0.% 0.%

37
Percentage off any item required by the County which does not appear as an item on 
this bid and is DELIVERED by the vendor. EACH 0.% 0.% 0.% 0.% 0.% 0.%

Line 31 - No Award

* In order to expedite repairs, and in the best interest of the County, both the culverts and matching bands shall be provided by the same vendor. 
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