COLLIN
COUNTY

Office of the Purchasing Agent
Collin County Administration Building

Contract Modification Document 2300 Bloomdale Rd, Ste 3160

McKinney, TX 75071
972-548-4165

Vendor: Herc Rentals, Inc. Contract No. 2023-363
27500 Riverview Center Blvd. Contract: Equipment, Rental: Road
Bonita Springs, FL 34134 Construction and Right of Way
Maintenance Equipment
YOU ARE DIRECTED TO MAKE THE FOLLOWING MODIFICATION TO THIS CONTRACT
1 Renew contract for a 1-year period of November 6, 2025 through and including November 5, 2026.
2 In accordance with Section 4.6 Price Redetermination clause, change pricing to proposed

unit pricing per the attached documentation.

Except as provided herein, all terms and conditions of the contract remain in full force and effect and may only be modified in writing
signed by both parties.

Change Order No. 2 has been accepted and authorized on by authority of the Collin County Commissioners

Court by Court Order No.

ACCEPTED BY:

, to be effective on November 6, 2025.

j&GNATURE SIGNATURE
Jason Oosterbeek Michelle Charnoski, NIGP-CPP, CPPB

(Print Name) (Print Name)
TITLE: Vice President TITLE: PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 07/01/2025 DATE:

HISTORICAL INFORMATION

Awarded by Court Order No. 2023-1088-11-06

Renewal No. 1 Court Order No. 2024-1058-10-07
Renewal No. 2 Court Order No.
Renewal No. 3 Court Order No.
Change Order No. 1 Court Order No. 2024-1058-10-07  Summary Renewal/Price redetermination
Change Order No. 2 Court Order No. Summary Renewal/Price redetermination




IFB 2023-363 Equipment, Rental: Road Construction and Right of Way Maintenance Equipment

PRIMARY AWARD

SECONDARY AWARD
TERTIARY AWARD
Herc Rentals Inc.
Line # Description QrTY UOM CURRENT PRICE PROPOSED PRICE % CHANGE

1 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs, 9-wheel,

compaction width 68" (ballasted up to 33,000 Ibs) 1 month No Bid No Bid NA
2 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs, 8-wheel,

compaction width 82" (ballasted up to 35,000 Ibs) 1 month No Bid No Bid NA
3

Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor, 23,000 |b 1 month $4,142.91 $4,149.54 0.16%
4

Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 21,000 |b 1 month $5,817.28] $5,826.59 0.16%
5

Padfoot Vibratory Soil Compactor, 24,000 lbs 1 month No Bid No Bid NA
6

Water Truck 4,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month $4,856.16 $4,863.93 0.16%
7

Water Truck 2,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month $3,186.86| $3,191.96| 0.16%
8

Compact Track Loader, 3,000 Ib 1 month $2,933.93) $2,938.62 0.16%
9

Skid Steer Loader, 2,200 lbs 1 month $1,719.89] $1,722.64] 0.16%
10

Self- Propelled Broom 1 month $2,529.25| $2,533.30 0.16%
11

Fork Lift, Diesel 1 month $1,315.21 $1,317.31 0.16%
12

Fork Lift, LPG 1 month $1,214.04) $1,215.98] 0.16%
13

Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 3,300 Ib 1 month $1,917.17 $1,920.24 0.16%
14

Walk Behind Concrete Saw, Gasoline, Push Type 1 month $667.72 $668.79] 0.16%
15

Handheld Concrete Saw 1 month $662.66) $663.72 0.16%
16

Vibratory Plate Compactor 1 month $470.44] $471.19] 0.16%
17

Solar Message Board 1 month $1,222.13] $1,224.09] 0.16%
18 Skid Steer Loader, High Flow, 2,300 Ibs with Cold Planer

Attachment 1 month $4,527.36] $4,534.60) 0.16%
19

Mini-Excavator, 10,500 Ibs operating weight 1 month $2,423.02 $2,426.90 0.16%
20

Padfoot Roller 54", 10,500 Ibs operating weight 1 month $3,343.67 $3,349.02 0.16%
21

Padfoot roller 48", 5,900-7,400 Ibs operating weight 1 month $3,343.67| $3,349.02 0.16%
22

Reclaimer, approx. 60,000 Ibs operating weight 1 month No Bid No Bid NA
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