2025-275 COMPUTERS, PERIPHERALS, AND ACCESSORIES TABULATION

Aztek Computers, LLC

GTS Technology Solutions, Inc.

Modern Cloud Consult

Software Information Resource
Corp

Tech Advanced Computers Inc

The Repair Depot LLC

Line
Item

Description

Quantity

Unit Cost Total

Unit Cost Total

Unit Cost Total

Unit Cost Total

Unit Cost Total

Unit Cost Total

-

STANDARD LAPTOP

Dell Pro Max 16/16XE MC16250,
210-BPVN - reference complete
build requirements/specifications|
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

165

Each

No Bid No Bid

$1,694.92 $279,661.80

$1,890.00 $311,850.00

$2,632.33 $434,334.45

$2,300.00 $379,500.00

No Bid No Bid

~

ENHANCED LAPTOP

Dell Pro Max 16 MC16255, 210-
BRYZ - reference complete build
requirements/specifications
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

74

Each

No Bid No Bid

$1,836.16 $135,875.84

$1,620.00 $119,880.00

$2,969.06 $219,710.44

$2,635.00 $194,990.00

No Bid No Bid

w

HACK DESKTOP

Dell Pro Max Slim FCS1250, 210-
BPST - reference complete build
requirements/specifications
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

Each

No Bid No Bid

$3,055.56 $6,111.12

$1,890.00 $3,780.00

$4,325.21 $8,650.42

$3,620.00 $7,240.00

No Bid No Bid

NDC RUGGED LAPTOP
WITH GOBI

Dell Pro Rugged 14 RB14250, 210-|
BNNG - reference complete build
requirements/specifications
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

Each

No Bid No Bid

$2,780.90 $13,904.50

$1,935.00 $9,675.00

$3,851.46 $19,257.30

$3,490.00 $17,450.00

No Bid No Bid

NDC RUGGED LAPTOP
WITHOUT GOBI

Dell Pro Rugged 14 RB14250, 210-|
BNNG - reference complete build
requirements/specifications
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

Each

No Bid No Bid

$2,711.86 $2,711.86

$2,250.00 $2,250.00

$3,764.95 $3,764.95

$3,380.00 $3,380.00

No Bid No Bid

STANDARD DESKTOP

Dell Pro Micro QCM1250 -
reference complete build
requirements/specifications
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

99

Each

No Bid No Bid

$1,036.41 $102,604.59

$690.00 $68,310.00

$1,475.20 $146,044.80

$1,300.00 $128,700.00

No Bid No Bid

DETACHABLE LAPTOP

Dell Latitude 7350 Detachable,
210-BLXW - reference complete
build requirements/specifications|
located in Attachment F,
Specifications - Collin County
Standard Hardware

Each

No Bid No Bid

$1,882.02 $1,882.02

$1,500.00 $1,500.00

$2,286.22 $2,286.22

$2,650.00 $2,650.00

$1,100.00 $1,100.00

WIRELESS KEYBOARD
AND MOUSE

Dell Pro Plus Multi-device
Wireless Keyboard and Mouse -

KM7321W, 580-AJIX

DETACHABLE
KEYBOARD AND
ACTIVE PEN

Each

No Bid No Bid

$65.92 $65.92

$75.00 $75.00

$79.68 $79.68

$63.00 $63.00

$22.00 $22.00

Latitude 7350 Detachable
Collaboration Keyboard and
Active Pen - US English, 580-BBQL|

Each

No Bid No Bid

$177.42 $177.42

$189.00 $189.00

$196.86 $196.86

$205.00 $205.00

No Bid No Bid

24" MONITORS

Dell Pro 24 Plus Monitor P2425H,
210-BMGH

569

Each

$210.00 $119,490.00

$130.31 $74,146.39

$180.00 $102,420.00

$174.28 $99,165.32

$159.00 $90,471.00

$175.00 $99,575.00

THUNDERBOLT DOCK

Dell Pro Thunderbolt 4 Smart
Dock SD25TB4, 210-BMRQK

18

Each

$350.00 $6,300.00

$244.32 $4,397.76

$300.00 $5,400.00

$332.72 $5,988.96

$295.00 $5,310.00

No Bid No Bid

WIRED KEYBOARD

Dell Wired Keyboard KB216 Black,|
580-ADMT

242

Each

$20.00 $4,840.00

$11.61 $2,809.62

$13.00 $3,146.00

$14.06 $3,402.52

$12.50 $3,025.00

$15.00 $3,630.00

OPTICAL MOUSE

Dell Optical Mouse MS116 Black,
275-BBCB

242

Each

$20.00 $4,840.00

$11.61 $2,809.62

$13.00 $3,146.00

$14.06 $3,402.52

$12.50 $3,025.00

$15.00 $3,630.00

BACKPACK

Dell EcoLoop Pro Backpack, 460-
BDKH

242

Each

No Bid No Bid

$46.49 $11,250.58

$60.00 $14,520.00

$56.24 $13,610.08

$44.00 $10,648.00

$52.00 $12,584.00

ROLLING LAPTOP BAG

Targus Rolling Laptop Bag,
TBROO3US

Each

No Bid No Bid

$80.74 $80.74

$95.00 $95.00

$78.54 $78.54

$83.00 $83.00

No Bid No Bid

USB HUB

Anker 4-port USB 3.0 Hub,
A7516016

Each

No Bid No Bid

$7.82 $7.82

$10.00 $10.00

$19.00 $19.00

$13.00 $13.00

No Bid No Bid

USB CTO USB A HUB

USB C to USB A 4-port hub, USBC-|
HUB4A

Each

No Bid No Bid

$20.04 $20.04

$20.00 $20.00

$18.90 $18.90

$22.00 $22.00

No Bid No Bid

USB C MULTIPORT
ADAPTER

Dell Pro 7-in-1 USB C Multiport
Adapter, 470-AETL

Each

No Bid No Bid

$70.45 $70.45

$100.00 $100.00

$93.74 $93.74

$74.00 $74.00

No Bid No Bid

ALL-IN-ONE STAND

Dell Pro Micro All-In-One Stand

MFS22, 452-BDUB

99

Each

No Bid No Bid

$87.38 $8,650.62

$115.00 $11,385.00

$112.49 $11,136.51

$85.00 $8,415.00

No Bid No Bid

*DRAFT UNTIL AWARD

Dell Partner Level

$600.00 | $135,470.00

$15,951.94 | $647,238.71

$12,945.00 | $657,751.00

$22,495.00 | $971,241.21

$20,443.00 | $855,264.00

$1,379.00 | $120,541.00

No response to request for level
Does not meet specifications

Titanium level

No response to request for level
Does not meet specifications

Gold Level
Does not meet specifications

Certified Authorized Partner
Does not meet specifications

Not a partner - reseller TD SYNNEX
Does not meet specifications




