
IFB 2025-292 ROAD MATERIALS, FLEXIBLE BASE

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Line Item Description Quantity UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1
DELIVERED ZONE 1 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps 1 TON $31.08 $31.08 $47.46 $47.46 No Bid No Bid $43.52 $43.52

2
DELIVERED ZONE 2 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps (Weston stockpile) 15000 TON $31.08 $466,200.00 $47.46 $711,900.00 No Bid No Bid $42.51 $637,650.00

3
DELIVERED ZONE 3 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps 1 TON $31.08 $31.08 $53.57 $53.57 No Bid No Bid $46.49 $46.49

4
DELIVERED ZONE 4 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps (McKinney stockpile) 15000 TON $32.08 $481,200.00 $53.57 $803,550.00 No Bid No Bid $41.23 $618,450.00

5
DELIVERED ZONE 5 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps 1 TON $31.08 $31.08 $53.57 $53.57 No Bid No Bid $42.72 $42.72

6
DELIVERED ZONE 6 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps (Farmersville stockpile) 15000 TON $31.08 $466,200.00 $53.57 $803,550.00 No Bid No Bid $45.53 $682,950.00

7
DELIVERED ZONE 7- Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps 1 TON $32.08 $32.08 $62.74 $62.74 No Bid No Bid $42.12 $42.12

8
DELIVERED ZONE 8 - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type A) 
See Attachment A Zone Maps (Copeville stockpile) 15000 TON $32.08 $481,200.00 $62.74 $941,100.00 No Bid No Bid $42.51 $637,650.00

TOTAL: $251.64 $1,894,925.32 $434.68 $3,260,317.34 $346.63 $2,576,874.85

Line Item Description Quantity UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

9
PICK UP AT PLANT SITE - Flexible Base (Grade 1, Type 
A) 1 TON $14.38 $14.38 $17.90 $17.90 $9.75 $9.75 $16.00 $16.00

Address of Plant for PICKUP

with calculated mileage from GIS Coordinates 33.244353, -96.627211
Unit Cost with mileage: Unit Cost with mileage: Unit Cost with mileage: Unit Cost with mileage:

$130.58 $132.70 $121.75 $164.40
Vendor responded No to 
cooperative purchasing

Originally entered $0 lines 1-8.
Confirmed as No Bid

Vendor responded No to 
cooperative purchasing

Approx 83 miles, roundtrip 166 x 
.70 IRS tax rate = $116.20

Approx 82 miles, roundtrip 164 x 
.70 IRS tax rate = $114.80

Approx 80 miles, roundtrip 160 x 
.70 IRS tax rate = $112.00

13138 W. Crusher Rd, Coleman, OK 
73432

1400 W. Crusher Rd., Coleman, OK 
73432

15256 FM 1201, Gainesville, TX 
76240

GLS Materials & Trucking, LLC Hammett Excavation, Inc.
TriCounty Materials and 

Services, LP Vulcan Materials Company

1111 Gilbert Pit Road, Millsap, TX 
76066

Approx 106 miles, roundtrip 212 x 
.70 IRS tax rate = $148.40

GLS Materials & Trucking, LLC Hammett Excavation, Inc.
TriCounty Materials and 

Services, LP Vulcan Materials Company
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