
2026-046 OEM Toner, Ink Cartridges, and Supplies for Printers Sample Pricing Bid Tabulation

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

1

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
2 Lexmark 74C1SK0 205 $137.14 $28,113.70 $151.49 $31,055.45 $144.22 $29,565.10 $189.89 $38,927.45 $159.95 $32,789.75
3 Lexmark 71C10K0 200 $86.91 $17,382.00 $105.25 $21,050.00 $162.39 $32,478.00 $131.28 $26,256.00 $124.95 $24,990.00
4 Lexmark 50F1H00 190 $114.56 $21,766.40 $131.89 $25,059.10 $155.40 $29,526.00 $177.14 $33,656.60 $84.95 $16,140.50
5 Lexmark 74C10Y0 140 $87.00 $12,180.00 $105.72 $14,800.80 $100.65 $14,091.00 $132.53 $18,554.20 $119.95 $16,793.00
6 Lexmark 74C10M0 135 $87.00 $11,745.00 $105.72 $14,272.20 $100.65 $13,587.75 $132.53 $17,891.55 $119.95 $16,193.25
7 Lexmark 71C10Y0 135 $138.05 $18,636.75 $167.92 $22,669.20 $249.29 $33,654.15 $210.48 $28,414.80 $184.95 $24,968.25
8 Lexmark 52D1H00 135 $299.44 $40,424.40 $396.03 $53,464.05 $435.53 $58,796.55 $493.93 $66,680.55 $119.95 $16,193.25
9 Lexmark 74C10C0 130 $87.00 $11,310.00 $105.72 $13,743.60 $100.65 $13,084.50 $132.53 $17,228.90 $119.95 $15,593.50
10 Lexmark 71C10M0 130 $138.05 $17,946.50 $167.92 $21,829.60 $246.69 $32,069.70 $210.48 $27,362.40 $184.95 $24,043.50
11 Lexmark 71C10C0 125 $138.05 $17,256.25 $167.92 $20,990.00 $249.29 $31,161.25 $209.44 $26,180.00 $184.95 $23,118.75
12 Lexmark 70C1HK0 125 $80.50 $10,062.50 $96.31 $12,038.75 $91.70 $11,462.50 $120.74 $15,092.50 $94.95 $11,868.75
13 Lexmark 78C1XK0 100 $113.82 $11,382.00 $138.21 $13,821.00 $131.58 $13,158.00 $173.25 $17,325.00 $149.95 $14,995.00
14 Lexmark 78C1XM0 80 $139.58 $11,166.40 $169.78 $13,582.40 $161.63 $12,930.40 $211.76 $16,940.80 $179.95 $14,396.00
15 Lexmark 78C1XY0 80 $139.58 $11,166.40 $169.78 $13,582.40 $161.63 $12,930.40 $211.76 $16,940.80 $179.95 $14,396.00
16 Lexmark 58D1H00 75 $172.67 $12,950.25 $192.26 $14,419.50 $231.31 $17,348.25 $262.33 $19,674.75 $209.95 $15,746.25
17 Lexmark 55B1000 80 $76.50 $6,120.00 $72.61 $5,808.80 $79.85 $6,388.00 $90.56 $7,244.80 $109.95 $8,796.00
18 Lexmark 66S1000 100 $119.49 $11,949.00 $116.33 $11,633.00 $169.99 $16,999.00 $146.62 $14,662.00 $134.95 $13,495.00
19 Lexmark 75M10K0 100 $77.00 $7,700.00 $75.12 $7,512.00 $118.19 $11,819.00 $94.69 $9,469.00 $94.95 $9,495.00
20 Lexmark 75M10C0 100 $84.00 $8,400.00 $81.56 $8,156.00 $129.79 $12,979.00 $102.79 $10,279.00 $99.95 $9,995.00
21 Lexmark 75M10M0 100 $84.00 $8,400.00 $81.56 $8,156.00 $129.79 $12,979.00 $102.79 $10,279.00 $99.95 $9,995.00
22 Lexmark 75M10Y0 100 $84.00 $8,400.00 $81.56 $8,156.00 $119.99 $11,999.00 $102.79 $10,279.00 $99.95 $9,995.00

Subtotal $304,457.55 Subtotal $355,799.85 Subtotal $429,006.55 Subtotal $449,339.10 Subtotal $343,996.75

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

23

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
24 Lexmark C734X20G 50 $31.00 $1,550.00 $46.36 $2,318.00 $55.99 $2,799.50 $46.32 $2,316.00 $44.95 $2,247.50
25 Lexmark 52D0Z00 40 $45.00 $1,800.00 $57.86 $2,314.40 $49.16 $1,966.40 $55.75 $2,230.00 $49.95 $1,998.00
26 Lexmark 41X0252 30 $342.63 $10,278.90 $343.85 $10,315.50 $474.90 $14,247.00 $486.10 $14,583.00 $499.95 $14,998.50
27 Lexmark C540X75G 25 $8.50 $212.50 $12.38 $309.50 $9.10 $227.50 $12.06 $301.50 $24.95 $623.75
28 Lexmark 74C0W00 25 $20.00 $500.00 $28.57 $714.25 $33.29 $832.25 $27.54 $688.50 $44.95 $1,123.75
29 Lexmark 40X8420 25 $233.31 $5,832.75 $221.82 $5,545.50 $329.03 $8,225.75 $292.68 $7,317.00 $309.95 $7,748.75

Subtotal $20,174.15 Subtotal $21,517.15 Subtotal $28,298.40 Subtotal $27,436.00 Subtotal $28,740.25

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

30

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
31 HP CF361A 5 $146.35 $731.75 $260.53 $1,302.65 $210.94 $1,054.70 $247.13 $1,235.65 $219.95 $1,099.75
32 HP CF363A 5 $146.35 $731.75 $260.53 $1,302.65 $210.94 $1,054.70 $247.13 $1,235.65 $219.95 $1,099.75
33 HP CF362A 5 $146.35 $731.75 $260.53 $1,302.65 $210.94 $1,054.70 $247.13 $1,235.65 $219.95 $1,099.75
34 HP W2110X 2 $86.00 $172.00 $118.34 $236.68 $113.93 $227.86 $112.24 $224.48 $109.95 $219.90

Subtotal $2,367.25 Subtotal $4,144.63 Subtotal $3,391.96 Subtotal $3,931.43 Subtotal $3,519.15

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

35

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
36 HP C2P05AN#140 15 $50.00 $750.00 $58.20 $873.00 $41.97 $629.55 $54.64 $819.60 $64.95 $974.25
37 HP C2P07AN#140 15 $52.00 $780.00 $60.47 $907.05 $45.65 $684.75 $56.77 $851.55 $69.95 $1,049.25
38 HP F6U19AN#140 15 $55.00 $825.00 $66.18 $992.70 $54.19 $812.85 $62.15 $932.25 $74.95 $1,124.25
39 HP P2V71A 10 $162.00 $1,620.00 $174.60 $1,746.00 $201.19 $2,011.90 $163.70 $1,637.00 $179.95 $1,799.50
40 HP L0S55AN#140 10 $25.00 $250.00 $29.27 $292.70 $20.70 $207.00 $27.48 $274.80 $44.95 $449.50
41 HP P2V72A 10 $162.00 $1,620.00 $174.60 $1,746.00 $200.79 $2,007.90 $163.70 $1,637.00 $179.95 $1,799.50
42 HP T6M14AN#140 5 $50.00 $250.00 $58.20 $291.00 $45.87 $229.35 $54.64 $273.20 $64.95 $324.75

Subtotal $6,095.00 Subtotal $6,848.45 Subtotal $6,583.30 Subtotal $6,425.40 Subtotal $7,521.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

43

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
44 HP P2V27A 5 $113.00 $565.00 $120.87 $604.35 $138.69 $693.45 $113.31 $566.55 $129.95 $649.75

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R
10/13/2027

43%

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R

Lexmark CS720, 728, CS/CX725, 727, C4150, XC4140, 4150 90K Waste Container

Line

HP 952XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge 

TIPS 240101

5/31/2029

11/30/2027
31%

BuyBoard 755-24

TIPS 230105
10/13/2027

43%

5/31/202811/30/2027 5/31/2029

Percent Discount Off All HP Toner Cartridges

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R
10/13/2027

43%

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R
10/13/2027

43%

ODP

Lexmark MS531, 631, 632, MX532, 632 Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS531, 632, CX532, 635 Black Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS531, 632, CX532, 635 Cyan Return Program 2K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS531, 632, CX532, 635 Magenta Return Program 2K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS531, 632, CX532, 635 Yellow Return Program 2K Toner Cartridge

Omnia Partners 19-12R
10/13/2027

43%

Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Magenta Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Category I - Lexmark Toner Cartridges

Category II - Other Lexmark Supplies

HP 206X High Yield Black Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge 

TIPS 230105

HP 508A Cyan Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
HP 508A Magenta Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge
HP 508A Yellow Original LaserJet Toner Cartridge

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

GovConnection, Inc.

5/31/2028
TIPS 240101

  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Yellow Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Line
BuyBoard 755-24

11/30/2027
TIPS 230105

Lexmark MS/MX431, MX432 Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge

20.00%

GovConnection, Inc.
Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 

Ranch Office Supplies
Coast to Coast Computer 

Products, Inc.

Category IV - HP Ink Cartridges

5/31/2028

HP 952 Yellow Original Ink Cartridge
HP 730 300-ml Gray DesignJet Ink Cartridge
HP 902XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge

HP 62XL High Yield Black Original Ink Cartridge
HP 62XL High Yield Tri-color Original Ink Cartridge

Percent Discount Off All HP Ink Cartridges

HP 731 DesignJet Printhead

HP 730 300-ml Matte Black DesignJet Ink Cartridge

0%34%

Line

Category III - HP Toner Cartridges

5/31/2028

Lexmark C/X73x, 74x 1-Pack 20K Photoconductor Kit
Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 812, MS811, 817, 818, MX717, 718 Return Program 100K Imaging Unit
Lexmark Fuser 110-120V, Type 00 
Lexmark C54x, X54x 18K Waste Container

Percent Discount Off All Other Lexmark Supplies (excludes toners)

Lexmark MS81x, MX71x, MX81x Return Program Fuser Maintenance Kit 

GovConnection, Inc.

Percent Discount Off All Other HP Supplies (excludes toner & ink)

Percent Discount Off All Lexmark Toner Cartridges
Line 

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

TIPS 240402

30-40%

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

TIPS 240402

Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Yellow Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark MS821, 823, 825, MS/MX725, 822, 826 Return Program 15K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark MS/MX710, 711, 810, 811, 812 Return Program 25K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Cyan Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge

  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Magenta Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Cyan Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark CS310, CS/CX410, 510 Black Return Program 4K Toner Cartridge 
Lexmark CS/CX421, 52x, 62x Black Return Program 8.5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Black Return Program 7K Toner Cartridge
  Lexmark CS/CX730, 735 Black Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge

Lexmark MS/MX310, 312, 315, 410, 415, 510, 511, 610, 611 Return Program 5K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Yellow Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge
Lexmark CS720, CS/CX725 Magenta Return Program 3K Toner Cartridge

TIPS 230105

0%

BuyBoard 755-24

42%

20.00% 30-40%0.0%
5/31/2029 6/30/2027

0%30% 20.00% 30-40%
5/31/2029 6/30/20275/31/202811/30/2027

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

11/30/2027

6/30/2027

6/30/2027

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Line

Category V - Other HP Supplies
TIPS 240402

TIPS 230105BuyBoard 755-24 TIPS 240101 TIPS 240402

16%

30-40%

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

TIPS 240402

30-40%

GovConnection, Inc.
Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 

Ranch Office Supplies
Coast to Coast Computer 

Products, Inc.
Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 

Dba World Wide Imaging 

5/31/2029 6/30/2027

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

GovConnection, Inc.

0.0%

20.00%

20.00%

TIPS 240101

BuyBoard 755-24 TIPS 240101



45 HP F2G76A 2 $329.73 $659.46 $427.56 $855.12 $373.94 $747.88 $400.12 $800.24 $424.95 $849.90
46 HP C9384A 1 $95.00 $95.00 $101.96 $101.96 $78.97 $78.97 $95.59 $95.59 $114.95 $114.95
47 HP C9380A 1 $95.00 $95.00 $101.96 $101.96 $78.97 $78.97 $95.59 $95.59 $114.95 $114.95

Subtotal $1,414.46 Subtotal $1,663.39 Subtotal $1,599.27 Subtotal $1,557.97 Subtotal $1,729.55

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

48

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
49 OKI DATA 45536516 3 $172.00 $516.00 $188.16 $564.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 OKI DATA 45536515 3 $325.00 $975.00 $356.16 $1,068.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 OKI DATA 45536514 3 $325.00 $975.00 $356.16 $1,068.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 OKI DATA 45536513 3 $325.00 $975.00 $356.16 $1,068.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal $3,441.00 Subtotal $3,769.92 $0.00 Subtotal $0.00 $0.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

53

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
54 OKI DATA 45531502 1 $39.00 $39.00 $41.44 $41.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 OKI DATA 45103728 1 $277.00 $277.00 $305.76 $305.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 OKI DATA 45103727 1 $427.00 $427.00 $473.76 $473.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 OKI DATA 45531112 1 $480.00 $480.00 $529.76 $529.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal $1,223.00 Subtotal $1,350.72 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

58

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
59 Brother TN431BK 5 $72.50 $362.50 $86.50 $432.50 $109.29 $546.45 $83.15 $415.75 $99.95 $499.75
60 Brother TN433C 5 $116.00 $580.00 $93.89 $469.45 $127.18 $635.90 $140.29 $701.45 $159.95 $799.75
61 Brother TN433M 5 $116.00 $580.00 $93.89 $469.45 $126.39 $631.95 $140.29 $701.45 $159.95 $799.75
62 Brother TN433Y 5 $116.00 $580.00 $93.89 $469.45 $127.29 $636.45 $140.29 $701.45 $159.95 $799.75

Subtotal $2,102.50 Subtotal $1,840.85 Subtotal $2,450.75 Subtotal $2,520.10 Subtotal $2,899.00

Co-op Contract
Term Ends

63

Manufacturer Manf. Item No.
Estimated 

Annual Usage Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended Price Per Each Extended
64 Brother DR431CL 2 $149.35 $298.70 $114.82 $229.64 $102.59 $205.18 $156.66 $313.32 $159.95 $319.90
65 Brother WT320CL 1 $23.00 $23.00 $24.92 $24.92 $30.49 $30.49 $24.08 $24.08 $34.95 $34.95

Subtotal $321.70 Subtotal $254.56 Subtotal $235.67 Subtotal $337.40 Subtotal $354.85
*Draft until award Total $341,596.61 Total $397,189.52 Total $471,565.90 Total $491,547.40 Total $388,760.55
Primary Award     
Secondary Award  
Tertiary Award
SCW - Email of No Bid
Perry - Email of No Bid

PROPOSED CONRACT DATE - 02/01/2026 - 01/31/2027 - COOP Must be valid through Jan. 2027  

  
  
  
  
  
  
  

5/31/2028

43%

5/31/2029

Brother TN431BK Standard Yield Toner, Black, Yields Approx 3,000 Pages
Brother TN433C High Yield Toner, Cyan, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages

43%

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R

ODP

No Bid
 

43%

ODP

No Bid
 

43%

ODP

Omnia Partners 19-12R
10/13/2027

11/30/2027

No Bid

OKI DATA C931E Waste Toner Container
OKI DATA C931E Black Image Drum

OKI DATA C931E Fuser - 120V

OKI DATA C931E Black Toner
OKI DATA C931E Cyan Toner
OKI DATA C931E Magenta Toner
OKI DATA C931E Yellow Toner

HP LaserJet 110V Maintenance Kit 

GovConnection, Inc.

Brother WT320CL Waste Toner Box, Yields Approx 50,000 Pages

15% 20.00%Percent Discount Off All Other Brother Supplies (excludes toner)

TIPS 240101

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Brother TN433Y High Yield Toner, Yellow, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages

TIPS 230105

 

GovConnection, Inc.
Category VI - OKI DATA Toner Cartridges

Percent Discount Off All OKI DATA Toner Cartridges

0.0%

5%

BuyBoard 755-24 TIPS 240101

Percent Discount Off All Brother Toner Cartridges

Percent Discount Off All Other OKI DATA Supplies (excludes toner)

OKI DATA C931E Cyan Image Drum

Brother TN433M High Yield Toner, Magenta, Yields Approx 4,000 Pages

TIPS 230105

No Bid

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

No BidBuyBoard 755-24 TIPS 240101
 

5/31/2029 6/30/2027
30-40%

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

Coast to Coast Computer 
Products, Inc.

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

BuyBoard 755-24 TIPS 240101 No Bid

20.00%

Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 
Ranch Office Supplies

Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 
Dba World Wide Imaging 

11/30/2027

5% 20.00%

GovConnection, Inc.

0.0%

5/31/2029  

11/30/2027

 

30-40%

GovConnection, Inc.
Dream Ranch LLC dba Dream 

Ranch Office Supplies
Coast to Coast Computer 

Products, Inc.
Zapopan Busines Group LLC. 

Dba World Wide Imaging 

BuyBoard 755-24
5/31/2029 6/30/20275/31/202811/30/2027

TIPS 240402
10/13/2027

TIPS 240402

15% 20.00%

Line

Brother DR431CL Drum Unit

Line

Category VII - Other OKI DATA Supplies

Line

Category VIII - Brother Toner Cartridges

Line

Category IX - Other Brother Supplies

HP 72 Matte Black and Yellow DesignJet Printhead
HP 72 Gray and Photo Black DesignJet Printhead


