2025-166 Lab Services for Collin County Health Care Services

Clinical Pathology Laboratories

Filos Health Laboratory Inc

Rural Mobile Health and
Wellness

EStimated
Annual
Quantity
Based On |Unit of Results Results Results
Line Past |Measur TAT in TAT in TATin
Item |Test Usage |e Unit Cost Days Unit Cost Days |Unit Cost Days
1 ABO BLOOD TYPING 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00 2 day $15.75 $15.75| 1-2 Days $275.40 $275.40 1
AEROBIC & ANAEROBIC CULT 3 EACH $15.00 $45.00/  5day $35.40 $106.20| 1-2 Days $10.00 $30.00 2
3 ALBUMIN 1 EACH $5.00 $5.00 1day $9.50 $9.50| 1-2 Days $5.50 $5.50 1
4 |ALBUMIN/CRT RATIO,RNDM UR 35 EACH $15.00 $525.00 1day $14.50 $507.50| 1-2 Days $6.30|  $220.50 1
5 ALDOSTERONE/RENIN RATIO 1 EACH $65.00 $65.00| 3-7 day $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $126.00 $126.00 2
6 |ALKALINE PHOSPHATASE 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $8.00 $8.00| 1-2 Days $5.70 $5.70 1
7 AMYLASE 5 EACH $5.00 $25.00 1day $15.25 $76.25| 1-2 Days $7.00 $35.00 1
8 |ANA AUTOIMMUNE PROFILE 1 EACH $75.00 $75.00/ 4day $185.20 $185.20| 1-2 Days $14.00 $14.00 3
9 ANTI-NUCLEAR ANTIBODIES 10 EACH $22.00 $220.00 4 day $17.80 $178.00| 1-2 Days $14.00 $140.00 2
10 |B. PERTUSSIS/PARAPERTUSSIS BY PCR 1 EACH $90.00 $90.00| 3-6 day $195.00 $195.00| 1-2 Days $12.50 $12.50 1
11 [BACTERIAL VAGINOSIS, NAAT 1 EACH $65.00 $65.00| 5-7 day $93.00 $93.00| 1-2 Days $263.50 $263.50 3
12 |BASIC METABOLIC + E-GFR 1 EACH $4.50 $4.50| 1day $20.00 $20.00| 1-2 Days $14.25 $14.25 1
13 [BASIC METABOLIC PANEL 1 EACH $4.50 $4.50 1day $20.00 $20.00| 1-2 Days $9.00 $9.00 1
14 |BETA-2 GLYCOPROTEIN 1IGG/IGM 1 EACH $40.00 $40.00| 1-2 day $35.00 $35.00| 1-2 Days $26.00 $26.00 1
15 |[BETA-LACTAMASE 1 EACH $12.00 $12.00 3 day $20.00 $20.00| 1-2 Days $5.25 $5.25 3
16 |BILIRUBIN, TOTAL 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $6.00 $6.00 1
17 |BUN 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $8.00 $8.00| 1-2 Days $4.50 $4.50 1
18 |C. DIFFICILE GDH REFLEX TOXIN/PCR 1 EACH $25.00 $25.00/ 1day $195.00 $195.00| 2-3 Days $38.00 $38.00 3
19 [CALC MICROALB/CREAT RND 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $35.50 $35.50| 1-2 Days $6.75 $6.75 2
20 |[CALCIUM 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $8.25 $8.25| 1-2 Days $5.75 $5.75 1
21 |[CALCULATED A/G RATIO 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $16.25 $16.25| 1-2 Days $5.50 $5.50 1
22 |CALCULATED BUN/CREAT 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $16.25 $16.25| 1-2 Days $5.50 $5.50 1
23 |CALCULATED GLOBULIN 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $17.50 $17.50| 1-2 Days $13.00 $13.00 1
24 |CALCULATED LDL CHOL 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.00 $5.00 1
25 |CALCULUS ANALYSIS 1 EACH $45.00 $45.00| 4-6 day $50.00 $50.00| 1-2 Days $12.10 $12.10 1
26 |CANDIDA, NAAT 1 EACH $65.00 $65.00| 5-7 day $195.00 $195.00| 1-2 Days $12.50 $12.50 3
27 |CARBON DIOXIDE 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $8.00 $8.00| 1-2 Days $5.40 $5.40 1
28 |CARDIOLIPIN ANTIBODIES 1 EACH $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 day $39.65 $39.65| 1-2 Days $26.00 $26.00 2
29 |CBC W/AUTO DIFF 238 EACH $4.00 $952.00 1day $15.55 $3,700.90| 1-2 Days $8.30| $1,975.40 1
30 |CBC W/MANUAL DIFF 391 |EACH $4.00{ $1,564.00] 1day $20.56|  $8,038.96| 1-2 Days $8.30| $3,245.30 1
31 |CCPIGG 3 EACH $15.00 $45.00| 1-2 day $50.00 $150.00| 1-2 Days $13.50 $40.50 1
32 |CHARGE AUTOMATED HEMOGRAM 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00| 2-3 Days $20.50 $20.50 2
33 |CHARGE IDENTIFICATION, ANAEROBE 1 EACH $5.00 $5.00 $45.00 $45.00| 2-3 Days $8.60 $8.60 2
34 |CHARGE IDENTIFICATION, BACTERIAL 12 EACH $5.00 $60.00 $45.00 $540.00| 2-3 Days $8.60]  $103.20 2
35 |CHARGE IDENTIFICATION, STAPH 1 EACH $5.00 $5.00 $35.00 $35.00| 2-3 Days $35.60 $35.60 2
36 |CHARGE IDENTIFICATION, STREP 3 EACH $5.00 $15.00 $35.00 $105.00| 2-3 Days $7.80 $23.40 2
37 |CHARGE MANUAL DIFFERENTIAL WITH WBC 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $22.83 $22.83| 2-3 Days $7.00 $7.00 2
38 |CHARGE NON-IMAGE PAP TEST, SUREPATH 1 EACH $28.00 $28.00 $91.40 $91.40| 2-3 Days $15.55 $15.55 2
39 |CHARGE ONLY PAP WITH PATH REVIEW 3 EACH $10.00 $30.00 $65.00 $195.00| 2-3 Days $18.70 $56.10 3
40 |CHARGE ONLY PAPSMEAR THIN LAYER 11 EACH $28.00 $308.00 $65.50 $720.50| 2-3 Days $18.70|  $205.70 3
41 |CHARGE ONLY RPRTITER 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $35.50 $35.50| 2-3 Days $12.55 $12.55 2
42 |CHLAMYDIA TRACHOMATIS, NAA 2 EACH $40.00 $80.00| 2-4 day $195.00 $390.00| 2-3 Days $12.35 $24.70 2
43 |CHLAMYDIA/GC AMPLIFICATION 46 EACH $80.00| $3,680.00| 2-4day $205.00 $9,430.00| 2-3 Days $13.20 $607.20 2
44 |CHLORIDE 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.50 $5.50 1
45 |CHOLESTEROL 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $16.25 $16.25| 1-2 Days $5.00 $5.00 1
46 |CHOLESTEROL 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $16.25 $16.25| 1-2 Days $5.00 $5.00 1
47 |CK, TOTAL 1 EACH $6.00 $6.00 1day $18.25 $18.25| 1-2 Days $5.65 $5.65 1
48 |COMP METABOLIC PANEL 885 |EACH $4.75| $4,203.75| 1day $24.99| $22,116.15| 1-2 Days $9.00| $7,965.00 1
49 |COVID-19 TESTING 1 EACH $70.00 $70.00| 3-5day $55.00 $55.00| 1-2 Days $51.85 $51.85 1
50 |[C-PEPTIDE 1 EACH $25.00 $25.00/ 2 day $55.00 $55.00| 1-2 Days $21.35 $21.35 1
51 |C-REACTIVE PROTEIN 8 EACH $7.00 $56.00| 1-2 day $25.50 $204.00| 1-2 Days $5.65 $45.20 1
52 |CREATININE 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00| 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.70 $5.70 1
53 |CREATININE, RANDOM URINE 1 EACH $6.00 $6.00 1day $9.50 $9.50| 1-2 Days $35.60 $35.60 1
54 |CT/NG RECTAL OR ORAL 3 EACH $80.00 $240.00| 2-4 day $195.00 $585.00| 2-3 Days $35.60|  $106.80 3
55 |CT/NG,NAAT,URINE 46 EACH $80.00| $3,680.00| 2-4day $195.00 $8,970.00| 2-3 Days $35.60| $1,637.60 3
56 |CT/NG,TMA,SIMPLESWAB 5 EACH $50.00 $250.00| 2-4 day $195.00 $975.00| 2-3 Days $35.60|  $178.00 3
57 |CULTURE, ROUTINE 1 EACH $8.00 $8.00 5 day $85.00 $85.00| 2-3 Days $10.85 $10.85 2
58 |CULTURE, ROUTINE SENSITIVITY ON ALL 2 EACH $8.00 $16.00/ 5day $85.00 $170.00| 2-3 Days $40.50 $81.00 2
59 |CULTURE, STREP SCREEN 1 EACH $8.00 $8.00 3 day $35.00 $35.00| 2-3 Days $7.80 $7.80 2
60 |CULTURE, THROAT 5 EACH $8.00 $40.00| 3 day $35.00 $175.00| 2-3 Days $7.80 $39.00 2
61 |CULTURE, URINE 34 EACH $8.00 $272.00 4 day $85.00 $2,890.00| 2-3 Days $9.15 $311.10 1
62 |[CULTURE,STOOL 1 EACH $15.00 $15.00/ 3 day $85.00 $85.00| 2-3 Days $10.00 $10.00 2
63 |CYSTATIN-C 1 EACH $50.00 $50.00| 3-4 day $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $19.05 $19.05 2
64 |[DHEA SULFATE 1 EACH $22.00 $22.00/ 2day $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $22.75 $22.75 2
65 |DNA DS ANTIBODY 2 EACH $20.00 $40.00| 1-2 day $45.00 $90.00| 2-3 Days $13.75 $27.50 1
66 |DNA DS ANTIBODY REFLEX 1 EACH $25.00 $25.00] 1-2 day $53.00 $53.00| 2-3 Days $14.25 $14.25 1
67 |ELECTROLYTES PANEL 1 EACH $7.00 $7.00 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $7.50 $7.50 2
68 |ESTRADIOL 2 EACH $21.00 $42.00| 1day $75.00 $150.00| 1-2 Days $28.45 $56.90 2
69 |ESTRADIOL, ULTRASENS 1 EACH $65.00 $65.00| 3-6 day $75.00 $75.00| 1-2 Days $56.40 $56.40 2
70 |EXTRA CULTURE 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $10.85 $10.85 1
71 |FERRITIN 6 EACH $12.00 $72.00 2 day $35.50 $213.00| 1-2 Days $14.15 $84.90 1
72 |FOLATE, RBC 1 EACH $16.00 $16.00] 1day $50.29 $50.29| 1-2 Days $18.15 $18.15 1




73 _[FOLIC ACID 2 [eAcH $15.00 $30.00]  1day $34.00 $68.00] 1-2 Days $18.15]  $36.30] 1
74 |FOLLICLE STIM HORMONE 1 [EACH $15.00 $15.00[ 1-2 day $35.00 $35.00( 1-2 Days $19.10]  $19.10] 1
75 |FREET3 2 [eacH $19.00 $38.00] 1-2 day $23.56 $47.12[ 1-2 Days $10.00]  $2000] 1
76 |FREE T4 (THYROXINE) 8 [EACH $11.50 $92.00[ 3 day $23.56 $188.48| 1-2 Days $15.30]  $122.40] 1
77 |FRUCTOSAMINE 1 [EACH $25.00 $25.00] 2-5 day $45.00 $45.00( 1-2 Days $4.45 sa45] 1
78 |FSH + LH PROFILE 2 [eAcH $30.00 $60.00[ 1-2 day $95.00 $190.00] 1-2 Days $19.10]  $38.20] 1
79 |GGT 1 [EACH $4.00 $4.00] 1day $35.00 $35.00] 1-2 Days $4.45 sa45] 1
80 |GLUCOSE 1 [EACH $4.00 $4.00] 1day $8.50 $8.50] 1-2 Days $3.80 $3.80] 1
81 |[HCG, QUANTITATIVE 2 [eacH $12.00 $24.00]  1day $40.29 $80.58] 1-2 Days $15.80]  $31.60] 1
82 |HCv ANTIBODY 1 [EACH $11.00 $11.00[ 2 day $35.50 $35.50( 1-2 Days $14.80]  s14.80] 1
83 [HCV ANTIBODY RFX TO QUANT PCR 1 [EACH $85.00 $85.00] 3 day $150.00 $150.00] 1-2 Days s14.80]  s14.80] 1
84 |HDL CHOLESTEROL 1 [EACH $4.00 $4.00] 1day $16.25 $16.25| 1-2 Days $8.70 $8.70] 1
85 |HEMOGLOBIN A1C 406 |EACH $9.00] $3,654.00] 1day $15.38]  $6,244.28] 1-2 Days $10.25] $4,16150] 1
86 |HEPATIC FUNCTION PANEL 3 [eAcH $4.00 $12.00[  1day $25.50 $76.50| 1-2 Days $8.70]  $26.10[ 1
87 |HEPATITIS AIGM 1 [EACH $9.00 $9.00]  2day $40.29 $40.29[ 1-2 Days s11.80]  $11.80] 1
88 |HEPATITIS B SURF AG 1 [EACH $7.50 $7.50]  1day $47.73 $47.73 1-2 Days $11.25]  $11.25] 1
89 |HEPATITIS B SURFACE AB 1 [EACH $7.50 $7.50]  2day $40.29 $40.29[ 1-2 Days $12.30] $1230] 1
90 |HEPATITIS BS AB QUANT 3 [eAcH $9.00 $27.00[ 2 day $40.29 $120.87| 1-2 Days $25.85]  $77.55] 1
91 [HEPATITIS C ANTIBODY 1 [EACH $11.00 $11.00] 2 day $40.29 $40.29] 1-2 Days s14.80]  s14.80] 1
92 [HEPATITIS PANEL, DIAGNOSTIC WITH REFLEX 1 [eacH $45.00 $45.00[ 2 day $142.80 $142.80] 1-2 Days $25.85]  $25.85] 1
93 [HEPATITIS PANEL,ACUTE 17 [EACH $26.00]  $442.00] 2day $142.80]  $2,427.60] 1-2 Days $48.15]  $818.55] 1
94 |HEPATITIS PROFILE(A,B,C) 6 |EACH $37.00]  $222.00] 2day $149.00 $894.00 1-2 Days $48.15] $288.90] 1
95 [HERPES SIMPLEX 1 & 2 IGG 2 [eacH $20.00 $40.00] 2-4 day $60.10 $120.20] 1-2 Days $14.90]  $29.80] 1
96 |HIGH SENSITIVITY CRP 1 [EACH $9.00 $9.00[ 1-2 day $25.50 $25.50( 1-2 Days $43.35]  $4335] 1
97 [HIV 1 [EACH $12.00 $12.00] 2 day $45.90 $45.90( 2-3 Days $9.40 $9.40[ 1
98 |HIV 1/2 AB AG REFLEX CONF 1 [EACH $12.00 $12.00[ 2 day $45.95 $45.95( 2-3 Days $14.25]  $1425] 1
99 [HIV AB/AG COMBO RFLX CONF 179 [EACH $12.00] $2,148.00] 2day $45.95]  $8,225.05] 2-3 Days $24.60] $4,403.40] 1
100 |HIV AB/P24 AG WITH REFLEX 50 |EACH $12.00]  $600.00] 2day $45.95]  $2,297.50] 2-3 Days $24.60] $1,230.00] 1
101 [HIV-1/HIV-2 QUALITATIVE NAAT 1 [EACH $12.00 $12.00] 2 day $528.40 $528.40] 2-3 Days $35.60]  $35.60] 1
102 |HIV-1/HIV-2 QUALITATIVE RNA 14 [EACH $85.00] $1,190.00] 3 day $528.40]  $7,397.60] 2-3 Days $85.60] $1,198.40] 1
103 [HPV HIGH IF ABNORMAL SUREPATH 6 |EACH $40.00]  $240.00] 4day $550.00]  $3,300.00] 2-3 Days $35.60] $213.60] 1
104 |HPV HIGH RISK 1 [EACH $40.00 $40.00[ 4 day $85.40 $85.40( 2-3 Days $35.60]  $35.60] 1
105 [HPV HIGH RISK WITH GENOTYPE, SP 1 [EACH $40.00 $40.00] 4 day $174.00 $174.00] 2-3 Days $41.05]  $a1.05] 2
106 [HSV 1 [EACH $80.00 $80.00[ 2-4 day $85.40 $85.40( 1-2 Days $20.55]  $20.55] 1
107 [HSV 1/2 AND VZV BY PCR 1 [EACH $162.00]  $162.00] 5-7day $175.00 $175.00] 2-3 Days $35.60]  $35.60] 1
108 |HSV I AND II, VAGINAL SWAB, AMP 1 [EACH $80.00 $80.00[ 2-4 day $175.00 $175.00] 2-3 Days $35.60]  $35.60] 1
109 [HSV IGG & IGM 2 [eacH $40.00 $80.00 $94.00 $188.00] 2-3 Days $42.30]  $sae0] 1
110 [IMMUNOFIXATION, SERUM 1 [EACH $25.00 $25.00]  5day $85.00 $85.00( 2-3 Days $22.85]  $22.85] 1
111 [INFUENZA A+B AG. EIA 1 [EACH $55.00 $55.00] 1-2 day $75.00 $75.00] 1-2 Days $14.65]  $1465] 1
112 [INSULIN 1 [EACH $18.00 $18.00[  1day $45.00 $45.00( 1-2 Days $21.65]  $21.65] 1
113 [INTACT PTH 1 [EACH $25.00 $25.00] 2 day $17.00 $17.00[ 1-2 Days s41.80]  sa180] 1
INTERFERON-GAMMA RELEASE ASSAY (IGRA)

114 |TUBERCULOSIS (T-SPOT) 300 |EACH No Bid No Bid $95.40| $28,620.00| 2-3 Days $62.50/$18,750.00] 1
115 [IRON, SERUM 1 [EACH $7.00 $7.00] 1day $17.50 $17.50( 1-2 Days $7.00 $7.00] 1
116 |IRON+IBC+SATURATION % 11 [EACH $12.00]  $132.00] 1day $71.00 $781.00] 1-2 Days $9.25]  s101.75] 1
117 |KIRBY-BAUER SUSCEPTIBILITY 1 [EACH $5.00 $5.00] 2-3 day $39.58 $39.58] 1-2Days | $130.85] $130.85] 1
118 [LIPASE 7 |eacH $9.00 $63.00]  1day $39.28 $274.96] 1-2 Days $7.40  $51.80] 1
119 |LIPID PANEL 805 [EACH $3.50] $2,817.50] 1day $25.00[ $20,125.00] 1-2 Days $13.90[$11,189.50] 1
120 [LUPUS ANTICOAGULANT SCRN 1 [EACH $45.00 $45.00] 1-4 day $75.00 $75.00] 1-2Days | $841.15] $841.15] 2
121 |MAGNESIUM 2 [eAcH $8.00 $16.00]  1day $15.77 $31.54] 1-2 Days $7.20  $14.40] 1
122 [MANUAL MICROSCOPIC REFLEX 6 |EACH No Bid No Bid $18.83 $112.98] 1-2 Days $5.00]  $30.00] 1
123 |MEASLES BY PCR 1 [EACH $170.00]  $170.00] 3-5day $125.00 $125.00] 1-2 Days $13.40]  $13.40] 1
124 [MICROALBUMIN, RANDOM 1 [EACH $9.50 $9.50]  1day $17.83 $17.83] 1-2 Days $6.70 $6.70] 1
125 |MICROSCOPIC URINALYSIS 1 [EACH $5.00 $5.00] 1day $17.83 $17.83[ 2-3 Days $4.55 $455] 1
126 |MMR AND VARICELLA PANEL (IMMUNITY TITER) 1 [EACH $54.00 $54.00] 3-4 ady $255.90 $255.90] 2-3 Days $14.00]  $14.00] 1
127 |MMR PROFILE 5 [EAcH $32.00]  $160.00] 3-4day $150.93 $754.65| 2-3 Days $13.55]  $67.75] 1
128 [MUMPS VIRUS IGG 3 [eacH $24.00 $72.00] 2-4 day $75.10 $225.30] 2-3 Days $13.55]  $40.65] 1
129 |NEISSERIA GONORRHOEAE, NAA 2 [eAcH $40.00 $80.00[ 2-4 day $195.00 $390.00] 2-3 Days $35.60]  $71.20] 1
130 [OCCULT BLD,FECAL,GUAIAC,SCRN (1-3) 1 [EACH $7.00 $7.00] 1day $25.00 $25.00( 2-3 Days $4.75 $a75] 2
131 |OCCULT BLD,FECALIMMUNOASSAY DIAG 1 [EACH $40.00 $40.00[  1day $25.00 $25.00( 2-3 Days $4.75 $475] 2
132 [OVA AND PARASITES 2 [eacH $30.00 $60.00] 1 day $56.10 $112.20] 2-3 Days $9.40]  s18.80] 2
133 |PAP TEST, SUREPATH, IMAGED 7 [eAcH $28.00]  $196.00] 5day $375.00]  $2,625.00] 2-3 Days $18.70] $130.90] 2
134 [PAP,SP,IM RFLX HPV HI 1 [EACH $28.00 $28.00]  5day $375.00 $375.00] 2-3 Days s18.70]  s18.70] 2
135 |PAP,SP,IM,RFLX HPV 2 [eAcH $28.00 $56.00] 5 day $375.00 $750.00] 2-3 Days $18.70]  $37.40] 2
136 |PAP,SUREPATH IM, HPV HR 43 |eAcH $68.00] $2,924.00] 5 day $375.00] $16,125.00] 2-3 Days $18.70] $s0a.10] 2
137 |PATHOLOGIST SMEAR REVIEW 1 [EACH $10.00 $10.00[ 2 day $75.00 $75.00( 2-3 Days $51.10]  $51.10] 2
138 |PHLEBOTOMY FEE - SINGLE 2 [eacH $5.00 $10.00 $88.00 $176.00] 1-2 Days $25.00]  $50.00] 1
139 |POTASSIUM 1 [EACH $4.00 $4.00] 1day $8.50 $8.50] 1-2 Days $5.30 $5.30] 1
140 [PREGNANCY TEST, SERUM 2 [eacH $8.00 $16.00]  1day $25.50 $51.00( 1-2 Days $9.15]  $1830] 1
141 [PROBNP 1 [EACH $42.00 $42.00[ 1-3 day $55.70 $55.70[ 1-2Days | $391.25] $391.25] 1
142 [PROGESTERONE 1 [EACH $12.00 $12.00]  1day $55.00 $55.00( 1-2 Days $21.40]  $21.40] 1
143 |PROLACTIN 1 [EACH $15.00 $15.00[ 1-2 day $57.00 $57.00( 1-2 Days $19.90]  $19.90] 1
144 [PROTEIN ELEC RFLX IEP 1 [EACH $25.00 $25.00] 3 day $98.40 $98.40[ 1-2 Days $26.75]  $26.75] 1
145 |PROTEIN, TOTAL 1 [EACH $5.00 $5.00] 1day $9.50 $9.50] 1-2 Days $6.15 $6.15] 1
146 |PROTHROMBIN TIME (PT) 3 [eacH $5.50 $16.50]  1day $35.50 $106.50] 1-2 Days $4.80  $14.40] 1
147 |PSA, FREE & TOTAL 7 [eAcH $28.00]  $196.00] 2day $89.50 $626.50] 1-2 Days $18.90] $13230] 1
148 [PSA, TOTAL 24 |EACH $8.00  $192.00] 1day $55.41]  $1,329.84] 1-2 Days $19.85] $476.40] 1
149 |PSA, TOTAL, MEDICARE SCREEN 4 [eAcH $8.00 $32.00[ 1day $55.41 $221.64] 1-2 Days $19.85]  $79.40] 1
150 [PT/INR 1 [EACH $5.50 $5.50]  1day $37.85 $37.85| 1-2 Days $4.80 sa80] 1
151 [PTT 1 [EACH $7.00 $7.00] 1day $35.50 $35.50( 1-2 Days $4.80 s4.80] 1
152 [QUANTIFERON GOLD - TB 1 [EACH $65.00 $65.00]  5day $95.00 $95.00( 1-2 Days $70.00]  $70.00] 2
153 |RABIES ANTIBODY 1 [EACH $100.00]  $100.00] 24-34 day $95.00 $95.00[ 1-2 Days [No Bid No Bid




154 |RANDOM UR PROTEIN/CREAT 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00 1day $35.50 $35.50| 1-2 Days $5.70 $5.70 1
155 |REFERRED CBC 1 EACH $15.00 $15.00 1 day $15.50 $15.50| 1-2 Days $8.30 $8.30 1
156 [REFERRED COMP MET PANEL 1 EACH $17.00 $17.00 1day $24.99 $24.99| 1-2 Days $9.00 $9.00 1
157 |REQ/SPECIMEN NAME MISMATCH 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $10.00 $10.00 1
158 [RETICULOCYTE WITH ABSOLUTE 1 EACH $6.00 $6.00( 1-2day $17.50 $17.50| 1-2 Days $4.90 $4.90 1
159 [RHTYPING 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00 2 $15.50 $15.50| 1-2 Days $8.50 $8.50 1
160 [RHEUMATOID FACTOR, QUANT 5 EACH $6.50 $32.50| 1-2day $25.59 $127.95| 1-2 Days $6.70 $33.50 1
161 |[RISK RATIO LDL/HDL 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $22.50 $22.50| 1-2 Days $8.70 $8.70 1
162 [RPR 2 EACH $4.50 $9.00 2 day $40.29 $80.58| 1-2 Days $20.50 $41.00 1
163 [RPR QN+TP ABS 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $40.29 $40.29| 2-3 Days $31.50 $31.50 1
164 |RPR REFLEX TO FTA-ABS 19 EACH No Bid No Bid $55.40 $1,052.60| 2-3 Days $32.75 $622.25 2
165 |RPR REFLEX TO MHA-TP 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $55.40 $55.40| 2-3 Days $21.00 $21.00 2
166 [RPR REFLEXTO T. PALLIDUM 1 EACH $4.50 $4.50| 5-8 day $55.40 $55.40| 2-3 Days $27.00 $27.00 2
167 [RPR, RFX QN RPR/CONFIRM TP 52 EACH No Bid No Bid $55.40 $2,880.80| 2-3 Days $37.50] $1,950.00 2
168 [RUBELLAIGG & IGM 7 EACH $25.00 $175.00 1day $56.10 $392.70| 2-3 Days $14.90 $104.30 1
169 |RUBEOLA IGG ANTIBODY 3 EACH $12.00 $36.00| 3-4day $56.10 $168.30| 2-3 Days $13.40 $40.20 1
170 [SEDIMENTATION RATE 6 EACH $5.00 $30.00 1day $15.00 $90.00| 1-2 Days $4.80 $28.80 1
171 |SGOT (AST) 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1 day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.70 $5.70 1
172 [SGPT (ALT) 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.80 $5.80 1
173 |SICKLE CELL RFLX ELECT 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00| 3-5day $195.50 $195.50| 1-2 Days $6.00 $6.00 2
174 |[SICKLE CELL SCREEN 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00 2 day $35.50 $35.50| 1-2 Days $6.00 $6.00 1
175 |SIQ ANALYTICAL CHEM CL 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
176 [SIQ ANALYTICAL CHEM MISC. 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
177 |SIQ CHEM CL 5 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $425.00| 1-2 Days $220.00| $1,100.00 2
178 [SIQ CHEM MISC. 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
179 |SIQ DAYCHEM CL 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
180 [SIQ HEME CLOT 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
181 |SIQ HEME MISC. 2 EACH No Bid No Bid $85.00 $170.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $440.00 2
182 |[SIQ PROCESSING 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $220.00 $220.00 2
183 [SIQ SERUM 8 EACH No Bid No Bid $44.00 $352.00| 1-2 Days $220.00| $1,760.00 2
184 [SODIUM 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $8.50 $8.50| 1-2 Days $5.30 $5.30 1
185 |[STI PROFILE 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $195.50 $195.50| 1-2 Days $143.15 $143.15 1
186 [STOOL CULTURE,NO SENS 1 EACH $15.00 $15.00 4 day $65.00 $65.00| 2-3 Days $10.00 $10.00 1
187 |T PALLIDUM SCREENING CASCADE 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.29 $45.29| 2-3 Days $25.00 $25.00 1
188 |[T. PALLADIUM —PA 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.29 $45.29| 2-3 Days $25.00 $25.00 1
189 [T3 TOTAL 1 EACH $8.00 $8.00 1 day $25.50 $25.50| 1-2 Days $16.30 $16.30 1
190 [TESTOST BIOAVAILFRAND T 3 EACH $65.00 $195.00 2 day $85.88 $257.64| 1-2 Days $51.80 $155.40 1
191 |THYROGLOBULIN AB 1 EACH $20.00 $20.00| 1-2day $45.55 $45.55| 1-2 Days $16.60 $16.60 1
192 [THYROID PEROXIDASE AB 1 EACH $17.00 $17.00| 1-2 day $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $17.30 $17.30 1
193 [TIQ DENTON 3 EACH No Bid No Bid $95.00 $285.00| 1-2 Days $18.70 $56.10 1
194 |[TIQ FOR PAP SMEARS 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $95.00 $95.00| 1-2 Days $18.70 $18.70 1
195 [TIQ UNSPUN SST &GT;2 HOURS DENTON 2 EACH No Bid No Bid $104.00 $208.00| 1-2 Days $12.50 $25.00 1
196 |[TRANSFERRIN 1 EACH $15.00 $15.00| 1-3day $35.50 $35.50| 1-2 Days $13.30 $13.30 1
197 |TREPONEMA PALLIDUM ANTIBODIES 21 EACH $18.00 $378.00 2 day $55.29 $1,161.09| 2-3 Days $13.75 $288.75 1
198 |[TREPONEMAL ANTIBODIES, TPPA 22 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.59 $1,002.98| 2-3 Days $19.15 $421.30 1
199 |TRICHOMONAS, MALE 1 EACH $45.00 $45.00| 2-4 day $110.65 $110.65| 2-3 Days $15.80 $15.80 1
200 |TRICHOMONAS, URINE, AMP 1 EACH $45.00 $45.00| 2-4 day $95.00 $95.00| 2-3 Days $20.55 $20.55 1
201 |TRICHOMONAS, VAG SWAB, AMP 1 EACH $45.00 $45.00| 2-4day $45.00 $45.00| 2-3 Days $35.60 $35.60 1
202 |TRIGLYCERIDES 1 EACH $4.00 $4.00 1day $11.50 $11.50| 1-2 Days $6.25 $6.25 1
203 |TRYPTASE 1 EACH $55.00 $55.00| 3-6day $95.00 $95.00| 1-2 Days $15.50 $15.50 1
204 |TSH 390 EACH $6.50| $2,535.00 1day $35.02| $13,657.80| 1-2 Days $17.30| $6,747.00 1
205 |TSH+FREE T4 33 EACH $26.50 $874.50 1 day $47.85 $1,579.05| 1-2 Days $17.30 $570.90 1
206 |UA, MICROSCOPIC, REFLEX TO CULTURE 2 EACH $5.00 $10.00| 3-4 day $14.50 $29.00| 2-3 Days $5.00 $10.00 1
207 |UNLABELLED SPECIMEN 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00| 1-2 Days $12.50 $12.50 1
208 |URICACID 11 EACH $5.50 $60.50 1day $28.75 $316.25| 1-2 Days $5.05 $55.55 1
209 |URINALYSIS W/REFLEX MICRO 9 EACH $5.00 $45.00 1 day $14.50 $130.50| 2-3 Days $7.50 $67.50 1
210 |URINALYSIS WITH MICROSCOPIC 48 EACH $5.00 $240.00 1day $15.50 $744.00| 2-3 Days $3.70 $177.60 1
211 |URINE CULTURE, NO SENS 1 EACH $8.00 $8.00| 3-4 day $15.50 $15.50| 2-3 Days $9.00 $9.00 1
212 |VARICELLA ZOSTER IGG 6 EACH $22.00 $132.00| 2-3day $85.40 $512.40| 2-3 Days $13.95 $83.70 1
213 |VENIPUNCTURE 1 EACH $5.00 $5.00 $95.00 $95.00| 1-2 Days $9.60 $9.60 1
214 |VERBAL DIAGNOSIS 1 EACH No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00| 1-2 Days $5.00 $5.00 1
215 [VITAMIN B 12 AND FOLIC ACI 17 EACH $12.00 $204.00 1 day $85.10 $1,446.70| 1-2 Days $14.85 $252.45 1
216 |VITAMIN B-12 4 EACH $16.00 $64.00 1day $45.29 $181.16| 1-2 Days $15.60 $62.40 1
217 |VITAMIN D, 25 OH 288 EACH $35.00| $10,080.00| 2-3 day $59.15| $17,035.20| 1-2 Days $30.10| $8,668.80 1

**Draft Until Award Total $4,331.25| $50,282.75 $15,602.03| $218,629.32 $7,576.90|$91,242.50

No Award - Line 19, 21-24, 32, 37, 41, 70, 114, 122, 157, 161, 163-|  TOTAL Less No

165, 167, 175-183, 185, 187-188, 193-195, 198, 207, and 214 Award Lines $4,331.25( $50,282.75 $13,496.81| $182,098.36 $5,021.60| $64,380.65




