BID TAB 2025-351 Camera Standarization JP 1-4
Cloud Ingenuity, LLC Unique Digital Technology, LLC [GTS Technology Soutions, Inc; [Pavion Corp. Security 101 Holdings, LLC
Coop Name DIR TIPS TIPS [HGACBuy TIPS
Coop Contract Number DIR-CPO-5285 230105 230105 SE05-20 230202
Coop Contract Expiration 3/1/2029 5/31/2028 5/31/2028 4/30/2026 4/30/2026
Coop Name DIR
Coop Contract Number DIR-CPO-4754
Coop Contract Expiration 3/5/2026
Quote Date 12/18/2025 1/5/2026 1/12/2026 12/12/2025 11/19/2025
Quote Expiration 2/6/2026 2/4/2026 1/31/2026 1/31/2026 2/1/2026
Quote No. 6113 QUO-UD1071316 Q17615 272160.1
Description (Model) Quantity |Unit Price Extended Price Quantity [Unit Price _|Extended Price Quantity Unit Price _|Extended Price Quantity  [UnitPrice _|Extended Price |Quantity Unit Price__|Extended Price
VX52-HW (VX52 Viewing Station)
4 $381.59 $1,526.36| 4 $396.03|  $1,584.12 4 $373.58 $1,494.32] 4 $442.15|  $1,768.60 4 $458.46 $1,833.84]
LIC-VX-5Y-CAP ( 5-Year Viewing
Station License, Capacity
Increase) 4 $1,528.65| $6,114.60) 4] $1558651|  $6,346.04] 4] $1,496.58 $5,986.32| 4 $1,77127| $7,085.08 4] 51,836.59) $7,346.36|
(CD53-512-HW (CD53 Indoor
pome Camera, 512 GB, 60 Days 5i $1,299.24) $6,496.20) 5| $1,269.05|  $6,345.25 5 $1,197.11] $5,985.55) 5| $1,416.84] $7,084.20 5| $1,469.09] $7,345.45)
(CM42-512-HW (CM42 Indoor Mini
Dome Camera, 512GB, 60 Days
31 $840.41 $26,052.71 31 $874.20  $27,100.20] 31| $822.78] $25,506.18 31 $973.80| $30,187.80 31| $1,009.71 $31,301.01
(CF83-1TBE-HW (CF83-E Outdoor
Fisheye Camera, 1TB 60 Days
3 $1,987.47] $5,962.41 3] $2,062.70|  $6,188.10) 3| $1,945.78 $5,837.34] 3| $230291] $6,908.73 3| $2,387.84] $7,163.52|
(CD63-1TB-HW (CD63 Indoor
Dome Camera, 1TB, 60 Days
2 $1,911.00 $3,822.00] 2| $1,824.60  $3,649.20) 2| $1,721.18 $3,442.36| 2| $2,037.09] $4,074.18 2| $2,11221 $4,224.42|
(CD63-1TBE-HW (CD63-E Outdoor]
Dome Camera, 1B, 60 days Max)|
2 $2,063.94 $4,127.88] 2|  $1,983.33|  $3,966.66| 2| $1,870.91 $3,741.82) 2| $2,214.30] $4,428.60 2| $2,11221 $4,224.42|
(CB62-1TBE-HW (CB62-E Outdoor|
Bullet Camera, ITB, 60 Days Max)
5| $2,140.41] $10,702.05 5|  $2,06270| $10,313.50) 5| $1,945.78 $9,728.90) 5| $2,30291| $11,514.55 5| $2,387.84] $11,939.20]
(CD53-512E-HW (CD53 Indoor
Dome Camera, 512GB, 60 Days
ax) 2 $1,452.18| $2,904.36| 2] $1,427.78]  $2,855.56] 2| $1,346.84 $2,693.68| 2| $1,594.05| $3,188.10 2| $1,53477] $3,069.54]
LIC-CAM-5Y-CAP (5- Year Camerd
icense, Capacity Increase) 50 $763.94] $38,197.00 50 $713.49|  $35,674.50] 50| $673.05] $33,652.50 50 $796.58| $39,829.00 50j $825.96 $41,298.00
(CY53-1TBE-HW (CY53-E Outdoor
Two-Camera Multisensor, 1 T8,
60 Days) 7| $2,293.35] $16,053.45) 7| $2,380.16| $16,661.12] 7| $2,245.24] $15,716.68| 7| $2,657.34| $18,601.38 7 $2,755.34] $19,287.38|
LIC-CAM-MLT2-5Y-CAP (5-Year
Two Camera Multisensor
i i 7| $1,375.71) $9,629.97| 7| $1,269.05|  $8,883.35) 7| $1,197.11) $8,379.77) 7| $1,416.84 $9,917.88 7] $1,469.09) $10,283.63]
(CH52-2TBE-HW (CH52-E Outdoor|
Multisensor Camera 2TB, 60 Day
Max) 8 $3,746.29) $22,477.74 6| $3,888.10| $23,328.60) 6| $3,667.70) $22,006.20) 6|  $4,340.89| $26,045.34] 6] $4,500.96| $27,005.76)
LIC-CAM-MLT4-5Y-CAP (5-Year
Four Camera Multisensor
|License_Capacity) 8 $2,293.35 $13,760.10) 6|  $2,142.06| $12,852.36| 6| $2,020.64 $12,123.84] 6|  $2,391.52 $14,349.12] 6] $2,414.09] $14,484.54
(ACC-MNT-CORNER-1 (Corner
Mount) " $152.18 $1,673.98) 1 $157.94|  $1,737.34| 1 $148.98] $1,638.78) 1 $176.33|  $1,939.63 1 $90.96| $1,000.56)
[ACC-MNT-ARM-1 (Arm Mount) 1 $75.71] $832.81 i $78.57| $864.27 i $74.12 $815.32 i $87.72| $964.92 11 $90.96| $1,000.56]
ACC-MNT-PEND-1 (Pendant Cap
8 $52.76| $316.56} 6 $54.76| $328.56 6 $51.66| $309.96 6 $61.14] $366.84 8 $63.40) $380.40}
ACC-MNT-YPEND-1 (Two -
Camera Multisensor Pendant
lcap 5| $83.35) $416.75| 5 $86.51] $432.55 5 $81.60} $408.00] 5 $96.58| $482.90] 5| $100.15 $500.75}
(ACC-POE-90W-NA (Indoor 90W
PoE++ Injector, GigE, NA Type B)
8 $129.24 $775.44] 6 $134.13 $804.78 6] $126.52 $759.12 6 $149.75 $898.50] 8 $155.27 $931.62]
[ACC-MNT-SJBOX-1 (Square
Junctiion Box Mount) 5| $68.06| $340.30} 5| $70.63| $353.15 5 $66.63 $333.15 5| $78.86| $394.30| 5) $81.77| $408.85|
ACC-MNT-CJBOX-1 (Circle
i it 2 $83.35) $166.70} 2 $86.51] $173.02 2 $81.60} $163.20] 2 $96.58| $193.16 2] $92.99) $185.98]
VN T (CameTa
Dome Angle Mount) 3 $113.94] $341.82 3 $118.25 $354.75 3| s11155 $334.65 3 $132.03 $396.09 3) $105.61 $316.83]
TDSS=TVIOE TIETCOmT, SeTaTny
camera, and access control in a
slim form factor) 1 $1,146.29) $1,146.29) 1] $1,189.68]  $1,189.68 1 $1,122.25) $1,122.25| 1] $1,32823]  $1,328.23 1 5106242 $1,062.42|
= o yearmerconT
license, capacity increase for
TD33 1 $1,337.47| $1,337.47] 1] $1,388.10]  $1,388.10) 1] $1,309.41) $1,309.41 1 $1,54975]  $1,549.75 1 5123961 $1,239.61/
QBB5C - 65" Tv/Monitor
(Samsung Display) No Bid No Bid 4] $1,205.38] $4,821.52| 4] $1,520.00]  $6,080.00] 4] $1,326.55 $5,306.20)
[MSTU (Chief Mount) No Bid No Bid 4 513684 $547.36 4 $211.00 $844.00| ﬂ
[
Total $27,319.88 $175,174.95 $27,244.84] $173,374.76 527,040.82 5153,353.1% $200,420.88 $203,140.85]
$60,450.00 178,465.00] zz,ms.e‘sl $92,151.25 63,866.78]
Trade in -53,850.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Included in
Included in Installation Included in
Shipping $2,054.12| $1,837.89) Installation cost cost Installation cost
Grand Total $233,829.07 $353,677.65 $191,677.83 $292,572.13 $267,007.63
DRAFT UNTIL AWARD
****Additional Items (not included
on Pricing Sheet) *optional****
LIC-CAM-MLT4-3Y-CAP 2| 51,2366 $2,467.32]
LIC-VX-3Y-CAP 1 $852.49 $852.49]
Total with Additional Items $270,327.44




