2026-185 SUPPLEMENTAL COMPUTERS, PERIPHERALS, AND ACCESSORIES

GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Southern Computer Warehouse ePlus Pace Systems, Inc.
< DIR /TIPS Omnia NCPA / TIPS TIPS Omnia NCPA
e DIR-CPO-5792 / TIPS 230105 01-143 / 230105 230105 01-169
Coop Expiration: 4/4/2027 ] 05/31/2026 11/30/2026 / 05/31/2026 5/31/2028 12/14/2026
Quote Date: 2/11/2026 2/2/2026 2/2/2026 2/2/2026
Quote Expiration: 3/13/2026 2/10/2026 3/4/2026 3/2/2026
Quote Number: Q-22568 1897748 rev 1 23463225 604193 rev 1
Il;l:r: JP OFFICES Description Quantity | UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 | sTanparp peskrop | P¢!Pr M'C:PS\ZMIZSO’ 210- 17 Each|  $1,332.03 $22,644.51 $1,439.62 $24,473.54 $1,734.84 $29,492.28 $1,677.89 $28,524.13
2 | An-ongsTanp | De!lProMicro Allin-One Stand 17 Each $98.23 $1,669.91 $102.97 $1,750.49 $109.73 $1,865.41 $94.82 $1,611.94
MFS22, 452-BDUB
3 | stanparp Laptop | P€!Pr Ma;(ll:é 1}:7: MC16250, 38 Each|  $2,240.71 $85,146.98 $2,462.07 $93,558.66 $2,729.82 $103,733.16 $2,842.82 $108,027.16
4 | THunDERBOLT DOCK | D8l Pro Thunderbolt 4 Smart 39 Each $295.44 $11,522.16 $491.85 $19,182.15 $330.95 $12,907.05 $303.74 $11,845.86
Dock SD25TB4, 210-BMRQK
5 24" MoniTors | DNl Pro 24 zplll:; g:;g:or P2425H, 98 Each $147.58 $14,462.84 $171.11 $16,768.78 $161.33 $15,810.34 $163.75 $16,047.50
6 | wirepkeveoarp | P! Wired ;;;y:;;;;r:ﬁam Black, 38 Each $11.61 $441.18 $12.82 $487.16 $12.65 $480.70 $12.04 $457.52
7| opricatmouse | P! Opt'calx:“;:gé'sns Black, 38 Each $11.61 $441.18 $12.82 $487.16 $12.65 $480.70 $12.04 $457.52
8 BACKPACK Dell Ecoloop :l';K:aCkpaCk’ 460- 38 Each $46.49 $1,766.62 $51.33 $1,950.54 $46.43 $1,764.34 $43.92 $1,668.96
9 USB HUB Anker 4-port USB 3.0 Hub, 38 Each $7.82 $297.16 $2063 $783.94 $6.42 $243.96 6.75 $256.50
A7516016
*DRAFT UNTIL AWARD $4,191.52 | $138,392.54 $4,765.22 | $159,442.42 $5,144.82 | $166,777.94 $5,157.77 | $168,897.09
WayPoint - no bid
CDW - no bid
GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Southern C Industries
a DIR /TIPS Omnia NCPA / TIPS DIR
e DIR-CPO-5792 / TIPS 230105 01-143 / 230105 DIR-CPO-5792
Coop Expiration: 4/4/2027 ] 05/31/2026 11/30/2026 / 05/31/2026 4/4/2027
Quote Date: 2/11/2026 2/16/2026 2/17/2026
Quote Expiration: 3/13/2026 2/25/2026 3/3/2026
Quote Number: Q-23305 1900281 rev 1 3000199289977.10
I';:‘; WIC DEPARTMENT Description Quantity |UOM|[  Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 | stanparoLaprop | DEIPrO Ma;(ll:él':/x: MC16250, 24 Each|  $2,240.71 $53,777.04 $2,513.87 $60,332.88 $2,479.17 $59,500.08
2 | THunDERBOLT DOCK | D8l Pro Thunderbolt 4 Smart 24 Each $295.44 $7,090.56 $343.10 $8,234.40 $352.49 $8,459.76
Dock SD25TB4, 210-BMRQK
3 24"Moniors | DellPro24 zplll:; g:;g:or P2425H, 48 Each $147.58 $7,083.84 $165.94 $7,965.12 $176.24 $8,459.52
4 | wirep keveoarp | D¢l Wired Keyboard KB216 Black, 2 Each $11.61 $278.64 $26.82 $643.68 $13.21 $317.04
580-ADMT
s | opTicaLmousg | Dell Optical Mouse MS116 Black, 24 Each $11.61 $278.64 combo above - $1321 $317.04
275-BBCB
6 BACKPACK Dell Ecoloop :l';K:aCkpaCk’ 460- 24 Each $46.49 $1,115.76 $53.66 $1,287.84 $52.87 $1,268.88
7 USB HUB Anker 4-port USB 3.0 Hub, 24 Each $7.82 $187.68 $6.81 $163.44 no bid $0.00
A7516016
*DRAFT UNTIL AWARD $2,761.26 $69,812.16 $3,110.20 $78,627.36 $3,087.19 $78,322.32
COW - o bid
ePlus - no response
Pace Systems- no response
GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Southern Ci h Industries
< DIR Omnia NCPA / TIPS DIR
Coop Contract Number: DIR-CPO-5792 01-143 / 230105 DIR-CPO-5792
Coop Expirati /42027 11/30/2026 ] 05/31/2026 /42021
Quote Date: 2/17/2026 2/16/2026 2/17/2026
Quote 3/13/2026 2/25/2026 3/3/2026
Quote Number. Q-23408 1900294 rev 1 3000199165694.20
o
“I::‘ PUBLIC WORKS Description Quantity | UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
Dell Pro Max 16 MC16255,
1 | ENHANCED LAPTOP elbro 21"’; s ' 7 Each|  $2,729.97 $19,109.79 $3,099.98 $21,699.86 $2,008.38 $20,358.66
*DRAFT UNTIL AWARD $2,729.97 $19,109.79 $3,099.98 $21,699.86 $2,908.38 $20,358.66
CDW - no bid
ePlus - no response
Pace Systems- no response
GTS Technology Solutions, Inc. Southern C Industries
a DIR Omnia NCPA / TIPS DIR
Coop Contract Numbers DIR-CPO-5792 01-143 / 230105 DIR-CPO-5792
Coop Expiration: 4/a/2027 11/30/2026 / 05/31/2026 4/a/2027
Quote Date: 2/17/2026 2/16/2026 2/17/2026
Quote Expiration: 3/13/2026 2/25/2026 3/3/2026
Quote Number: Q-23364 1900295 rev 1 3000199165694.10
Il;l:r: SO CEU Description Quantity | UOM Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 | ENHANCED LAPTOP Dell Pro ’;Ala; éivr;lcwzss, 4 Each|  $2,720.97 $10,919.88 $3,099.98 $12,399.92 $2,908.38 $11,633.52
2 | THunDERBOLT DOCK | D8l Pro Thunderbolt 4 Smart 4 Each $295.44 $1,181.76 $353.30 $1,413.20 $352.49 $1,409.96
Dock SD25TB4, 210-BMRQK
*DRAFT UNTIL AWARD $3,025.41 $12,101.64 $3,453.28 $13,813.12 $3,260.87 $13,043.48
COW - o bid
ePlus - no response |GRAND TOTAL $239,416.13 |

Pace Systems- no response




