

				Ataram LLC		% increase	NOTES
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Current Unit	Requested Price Unit		
1	State price per quart for SAE Grade 30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$2.60	3.40	30.7%	linked with which document
1 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac 1630	60	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
2	State price per quart for 10W30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$2.60	3.40	30.7%	
2 ALT 1	Mobil Special 10W30	60	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
3	State price per quart for 5W20 Full Synthetic Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (72 Quarts=6 Cases)	72	quart	\$2.96	3.86	30.7%	
3 ALT 1	Mobil Super Synthetic 5W20	72	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
4	State price per quart for 5W20 Full Synthetic Engine Oil - Bulk	2700	quart	\$2.19	2.74	30.7%	
4 ALT 1	Navi-guard Ultra Synthetic 5W20	2700	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
5	State price per quart for SAE 5W30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (168 Quarts=14 Cases)	168	quart	\$2.60	3.40	30.7%	
5 ALT 1	Mobil Special 5W30	168	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
6	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$2.76	3.59	30.7%	
6 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac HDEO 15W40	60	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
7	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (660 Quarts=3 Drums)	660	quart	\$2.50	3.27	30.7%	
7 ALT 1	Navi-guard Premium Fleet 15W40	660	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
8	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Bulk	3092	quart	\$2.06	2.68	30.7%	
8 ALT 1	Navi-guard Premium Fleet 15W40	3092	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
9	State price per quart for 10W TO-4 Hydraulic Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$2.34	3.06	30.7%	
9 ALT 1	Mobiltrans HD 10	220	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
10	State price per quart for 10W TO-4Hydraulic Oil - Bulk/90 Gallon Minimum Order (440 Quarts=110 Gallons)	440	quart	\$2.06	2.68	30.7%	
10 ALT 1	Mobiltrans HD 10	440	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
11	State price per quart for 80W90 Gear Oil/Mineral Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (440 Quarts=2 Drums)	440	quart	\$2.88	3.76	30.7%	
11 ALT 1	Mobilube HD Plus 80W90	440	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
12	State price per quart for Dextron Automatic Transmission Fluid (DEXRON VI ULV/Mercon ULV or Equal) - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$2.36	4.25	30.7%	
12 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	60	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
13	State price per quart for Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid or Equal - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (24 Quarts=2 Cases)	24	quart	\$3.25	4.25	30.7%	
13 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	24	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
14	State price per quart for Mercon LV Automatic Transmission Fluid or Equal - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (24 Quarts=2 Cases)	24	quart	\$2.36	4.38	30.7%	
14 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	24	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
15	State price per quart for Antifreeze/Coolant Regular (Green Color: 50/50 Mix) - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$1.25	1.63	30.7%	
15 ALT 1	Peak Antifreeze Green 50/50	220	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
16	State price per quart for Antifreeze/Coolant Extended Life (Red Color: 50/50 Mix) - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (1320 Quarts=6 Drums)	1320	quart	\$1.20	1.57	30.7%	
16 ALT 1	Navi-guard HD ELC 50/50 Red	1320	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
17	State price per gallon for Antifreeze/Coolant Extended Life (Gold Color: Full Strength) - Comes in One Gallon Containers	36	gallon	\$1.25	1.63	30.7%	
17 ALT 1	Peak Global Lifetime	36	gallon	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
18	State price per quart for Moly EP Chassis Grease or Equal - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$3.63	4.74	30.7%	
18 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac Xtreme Grease	220	quart	No Bid			Price Increase Letter 3-18-26 + Price Increase Letter 4-20-26
19	State price per case for Citgo RT Lithoplex Grease or Equal - Comes with ten (10) 14 Oz. Cartridges per Case (40 Cases=400 Cartridges)	40	case	\$45.00	45.00		
19 ALT 1	Lubriguard Xtreme Duty Hi-Temp	40	case	No Bid			
19 ALT 2	Pure Guard High Temp #2 Grease Tubes	40	case	No Bid			
20	State Price per gallon for Valvtect Diesel Guard Supreme or Equal - Comes in Containers of 2.5 Gallons (55 Gallons=22 Containers)	55	gallon	\$12.50	16.34	30.7%	
21	State price per drum for Valvtect Diesel Guard Supreme or Equal - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (1 Drum=55 Gallons)	1	drum	\$700.00	914.90	30.7%	
22	State price for Drum Deposit	12	drum	\$5.00	6.54	30.7%	
23	State price per box for Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)- Comes in Boxes of 2.5 gallons (1600 Boxes=4000 Total Gallons)	1600	box	\$9.50	12.42	30.7%	
24	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Products Not Listed Herein	1		5.0%	0.07	30.7%	
*Delete previously awarded line items no. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12, 14 from contract.							

 Primary Award
 Secondary Award



Wednesday, March 18, 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

Lubrimar announces a price increase of up to 15%, effective April 1st. This adjustment is driven by a sudden, dramatic rise in raw material costs. Given the ongoing volatility and instability in the global supply chain, we anticipate that this may be the first of several incremental pricing changes.

We are currently experiencing an unusually high volume of orders, which may result in longer-than-normal lead times. Please be assured that our team is working diligently to process and ship your orders as quickly as possible.

This week, our industry association, the Independent Lubricant Manufacturers Association (ILMA), requested emergency relief from the American Petroleum Institute (API). Specifically, ILMA has asked API to invoke the force majeure provisions under API 1509 for lubricant marketers operating under the Engine Oil Licensing and Certification System (EOLCS). If granted, this relief would temporarily allow licensees to substitute certain base oils or adjust formulations while remaining compliant during this supply crisis.

ILMA's request is driven by a projected shortfall in Group III (synthetic) base oil supply. As a result, some synthetic lubricant products may become temporarily unavailable in the near future.

We value your business and your partnership. We remain committed to minimizing the impact of these disruptions on your operations and will continue to keep you informed as the situation develops.

Best Regards,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Felix Moreno Jr.", with a stylized flourish at the end.

Felix Moreno Jr, CLS
Director

Notes:

Lubrimar's March 18 letter announces a price increase "of up to 15%" effective April 1. A subsequent letter dated April 20 announces an additional increase "of up to 20%" effective immediately. These increases are sequential, so applying both would result in roughly a 38% overall increase $((1+0.15) \times (1+0.20) \approx 1.38)$, which is why the requested 30.7% increase falls within the combined effect.



Lubricant Marketing and Research, Inc.

April 20, 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

Market conditions have worsened significantly in the 10 days since our last letter. Base oil prices continued to rise dramatically, and real concern towards the availability of global lubricant supply is now warranted.

Due to the extremely difficult market conditions, we have several important announcements:

1. **PRICE ADJUSTMENT** - Effective immediately, our prices will increase by up to 20%. Updated price sheets will be issued as quickly as possible. All orders received today will be entered at your new price.
2. **WEEKLY PRICE SCHEDULE** - Due to the ongoing volatility, we will no longer issue separate price increase announcements. Instead, you will receive a new price sheet each Monday. Our intention is for these prices to remain in effect for that week; however, due to extreme market volatility, they may change. You should expect prices to continue to rise over the next several weeks.
3. **LEAD TIMES** - We are currently experiencing an unusually high volume of orders. As a result, please expect longer-than-normal lead times. We are working diligently to fulfill orders as quickly and efficiently as possible.
4. **ORDER VOLUME AND POTENTIAL ALLOCATION** - While we are not currently on formal allocation, we do see the potential need for it in the future. In preparation, exorbitant or excessive orders will not be accepted.

We truly appreciate your understanding, loyalty, and partnership during this difficult period. Our team remains committed to supporting your business and to doing everything we can to minimize the impact of these market conditions on your operations.

Best regards,

Felix Moreno Jr, CLS
Director

Notes:

Lubrimar's March 18 letter announces a price increase "of up to 15%" effective April 1. A subsequent letter dated April 20 announces an additional increase "of up to 20%" effective immediately. These increases are sequential, so applying both would result in roughly a 38% overall increase $((1+0.15) \times (1+0.20) \approx 1.38)$, which is why the requested 30.7% increase falls within the combined effect.