

				Ataram LLC (updated as of 5.15.26)		Offen Petroleum LLC	
				Total Price	\$38,972.30	Total Price	\$48,230.72
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	State price per quart for SAE Grade 30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$3.40	\$156.00	\$2.94	\$176.40
1 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac 1630	60	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	State price per quart for 10W30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$3.40	\$156.00	\$2.71	\$162.60
2 ALT 1	Mobil Special 10W30	60	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	State price per quart for 5W20 Full Synthetic Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (72 Quarts=6 Cases)	72	quart	\$3.86	\$212.40	\$3.18	\$228.96
3 ALT 1	Mobil Super Synthetic 5W20	72	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	State price per quart for 5W20 Full Synthetic Engine Oil - Bulk	2700	quart	\$2.74	\$5,670.00	\$2.51	\$6,777.00
4 ALT 1	Navi-gaurd Ultra Synthetic 5W20	2700	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	State price per quart for SAE 5W30 Engine Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (168 Quarts=14 Cases)	168	quart	\$3.40	\$436.80	\$2.71*	\$455.28
5 ALT 1	Mobil Special 5W30	168	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$3.59	\$165.00	\$3.18	\$190.80
6 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac HDEO 15W40	60	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (660 Quarts=3 Drums)	660	quart	\$3.27	\$1,650.00	\$2.71	\$1,788.60
7 ALT 1	Navi-guard Premium Fleet 15W40	660	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	State price per quart for 15W40 API CJ-4 Diesel Motor Oil - Bulk	3092	quart	\$2.68	\$6,338.60	\$2.14	\$6,616.88
8 ALT 1	Navi-guard Premium Fleet 15W40	3092	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	State price per quart for 10W TO-4 Hydraulic Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$3.06	\$514.80	\$2.86	\$629.20
9 ALT 1	Mobiltrans HD 10	220	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	State price per quart for 10W TO-4Hydraulic Oil - Bulk/90 Gallon Minimum Order (440 Quarts=110 Gallons)	440	quart	\$2.68	\$902.00	\$2.48	\$1,091.20
10 ALT 1	Mobiltrans HD 10	440	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	State price per quart for 80W90 Gear Oil/Mineral Oil - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (440 Quarts=2 Drums)	440	quart	\$3.76	\$1,267.20	\$2.78	\$1,223.20
11 ALT 1	Mobilube HD Plus 80W90	440	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	State price per quart for Dextron Automatic Transmission Fluid (DEXRON VI ULV/Mercon ULV or Equal) - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (60 Quarts=5 Cases)	60	quart	\$4.25	\$195.00	\$3.77	\$226.20
12 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	60	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	State price per quart for Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid or Equal - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (24 Quarts=2 Cases)	24	quart	\$4.25	\$78.00	\$3.77	\$90.48
13 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	24	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	State price per quart for Mercon LV Automatic Transmission Fluid or Equal - Comes in Cases of 12 Quarts (24 Quarts=2 Cases)	24	quart	\$4.38	\$80.40	\$3.77	\$90.48
14 ALT 1	Mobil Multi-Vehicle ATF	24	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	State price per quart for Antifreeze/Coolant Regular (Green Color: 50/50 Mix) - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$1.63	\$275.00	\$1.14	\$250.80
15 ALT 1	Peak Antifreeze Green 50/50	220	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	State price per quart for Antifreeze/Coolant Extended Life (Red Color: 50/50 Mix) - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (1320 Quarts=6 Drums)	1320	quart	\$1.57	\$1,584.00	\$1.74	\$2,296.80
16 ALT 1	Navi-guard HD ELC 50/50 Red	1320	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	State price per gallon for Antifreeze/Coolant Extended Life (Gold Color: Full Strength) - Comes in One Gallon Containers	36	gallon	\$1.63	\$45.00	\$9.52	\$342.72
17 ALT 1	Peak Global Lifetime	36	gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	State price per quart for Moly EP Chassis Grease or Equal - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (220 Quarts=1 Drum)	220	quart	\$4.74	\$798.60	\$10.05	\$2,211.00
18 ALT 1	Mobil Delvac Xtreme Grease	220	quart	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	State price per case for Citgo RT Lithoplex Grease or Equal - Comes with ten (10) 14 Oz. Cartridges per Case (40 Cases=400 Cartridges)	40	case	\$45.00	\$1,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
19 ALT 1	Lubriguard Extreme Duty Hi-Temp	40	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19 ALT 2	Pure Guard High Temp #2 Grease Tubes	40	case	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.60	\$1,264.00
20	State Price per gallon for Valvtect Diesel Guard Supreme or Equal - Comes in Containers of 2.5 Gallons (55 Gallons=22 Containers)	55	gallon	\$16.34	\$687.50	\$119.07	\$6,548.85
21	State price per drum for Valvtect Diesel Guard Supreme or Equal - Comes in 55 Gallon Drums (1 Drum=55 Gallons)	1	drum	\$914.90	\$700.00	\$2,977.27	\$2,977.27
22	State price for Drum Deposit	12	drum	\$6.54	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid
23	State price per box for Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)- Comes in Boxes of 2.5 gallons (1600 Boxes=4000 Total Gallons)	1600	box	\$12.42	\$15,200.00	\$7.87	\$12,592.00
24	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Products Not Listed Herein	1		0.07%		20%*	

	Primary Award
	Secondary Award

*NOTE: Below two vendors chose not to renew and have been removed from contract.

- Brenntag Lubricants LLC
- Safety-Kleen Systems Inc.