

2024-174 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Change Order/Renewal No.2

	PRIMARY
	SECONDARY
	TERTIARY

			Complete Supply Inc		Bob Barker Company Inc		Phoenix Supply		Charm-TEX		Victory Supply		ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC	
Line #	Description	UOM	Total Price	\$865.00	Total Price	\$86,209.07	Total Price	\$89,817.56	Total Price	\$103,466.88	Total Price	\$105,659.44	Total Price	\$115,212.33
			Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	BEDDING AND TOWELS: TOWELS: BATH TURKISH, WHITE, 20" X 40"	each	No Bid		\$0.90	\$1,800.00	\$1.06	\$2,120.00	\$1.03	\$2,060.00	\$0.81	\$1,620.00	\$0.9167	\$1,833.40
2	BEDDING AND TOWELS: WASH CLOTHS: WHITE, 12" x 12"	each	No Bid		\$0.17	\$680.00	\$0.16	\$640.00	\$0.20	\$800.00	\$0.16	\$640.00	\$0.1667	\$666.80
3	BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOWCASES: HEAVY DUTY, WHITE, POLYESTER COTTON BLEND, TO FIT PILLOW SIZE 15" X 25"	each	No Bid		\$0.75	\$150.00	\$0.90	\$180.00	\$0.83	\$166.00	\$0.86	\$172.00	\$0.8125	\$162.50
4	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 35" X 75" X 4", WHITE	each	No Bid		\$3.30	\$2,310.00	No Bid		\$6.99	\$4,893.00	\$7.74	\$5,418.00	\$5.0733	\$3,551.31
5	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 25" X 75" X 4", WHITE	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$5.825	\$11.65	\$7.39	\$14.78	\$6.7867	\$13.5734
6	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS, SEALED SEAM, VINYL COVER, POLYESTER SCRIM 25" x 75" x 4"	each	No Bid		\$49.95	\$9,990.00	No Bid		\$15.90	\$3,180.00	\$71.11	\$14,222.00	\$48.60	\$9,720.00
7	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS, CLEAR SCRIM, SEALED SEAM, POLYESTER, 25" x 75" x 4"	each	No Bid		\$58.98	\$5,898.00	No Bid		\$65.90	\$6,590.00	\$69.49	\$6,949.00	\$49.05	\$4,905.00
8	BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOW, VINYL, GREEN, POLY-FILL, 17" X 25"	each	No Bid		\$8.70	\$1,305.00	No Bid		\$5.825	\$873.75	\$18.98	\$2,847.00	\$7.63	\$1,144.50
9	BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED 62" x 80" WHITE OR GRAY	each	No Bid		\$7.80	\$3,120.00	\$7.15	\$2,860.00	\$5.97	\$2,388.00	\$5.96	\$2,384.00	\$7.22	\$2,888.00
10	BEDDING AND TOWELS: SUICIDE BLANKET: 54" X 80"	each	No Bid		\$53.76	\$10,752.00	\$90.00	\$18,000.00	\$59.90	\$11,980.00	\$53.75	\$10,750.00	\$59.99	\$11,998.00
11	BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED, THERMAL, COTTON, 66" x 90" WHITE	each	No Bid		\$5.24	\$7,860.00	\$7.70	\$11,550.00	\$6.54	\$9,810.00	\$5.23	\$7,845.00	\$7.48	\$11,220.00
12	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT: ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 34"-52" CHEST SIZE, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$71.40	\$1,785.00	\$115.00	\$2,875.00	\$62.90	\$1,572.50	\$62.89	\$1,572.25	\$69.00	\$1,725.00
13	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT: ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 44"-56" CHEST SIZE, 2XL-4XL	each	No Bid		\$57.78	\$5,778.00	\$130.00	\$13,000.00	\$62.90	\$6,290.00	\$64.78	\$6,478.00	\$76.00	\$7,600.00
14	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT: ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 60"-72" CHEST SIZE, 5XL-8XL	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$118.90	\$118.90	\$74.50	\$74.50	No Bid	
15	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT: ADJUSTABLE JUMPSUIT, 34"-52" CHEST SIZE, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$77.54	\$77.54	No Bid		No Bid		\$70.18	\$70.18	No Bid	
16	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT: ADJUSTABLE JUMPSUIT, 44"-56" CHEST SIZE, 2XL-4XL	each	No Bid		\$77.54	\$77.54	No Bid		No Bid		\$70.18	\$70.18	No Bid	
17	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$15.07	\$1,507.00	No Bid		\$15.18	\$1,518.00	\$15.24	\$1,524.00	\$18.72	\$1,872.00
18	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL	each	No Bid		\$15.07	\$1,507.00	No Bid		\$15.18	\$1,518.00	\$15.24	\$1,524.00	\$18.72	\$1,872.00
19	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 3XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$1,607.00	No Bid		\$15.90	\$1,590.00	\$15.97	\$1,597.00	\$20.85	\$2,085.00
20	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 4XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$1,607.00	No Bid		\$16.54	\$1,654.00	\$15.97	\$1,597.00	\$20.85	\$2,085.00
21	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 5XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$16.90	\$16.90	\$16.73	\$16.73	\$20.85	\$20.85
22	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 6XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$17.54	\$17.54	\$16.73	\$16.73	\$22.90	\$22.90
23	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 7XL	each	No Bid		\$17.83	\$17.83	No Bid		\$17.90	\$17.90	\$17.34	\$17.34	\$22.90	\$22.90
24	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 8XL	each	No Bid		\$18.83	\$18.83	No Bid		\$18.54	\$18.54	\$17.34	\$17.34	\$22.90	\$22.90
25	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$15.07	\$15.07	No Bid		\$15.18	\$15.18	\$15.24	\$15.24	\$18.72	\$18.72
26	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL	each	No Bid		\$15.07	\$15.07	No Bid		\$15.18	\$15.18	\$15.24	\$15.24	\$18.72	\$18.72
27	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 3XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$15.90	\$15.90	\$15.97	\$15.97	\$20.85	\$20.85
28	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 4XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$16.54	\$16.54	\$15.97	\$15.97	\$20.85	\$20.85
29	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 5XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$16.90	\$16.90	\$16.73	\$16.73	\$20.85	\$20.85
30	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 6XL	each	No Bid		\$16.07	\$16.07	No Bid		\$17.54	\$17.54	\$16.73	\$16.73	\$22.90	\$22.90
31	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 7XL	each	No Bid		\$17.83	\$17.83	No Bid		\$17.90	\$17.90	\$17.34	\$17.34	\$22.90	\$22.90
32	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 8XL	each	No Bid		\$18.83	\$18.83	No Bid		\$18.54	\$18.54	\$17.34	\$17.34	\$22.90	\$22.90
33	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$7.98	\$7.98	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$6.62	\$6.62	\$8.89	\$8.89
34	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL	each	No Bid		\$7.98	\$7.98	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$6.62	\$6.62	\$8.89	\$8.89
35	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL	each	No Bid		\$8.11	\$8.11	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.18	\$7.18	\$6.98	\$6.98	\$9.93	\$9.93
36	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL	each	No Bid		\$8.35	\$417.50	\$7.00	\$350.00	\$7.36	\$368.00	\$7.34	\$367.00	\$9.93	\$496.50
37	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 5XL	each	No Bid		\$9.16	\$458.00	\$7.25	\$362.50	\$7.90	\$395.00	\$7.70	\$385.00	\$9.93	\$496.50
38	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$6.15	\$153.75	\$6.00	\$150.00	\$6.18	\$154.50	\$5.96	\$149.00	\$7.62	\$190.50
39	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 2XL	each	No Bid		\$6.46	\$161.50	\$6.00	\$150.00	\$6.18	\$154.50	\$5.96	\$149.00	\$7.62	\$190.50
40	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 3XL	each	No Bid		\$6.67	\$166.75	\$6.50	\$162.50	\$6.36	\$159.00	\$6.31	\$157.75	\$8.32	\$208.00
41	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 4XL	each	No Bid		\$7.88	\$197.00	\$6.50	\$162.50	\$7.72	\$193.00	\$6.65	\$166.25	\$8.32	\$208.00
42	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 5XL	each	No Bid		\$7.88	\$197.00	\$6.75	\$168.75	\$7.72	\$193.00	\$7.00	\$175.00	\$8.32	\$208.00
43	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 6XL	each	No Bid		\$7.88	\$197.00	\$7.00	\$175.00	\$7.90	\$197.50	\$7.33	\$183.25	\$8.73	\$218.25
44	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 7XL	each	No Bid		\$8.66	\$8.66	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$8.36	\$8.36	\$7.68	\$7.68	\$8.73	\$8.73
45	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL	each	No Bid		\$6.96	\$6.96	No Bid		\$6.90	\$6.90	\$6.62	\$6.62	\$8.89	\$8.89
46	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUESTRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL	each	No Bid		\$6.96	\$6.96	No Bid		\$6.90	\$6.90	\$6.62	\$6.62	\$8.89	\$8.89
47	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL	each	No Bid		\$7.30	\$7.30	No Bid		\$7.18	\$7.18	\$6.98	\$6.98	\$9.93	\$9.93
48	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL	each	No Bid		\$7.30	\$7.30	No Bid		\$7.36	\$7.36	\$7.34	\$7.34	\$9.93	\$9.93
49	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 5X	each	No Bid		\$7.80	\$7.80	No Bid		\$7.90	\$7.90	\$7.70	\$7.70	\$9.93	\$9.93
50	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 6X	each	No Bid		\$7.80	\$7.80	No Bid		\$8.18	\$8.18	\$8.09	\$8.09	\$10.27	\$10.27

51	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT: BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 7X	each	No Bid	\$11.23	\$11.23	No Bid		\$8.54	\$8.54	\$8.99	\$8.99	\$10.27	\$10.27
52	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, S-XL	each	No Bid	\$6.25	\$6.25	No Bid		\$6.18	\$6.18	\$5.96	\$5.96	\$7.62	\$7.62
53	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 2XL	each	No Bid	\$6.39	\$6.39	No Bid		\$6.18	\$6.18	\$5.96	\$5.96	\$7.62	\$7.62
54	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 3XL	each	No Bid	\$6.76	\$6.76	No Bid		\$6.36	\$6.36	\$6.31	\$6.31	\$8.32	\$8.32
55	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 4XL	each	No Bid	\$6.76	\$6.76	No Bid		\$7.72	\$7.72	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$8.32	\$8.32
56	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 5XL	each	No Bid	\$6.76	\$6.76	No Bid		\$7.72	\$7.72	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$8.32	\$8.32
57	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 6XL	each	No Bid	\$6.76	\$6.76	No Bid		\$7.90	\$7.90	\$7.33	\$7.33	\$8.73	\$8.73
58	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 7XL	each	No Bid	\$7.40	\$7.40	No Bid		\$8.36	\$8.36	\$7.68	\$7.68	\$8.73	\$8.73
59	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE, S - XL	each	No Bid	\$2.89	\$72.25	\$2.50	\$62.50	\$2.74	\$68.50	\$2.32	\$58.00	\$2.57	\$64.25
60	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE, 2XL	each	No Bid	\$4.98	\$124.50	\$4.42	\$110.50	\$3.07	\$76.75	\$3.06	\$76.50	\$2.86	\$96.50
61	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE, 3XL	each	No Bid	\$6.13	\$6.13	\$5.59	\$5.59	\$3.32	\$3.32	\$3.20	\$3.20	\$4.68	\$4.68
62	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, GRAY, S - XL	each	No Bid	\$3.16	\$79.00	\$2.70	\$67.50	\$2.98	\$74.50	\$2.53	\$63.25	\$2.67	\$66.75
63	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE, S (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$165.00	\$10.70	\$267.50	\$10.90	\$272.50	\$7.54	\$188.50	\$9.75	\$243.75
64	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,M (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$165.00	\$10.70	\$267.50	\$10.90	\$272.50	\$7.54	\$188.50	\$9.75	\$243.75
65	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,L (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$165.00	\$10.70	\$267.50	\$10.90	\$272.50	\$7.54	\$188.50	\$9.75	\$243.75
66	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$165.00	\$10.70	\$267.50	\$10.90	\$272.50	\$7.54	\$188.50	\$9.75	\$243.75
67	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,2XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$132.00	\$13.40	\$268.00	\$13.18	\$263.60	\$8.00	\$160.00	\$11.80	\$236.00
68	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,3XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling)	each	No Bid	\$6.60	\$6.60	\$14.64	\$14.64	\$14.36	\$14.36	\$8.41	\$8.41	\$13.45	\$13.45
69	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL	each	No Bid	\$0.89	\$44.50	\$1.00	\$50.00	\$1.07	\$53.50	\$0.88	\$44.00	\$1.2167	\$60.835
70	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 2XL	each	No Bid	\$0.98	\$9.80	\$1.00	\$10.00	\$1.07	\$10.70	\$0.96	\$9.60	\$1.3333	\$13.333
71	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 3XL	each	No Bid	\$1.06	\$26.50	\$1.13	\$28.25	\$1.12	\$28.00	\$1.05	\$26.25	\$1.45	\$36.25
72	INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL	each	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$1.57	\$15.70	\$1.00	\$10.00	No Bid	
73	INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 2XL	each	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$1.57	\$15.70	\$1.11	\$11.10	No Bid	
74	INMATE CLOTHING: GIRL'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL	each	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$1.57	\$15.70	\$0.87	\$8.70	No Bid	
75	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 5-7	each	No Bid	\$0.62	\$62.00	\$0.75	\$75.00	\$0.82	\$82.00	\$0.61	\$61.00	\$0.8017	\$80.17
76	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 8-10	each	No Bid	\$0.79	\$79.00	\$0.92	\$92.00	\$0.90	\$90.00	\$0.71	\$71.00	\$0.9417	\$94.17
77	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 11-12	each	No Bid	\$0.79	\$79.00	\$1.00	\$100.00	\$1.07	\$107.00	\$0.73	\$73.00	\$1.0775	\$107.75
78	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 13-14	each	No Bid	\$0.83	\$0.83	\$1.09	\$1.09	\$1.24	\$1.24	\$0.77	\$0.77	\$1.15	\$1.15
79	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, A CUP	each	No Bid	\$1.83	\$91.50	No Bid		\$2.32	\$116.00	No Bid		No Bid	
80	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, B CUP	each	No Bid	\$1.83	\$91.50	No Bid		\$2.32	\$116.00	No Bid		No Bid	
81	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, C CUP	each	No Bid	\$1.83	\$91.50	No Bid		\$2.49	\$124.50	No Bid		No Bid	
82	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, D CUP	each	No Bid	\$1.83	\$18.30	No Bid		\$2.74	\$27.40	No Bid		No Bid	
83	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, E CUP	each	No Bid	\$1.83	\$1.83	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
84	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; SIZE32-38	each	No Bid	\$1.59	\$79.50	\$2.00	\$100.00	\$2.40	\$120.00	\$1.58	\$79.00	\$2.1833	\$109.165
85	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; SIZE40-48	each	No Bid	\$1.74	\$1.74	\$2.17	\$2.17	\$2.40	\$2.40	\$1.73	\$1.73	\$2.5625	\$2.5625
86	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - GRAY; SIZE 50-54	each	No Bid	\$1.74	\$1.74	\$2.40	\$2.40	\$2.4083	\$2.40	\$1.94	\$1.94	\$2.9417	\$2.9417
87	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - WHITE; SIZE32-38	each	No Bid	\$1.50	\$75.00	\$1.84	\$92.00	\$2.24	\$112.00	\$1.49	\$74.50	\$1.965	\$98.25
88	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE; SIZE40-48	each	No Bid	\$1.67	\$1.67	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$2.24	\$2.24	\$1.83	\$1.83	\$2.3433	\$2.3433
89	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE; SIZE50-54	each	No Bid	\$1.67	\$1.67	\$2.17	\$2.17	\$2.24	\$2.24	\$2.03	\$2.03	\$2.665	\$2.665
90	INMATE CLOTHING: ATHLETIC SHORTS; ATHLETIC, BLACK, XS-XL	each	No Bid	\$5.39	\$5.39	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.90	\$7.90	\$5.25	\$5.25	\$6.33	\$6.33
91	INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS:CREW, CALF LENGTH STYLE	each	No Bid	\$0.44	\$440.00	\$0.59	\$590.00	\$0.57	\$570.00	\$0.48	\$480.00	\$0.5433	\$543.30
92	INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS: SPORT, WHITE	each	No Bid	\$0.41	\$410.00	\$0.59	\$590.00	\$0.57	\$570.00	\$0.58	\$580.00	\$0.5633	\$563.30
93	INMATE CLOTHING: CAPS, BASEBALL: 3/4 OPEN MESH	each	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$4.99	\$499.00	\$3.14	\$314.00	\$3.52	\$352.00
94	INMATE CLOTHING: CANVAS TENNIS SHOES: LOW TOP, VELCRO, HEAVY DUTY, BLACK OR WHITE	each	No Bid	\$6.88	\$344.00	\$8.50	\$425.00	\$8.54	\$427.00	\$6.87	\$343.50	\$7.96	\$398.00
95	INMATE CLOTHING: CANVAS STEP-IN SHOES: LOW TOP, HEAVY DUTY, WHITE	each	No Bid	\$4.80	\$96.00	No Bid		\$6.72	\$134.40	\$7.48	\$149.60	\$7.40	\$148.00
96	INMATE CLOTHING: LEATHER TENNIS SHOES, BLACK	each	No Bid	\$16.99	\$3,398.00	\$22.00	\$4,400.00	\$20.90	\$4,180.00	\$23.69	\$4,738.00	\$18.35	\$3,670.00
97	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA DECK SHOE, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE S - L	each	No Bid	\$3.55	\$2,485.00	\$8.25	\$5,775.00	\$5.90	\$4,130.00	\$4.59	\$3,213.00	\$6.82	\$4,774.00
98	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA DECK SHOE, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE XL	each	No Bid	\$3.55	\$1,775.00	\$8.25	\$4,125.00	\$5.90	\$2,950.00	\$4.59	\$2,295.00	\$6.82	\$3,410.00
99	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA DECK SHOE, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 2XL	each	No Bid	\$3.55	\$710.00	\$8.25	\$1,650.00	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	\$4.59	\$918.00	\$6.82	\$1,364.00
100	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA DECK SHOE, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 3XL	each	No Bid	\$3.55	\$355.00	\$8.25	\$825.00	\$5.90	\$590.00	\$4.59	\$459.00	\$6.82	\$682.00
101	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES- EVA SLIDES, ORANGE, S-XL	each	No Bid	\$2.99	\$299.00	\$5.60	\$560.00	\$5.90	\$590.00	\$2.98	\$298.00	\$3.33	\$333.00
102	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: INDIGENT HYGIENE KIT	each	No Bid	\$0.66	\$3,300.00	\$0.72	\$3,600.00	\$0.84	\$4,200.00	\$1.09	\$5,450.00	\$0.65	\$3,250.00
103	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: COMB: 5" PLASTIC, NON BREAKABLE	each	No Bid	\$0.025	\$2.50	\$0.025	\$2.50	\$0.032	\$3.20	\$0.04	\$4.00	\$0.0214	\$2.14
104	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: PALM BRUSH, PLIABLE PLASTIC, FLEXIBLE	each	No Bid	\$0.26	\$260.00	\$0.67	\$670.00	\$0.346	\$346.00	\$0.70	\$700.00	\$0.2399	\$239.90
105	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - Maximum Security .5 oz	each	No Bid	\$0.33	\$33.00	\$0.31	\$31.00	\$0.38	\$38.00	\$0.38	\$38.00	\$0.3238	\$32.38
106	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - .5 OZ. DEGREE	each	No Bid	\$1.04	\$3,640.00	\$1.24	\$4,340.00	\$1.47	\$5,145.00	\$1.83	\$6,405.00	\$1.2222	\$4,277.70
107	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SOAP: WRAPPED, ANTIBACTERIAL DEODERANT SOAP .5 OZ	each	No Bid	\$0.036	\$180.00	\$0.044	\$220.00	\$0.0489	\$244.50	\$0.10	\$500.00	\$0.055	\$275.00
108	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: LIQUID TWO-IN-ONE SHAMPOO AND CONDITIONER, GALLON	each	No Bid	\$11.59	\$579.50	\$8.04	\$402.00	\$15.725	\$786.25	\$10.63	\$531.50	\$14.3675	\$718.375
109	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DIAL ALL-IN-ONE SHAMPOO, GALLON	each	No Bid	\$19.99	\$1,999.00	No Bid		\$15.725	\$1,572.50	\$24.90	\$2,490.00	\$23.82	\$2,382.00

110	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TOOTHPASTE: CREST .85 OZ	each	No Bid		\$0.35	\$875.00	\$0.36	\$900.00	\$0.187	\$467.50	\$0.45	\$1,125.00	\$0.9494	\$2,373.50
111	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHORTY TOOTHBRUSHES, WRAPPED	each	No Bid		\$0.04	\$200.00	\$0.045	\$225.00	\$0.048	\$240.00	\$0.05	\$250.00	\$0.0502	\$251.00
112	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SANITARY NAPKINS: REGULAR, BELTLESS, ADHESIVE WITH WINGS	each	\$0.11	\$55.00	\$0.05	\$25.00	\$0.08	\$40.00	\$0.084	\$42.00	No Bid		\$0.0705	\$35.25
113	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SANITARY NAPKINS: SUPER, BELTLESS, ADHESIVE WITH WINGS	each	\$0.12	\$60.00	\$0.094	\$47.00	No Bid		\$0.11	\$55.00	No Bid		\$0.1432	\$71.60
114	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: REGULAR, WRAPPED	each	\$0.25	\$125.00	\$0.11	\$55.00	\$0.14	\$70.00	\$0.1858	\$92.90	No Bid		\$0.128	\$64.00
115	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: SUPER, WRAPPED	each	\$0.15	\$75.00	\$0.12	\$60.00	No Bid		\$0.1978	\$98.90	No Bid		\$0.1344	\$67.20
116	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: NET LAUNDRY BAG: 24" X 36"	each	No Bid		\$2.59	\$1,295.00	\$4.17	\$2,085.00	\$2.49	\$1,245.00	\$3.29	\$1,645.00	\$2.92	\$1,460.00
117	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS:GREEN LAUNDRY BAG, 30" X 40", MED WEIGHT, DRAW CORD, CLOTH ID TAG	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$5.50	\$275.00	\$5.83	\$291.50	\$5.49	\$274.50	\$3.8783	\$193.915
118	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: ID BANDS: CLINCHER IV, PHOTO WHITE, METAL FASTENER	each	No Bid		\$0.38	\$1,140.00	\$0.61	\$1,830.00	\$0.54	\$1,620.00	No Bid		\$0.4519	\$1,355.70
119	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: LAUNDRY LOOP WITH SOCK ATTACHMENT	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$3.51	\$1,755.00	\$3.39	\$1,695.00	\$4.89	\$2,445.00
120	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SPIT SOCK HOOD	each	No Bid		\$1.18	\$118.00	\$10.00	\$1,000.00	\$2.49	\$249.00	\$5.23	\$523.00	\$2.14	\$214.00
121	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: CHICAGO MODEL A600 72" RESTRAINT CHAIN	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$24.90	\$1,245.00	\$20.76	\$1,038.00	\$30.13	\$1,506.50
122	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: CHICAGO MODEL 2200 LEG IRONS	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$41.90	\$2,095.00	\$41.50	\$2,075.00	\$51.51	\$2,575.50
123	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: CHICAGO MODEL 1000 NICKEL FINISH HANDCUFFS	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$27.90	\$1,395.00	\$26.30	\$1,315.00	\$35.75	\$1,787.50
124	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: HUMANE RESTRAINT MODEL NCS-900 NYLON CONTROL STRAP (SQUAD CAR RESTRAINT)	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$25.90	\$1,295.00	\$33.06	\$1,653.00	\$50.90	\$2,545.00
125	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: MICROFIBER CLEANING TOWEL 35g, 16X16	each	\$0.55	\$550.00	No Bid		No Bid		\$1.16	\$1,160.00	\$0.70	\$700.00	\$0.8384	\$838.40
126	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: LOCKING SAFETY PAPER SPOON, WHITE	each	No Bid		\$0.06	\$30.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$0.0469	\$23.45
128	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: THUMB-HANDLE MINI SPORK ORANGE	each	No Bid		\$0.11	\$55.00	No Bid		\$0.18	\$90.00	No Bid		\$0.1682	\$84.10
129	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS:POLYPROPYLENE SPORK ORANGE	each	No Bid		\$0.13	\$65.00	\$0.18	\$90.00	\$0.12975	\$65.00	No Bid		\$0.1429	\$71.45
130	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Bedding and Towels Not Listed Herein		No Bid		20.0%				10.0%		20.0%		18.0%	
131	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Inmate Clothing Not Listed Herein		No Bid		20.0%				10.0%		20.0%		18.0%	
132	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Personal Hygiene Products Not Listed Herein				20.0%				10.0%		10.0%			

Working Document Until Final Award